
Preliminary Tabulation

IFB 16-029/YS, Term Contract for Pick Ups, Vans, & Utility Vehicles for Jefferson County

Bid Opened:  Tuesday, November 8, 2016

Item Description
Caldwell Country Chevrolet Cowboy Motor Co.

Freedom Chevrolet/Love Field 

CDJR               
Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Lake County Chevrolet                Sabine River Ford Silsbee Ford

1A

Pick Up, 1/2 Ton, 

Regular Cab, 2-

Wheel Drive

$20,976.00                                                                         
Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Regular 

Cab 4X2 LWB CC15903                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain (n/c)

$21,286.00                                                                       
Ram, 2017 1500 Tradesman R/C 

4X2                                                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain

$20,886.00                                                                       
Ram,  1500 Reg Cab, Tradesman                                                        

Delivery ARO 90-120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain

$20,402.68                                                                         
Chevrolet, CC15903                        

Delivery ARO 120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$21,913.00                                                                       
Chevrolet, Silverado CC15903                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$24,250.00 (driveout)                                                                      
2017 Ford, F-150 XL Reg Cab 8' 

Bed                                       

3yr/36,000 miles basic, 

5yr/60,000 miles powertrain, 

5yr/60,000 miles roadside 

assistance, 5yr/unlimited 

mileage corrosion perforation 

$21,388.00                                                                     
Ford, 2017 F-150 4X2 R/C                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles 

powertrain 

1B

Pick Up, 1/2 Ton, 

Extended Cab, 2-

Wheel Drive

$21,840.00                                                                       
Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Double Cab 

SWB CC15753                                       

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain (n/c)

$21,352.00                                                                       
Ram, 2017 1500 Tradesman Q/C 

4X2                                                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain

$20,950.00                                                                       
Ram,  1500 Ext Cab, Tradesman                                                        

Delivery ARO 90-120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain

$23,187.05                                                                        
Chevrolet, CC15753                        

Delivery ARO 120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$22,973.00                                                                       
Chevrolet, Silverado CC15753                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$27,000.00 (driveout)                                                              
2017 Ford, F-150 XL Super Cab 

6.5' Bed                                       

3yr/36,000 miles basic, 

5yr/60,000 miles powertrain, 

5yr/60,000 miles roadside 

assistance, 5yr/unlimited 

mileage corrosion perforation 

$22,591.00                                                                     
Ford, 2017 F-150 4X2 S/C                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles 

powertrain 

1C

Pick Up, 1/2 Ton, 

Crew Cab, 2-

Wheel Drive

$24,840.00                                                                    
Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Crew Cab 

4X2 SWB CC15543                         

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain (n/c)

$25,138.00                                                                       
Ram, 2017 1500 Tradesman C/C 

4X2                                                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain

$25,038.00                                                                       
Ram,  1500 Crew Cab, Tradesman                                                        

Delivery ARO 90-120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain

$26,997.28                                                                        
Chevrolet, CC15543 , 1/2 Ton 

Crew Cab Short Box                      

Delivery ARO 120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$25,026.00                                                                      
Chevrolet, Silverado CC15543                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$29,000                                                               
2017 Ford, F-150 XL Super Cab 

5.5' Bed                                       

3yr/36,000 miles basic, 

5yr/60,000 miles powertrain, 

5yr/60,000 miles roadside 

assistance, 5yr/unlimited 

mileage corrosion perforation 

$25,233.00                                                                     
Ford, 2017 F-150 4X2 C/C                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles 

powertrain 

2A
Full Size Van, 15-

Passenger, 

Extended, 2-

Wheel Drive

$27,489.00                                                                   
Chevrolet, Express 3500 Extended 

Passenger Van CG33706                                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain (n/c)

NO BID

$28,620.00                                                                       
Chevrolet Ext Wheel Base 3500 Exp 

Pass Van, LS                                                        

Delivery ARO 120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain

$28,285.30                                                                       
Chevrolet, CG33706 Express 15 

Pass Ext                                    

Delivery ARO 120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$28,217.00                                                                   
Chevrolet, Express 3500 

Passenger CG33706                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$32,000.00                                                              
2017 Ford, Transit 350 (X2Z), 15-

passenger 60/40 Door                                    

3yr/36,000 miles basic, 

5yr/60,000 miles powertrain, 

5yr/60,000 miles roadside 

assistance, 5yr/unlimited 

mileage corrosion perforation 

$29,251.00                                                                     
Ford, 2017 Transit 350 Low Roof 

Wagon                                       

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles 

powertrain 

3A
Utility Vehicle, 2-

Wheel Drive, 4-

Cylinder, 2.4L 

Engine

$20,290.00                                                                     
Chevrolet, Equinox LS FWD 1LF26                                       

Delivery ARO 90 days                                            

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 

5yr/100,000 miles powertrain

$19,053.00                                                                       
Jeep, 2017 Renegade Sport 4X2                                                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain

NO BID

$20,576.79                                                                       
Chevrolet, Equinox LS Wheel 

Base 112.50 ILF26                     

Delivery ARO 120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain                             

compact spare only (no full size 

spare available)

$20,711.00                                                                      
Chevrolet, Equinox ILF26                       

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

$20,500.00                                                              
2017 Ford, Escape S FWD                                    

3yr/36,000 miles basic, 

5yr/60,000 miles powertrain, 

5yr/60,000 miles roadside 

assistance, 5yr/unlimited 

mileage corrosion perforation 

$18,687.00                                                                     
Ford, 2017 Escape S FWD                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                                          

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles 

powertrain 

3B

Utility Vehicle, 

AWD, 4-Cylinder, 

2.4L Engine

$21,880.00                                                                       
Chevrolet, Equinox LS AWD 1LG26                                       

Delivery ARO 90 days                                            

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper

$21,113.00                                                                       
Jeep, 2017 Renegade Sport 4X4                                                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain

NO BID

$22,186.79                                                                      
Chevrolet, ILG26 AWD LS Equinox                                    

Delivery ARO 120 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain                          

compact spare (no full size 

available)

$22,362.00                                                                     
Chevrolet, Equinox ILG26                       

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 

powertrain 

NO BID

$21,296.00                                                                     
Ford, 2017 Escape SE 4WD                        

Delivery ARO 90 days                           

3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 

bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles 

powertrain 



Caldwell Country Chevrolet                  800 

Highway 21 E                                  Caldwell 

TX  77836                                 ph:  979-564-

6116                                       fx:  979-567-

0853                                     attn:  Averyt 

Knapp                                 

aknapp@caldwellcountry.com

Cowboy Motor Co.                                 

1305 US Highway 96 Bypass                                

Silsbee TX  77656                                          

ph:  409-895-3858/409-895-3800           

fx:  409-895-3884                                    

attn:  Jarrod Runnels              

fleetsales@outlook.com

Freedom Chevrolet/Love Field CDJR                                                   

6320 Denton Drive                                           

Dallas TX  75235                                                

ph:  972-707-9438/205-965-1800                                             

fx:  214-350-0085                                             

attn:  Tim Middlebrooks                                

tmiddlebrooks@freedomfleetsales.com

Gunn Chevrolet LTD.                    

16550 IH35N                                  

Selma TX  78154                                                 

ph:  210-599-500 ext 2059                                    

fx:  210-599-4251                                        

attn:  Danny Mireles                                   

dmireles@gunnauto.com

Lake County Chevrolet                2152 

N. Wheeler Street               Jasper TX  

75951                             ph:  409-659-

1555/409-895-3860                           

fx:  409-895-3884                                     

attn:  Rick Brown                                           

Rbrown.SilsbeeFleet@gmail.com

Sabine River Ford                                 

1601 Green Avenue                                       

Orange TX  77630                                                   

ph:  409-883-3581                                      

fx:  409-883-2754                                               

attn:  Lee Reeves                                             

LeeReeves@SabineRiverFord.com

Silsbee Ford                                 1211 

US Highway 96N                        Silsbee 

TX  77656                              ph:  409-

895-3800 ext 261                           fx:  

409-895-3884                          attn:  

Robert C. Swan                                

jbelcher.silsbeefleet@gmail.com

Jefferson County makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read aloud at the public 

opening.  The County has not checked the bids for errors, or made any determinations that the solicitations meet all requirements.  In 

the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and the original hard-copy document, the original hard copy shall 

prevail.


