
Final Tabulation
Bid Opening Date:  Tuesday, March 14, 2017

IFB 17-006/YS

Term Contract for Insecticides, Herbicides, Spray Adjuvants, and Adulticides for Jefferson County Mosquito Control District

Item 

Est. Qty. 

(gal) Description Brand

MSDS 

labels 

attached

Price per 

Gallon Total Price Brand

MSDS 

labels 

attached

Price per 

Gallon Total Price Brand

MSDS 

labels 

attached

Price per 

Gallon Total Price Brand

MSDS 

labels 

attached

Price per 

Gallon Total Price Brand

MSDS 

labels 

attached

Price per 

Gallon Total Price Brand

MSDS 

labels 

attached

Price per 

Gallon Total Price Brand

MSDS 

labels 

attached

Price per 

Gallon Total Price Brand

MSDS 

labels 

attached

Price per 

Gallon Total Price

1 700 MSMA Herbicide - 2.5 

gal NO BID NO BID Target 6 yes 25.85 $18,095.00 Drexel yes 25.45 $17,815.00

MSMA 6 

Plus yes 27.40 $19,180.00 Drexel yes 35.06 $24,542.00

Target 6 

Plus yes 24.48 $17,136.00 NO BID

2 700
Tordon 101 Herbicide or 

equivalent - 2.5 gal 

container NO BID NO BID Glasham yes 41.52 $29,064.00 Dow yes 29.99 $20,993.00 Picloram-D yes 29.70 $20,790.00

Dow 

Tordon RUT          

1 qt/ea yes 158.50 $110,950.00

Tordon 

101 yes 43.94 $30,758.00 NO BID

3 700
Roundup Herbicide or 

equivalent - 2.5 gal 

container NO BID NO BID

Mad Dog 

Plus yes 10.95 $7,665.00 Invictis yes 17.05 $11,935.00

Glyphosate 

4+ yes 13.00 $9,100.00

Lesco 

Prosecutor 

Pro yes 21.26 $14,882.00

Ranger 

Pro yes 10.24 $7,168.00

Ranger 

Pro yes 13.00

$32.50/jug 

($9,100.00)

4 100
Rodeo Herbicide or 

equivalent - 2.5 gal 

container NO BID NO BID

Aqua 

Neat yes 14.95 $1,495.00 NO BID

Glyphosate 

5.4 yes 16.50 $1,650.00

Nufarm 

Aquaneat yes 25.00 $2,500.00

Roundup 

Custom yes 17.62 $1,762.00 NO BID

5 100
Nalco Trol II or 

equivalent - 2.5 gal (or 

smaller) container NO BID NO BID

Poly 

Control yes

8.00/qt* 

(32.00/gal) $3,200.00 NO BID NO BID

Lesco 

Hawkeye 

64oz/ea yes 50.50 $4,850.00 Reign LC yes 124.00 $12,400.00 NO BID

6 400
Aqua-King Surfactant or 

equivalent - 2.5 gal (or 

smaller ) container NO BID NO BID Spreader 90 yes 12.99 $5,196.00 NO BID NO BID

Lesco 

Spreader 

Sticker yes 21.60 $8,640.00 Target Pro yes 13.95 $5,580.00 NO BID

7 20,000
Malathion Insecticide - 

bulk shipment only yes 48.70 $974,000.00 NO BID NO BID FMC yes 36.99

 *********      

see note 

below                        

$739,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID Fyfanon yes 48.70 $974,000.00

8 250
Scourge Insecticide - 5 

gal containers

Scourge 18-

54 yes 495.47 $123,867.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9 600 Envion 30/30 Insecticide - 

2.5 gal containers

Aqua Perm-

X UL 30-30 yes 99.98 $59,988.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Envion      

30-30 yes 90.00 $54,000.00

Kontrol 

30/30 yes 55.49 $33,294.00

10 1,375
Duet Adulticide - 275 gal 

steel containers NO BID Duet yes 138.60 $190,575.00 NO BID Clarke yes 34.99 $48,111.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

* 4 quarts per gallon, $8.00 x 4 = $32.00

ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Moquito Control Products, Inc. Crop Production Services, Inc. Original Food Co., LLC Pro Pest and Lawn Store SiteOne Landscape Supply Target Specialty Products Univar USA

550 Aero Lane 675 Sidwell Court 13622 East Hardy Road 122 Azinger Drive 4726 East Texas Suite 150 1385 East 36th Street 1225 North Post Oak Road PO Box 20301

Sanford FL  32771 St Charles IL  60174 Houston TX  77039 Laredo TX  78045 Bossier City LA  71111 Cleveland OH  44114 Houston TX  77055 Beaumont TX  77720

attn:  Kathy Russell attn:  Doug Carroll attn:  AJ Thibodeaux attn:  Jose H. Reyes attn:  Royal M. Tyler, Jr. attn:  Molly M. Vorous attn:  Mike Nichols attn:  John West

bids@myadapco.com customercare@clarke.com aubrey.thibodeaux@cpsagu.com jose.reyes@getoriginalfoods.com propestandlawn@gmail.com bids@SiteOne.com mike.nichols@target-specialty.com John.West@univar.com

ph:  407-328-6519 ph:  817-600-5353 ph:  713-705-9800 ph:  956-949-0726 ph:  318-584-7217 ph:  800-321-5325 x2550 ph:  713-249-2075 ph:  713-826-0637

fx:  866-330-9888 fx:  630-443-3070 fx:  281-987-8969 fx:  956-608-3441 alt ph:  318-469-9963 fx:  248-581-1433 fx:  713-682-4374

******* Per Kevin Sexton:  Regarding Item #7 - Malathion lowest bid indicates Original Food Company, LLC.  This bidder is ineligible because the product they use is rated for Agriculture Use Only.  Adapco and Univar both submitted a bid for the same price on Malathion - rated for Mosquito Use Only.

Item #7 awarded by drawing of lots by County Judge Jeff Branick.

SiteOne Landscape Supply Target Specialty Products Univar USA

**ADAPCO will provide technical support, droplet 

testing, calibrations if required

Clarke Moquito Control Products, Inc. Crop Productions Services, Inc. Original Food Co., LLC Pro Pest and Lawn StoreADAPCO, LLC
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