Preliminary Tabulation
IFB 17-044/YS, Term Contract for Pick Ups, Vans, & Utility Vehicles for Jefferson County
Bid Opened: Tuesday, December 20, 2017

Item |Description Caldwell Country Chevrolet Cowboy Motor Co. Grapevine DCJ, LLC JK Chevrolet Lake County Chevrolet Mid County CDJR Reliable Chevrolet Sabine River Ford Silsbee Ford
$21,775.00 $19,392.00 $20,042.00 $22,973.59 $20,427.00 $19,986.00 $20,528.00 $23,683.00/unit ($24,000.00]$22,222.00
Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Regular Cab JRam, 2018 1500 Regular Cab R/C JRam, 1500 DS1L62 Chevrolet, Silverado 1500, Chevrolet, 2018 Silverado 1500 JRam, 1500 Regular Cab Chevrolet, Regular Cab Silverado with license, registration, & |Ford, 2018 FIC
4X2 LWB CC15903 (V8) 4X2 Delivery ARO 75 days (earliest) #15903 2wd LWB Reg Cab RW CC15903 Delivery ARO 60-75 days 1500 CC15903 fees) Delivery ARO 90 days
. Delivery ARO 120 days (75 days Delivery ARO 120 days 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, |Delivery ARO 6-8 weeks Delivery ARO 90 days 3yr/36,000 miles full manufacturer |Delivery ARO 80-95 days 2018 Ford, F-150 XL Reg Cab 8' Bed 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to
Pick Up, 1/2 earliest) 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 5yr/100,000 miles limited powertrain  |3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to warranty, 5yr/60,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to Vs, 141" v:/heelbase & ” Ibumper, 5yr/60,000 miles
1A Ton, Regular 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, |bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain warranty (engine, bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles Deiivery ARO 180 days powertrain
Cab, 2-Wheel 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain powertrain pov(vjer't[;aln, Efytr/G0,000 miles powertrain transmission, drivetrain) fowefrtralr;lso deductible & 36 m0/36,000 miles basic, 60
Drive roac side assistance ransterravle mo/60,000 miles powertrain, 60
mo/unlimited corrosion perforation,
60 mo/60,000 miles roadside
assistance
$21,940.00 $20,315.00 $21,401.00 $25,962.03 $20,327.00 $21,715.00 $20,352.00 $24,626.00/unit ($25,000.001$23,123.00
Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Double Cab JRam, 2018 1500 Quad Cab Q/C Ram, 1500 DS1L41 Chevrolet, Silverado 1500, Chevrolet, 2018 Silverado 1500 JRam, 1500 Quad Cab Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Double  |with license, registration, & |Ford, 2018 F-150 S/CXIC
SWB CC15753 (V8) AX2 Delivery ARO 75 days (earliest) #15753 2wd Dbl Cab CC15753 Delivery  [Delivery ARO 60-75 days Cab - CC15753 fees) Delivery ARO 90 days
i Delivery ARO 120 days (75 days Delivery ARO 120 days 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, |Delivery ARO 1 day ARO 90 days 3yr/36,000 miles full manufacturer |Delivery ARO 80-95 days 2018 Ford, F-150 XL Super Cab 6.5' 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to
Pick Up, 1/2 earliest) 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 5yr/100,000 miles limited powertrain |3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to \warranty, 5yr/60,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to Bed, V8 12‘5” wheelbafe ’ bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles
1B Ton, Extended|3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, |bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain (engine, transmission, & Jbumper, 5yr/100,000 miles DeIi;/eryl ARO 180 days powertrain
Cab, 2-Wheel |5yr/100,000 miles powertrain powertrain pom(/je!‘(tjraln, ?\;r/G0,000 miles powertrain drivetrain) i)owefrtralr;l$0 deductible & 36 mo/36,000 miles basic, 60
Drive roadside assistance ransterrable mo/60,000 miles powertrain, 60
mo/unlimited corrosion perforation,
60 mo/60,000 miles roadside
assistance
$23,885.00 $24,200.00 $23,349.00 $26,082.56 $23,022.00 $24,503.00 $23,226.00 $25,867.00/unit ($26,250.00]$27,427.00
Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Crew Cab  JRam, 2018 1500 Crew Cab 4X2 Ram, 1500 DS1L91, 149" wheelbase, |Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Chevrolet, 2018 Silverado Ram, 1500 Crew Cab Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Crew Cab with license, registration, & |Ford, 2018 F150 Crew 4x2 WIE
CC15543 Delivery ARO 120 days 6'4" bed length Delivery ARO 8-12 weeks CC15543 Delivery ARO 60-75 days - CC15543 fees) Delivery ARO 90 days
Pick Up, 1/2 Dellyery ARO 120 days (75 days 3yr/36,000 miles bumpe_r to Delivery ARO 75 days (earliest) 3yr/36,000 miles bumpe.r to Delivery ARO 90 days 3yr/36,000 miles full ma.nufacturer Delivery ARO _80-95 days 2018 Ford, F-150 XL Super Crew 5.5' 3yr/36,000 miles bump_er to
T C earliest) bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, |bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to warranty, 5yr/60,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to Bed, V8, 145" wheelbase bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles
1C on, Lrew 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, |powertrain 5yr/100,000 miles limited powertrain |powertrain, 5yr/60,000 mile bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain warranty (engine, bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles Deli:/er ,ARO 180 davs powertrain
Cab, 2-Wheel 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain roadside assistance powertrain transmission, & drivetrain) powertrain $0 deductible & v R v .
Drive cransferrabl 36 mo/36,000 miles basic, 60
v ansterrable mo/60,000 miles powertrain, 60
mo/unlimited corrosion perforation,
60 mo/60,000 miles roadside
assistance
$27,622.00 $26,958.00 $28,250.27 $25,270.00 $27,989.00 $25,340.00 $29,010.00/unit ($29,400.001$27,772.00
Ram, 2018 1500 Crew Cab 4X4 Ram, 1500 DS6L91, 149" wheelbase, ]Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Chevrolet, 2018 Silverado 1500 JRam, 1500 Crew Cab 4WD Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Crew Cab Jwith license, registration, & Ford, 2018 F-150 Crew 4x4 WIE
Delivery ARO 120 days 6'4" bed Delivery ARO 8-12 weeks CC15543 4x4 Delivery ARO 60-75 days Awhdr CK15543 fees) Delivery ARO 90 days
Pick Up 12 3yr/36,000 miles bumpeﬁ to Delivery ARO 75 days (earliest) 3yr/36,000 miles bumpér to Delivery ARO ?O days 3yr/36,000 miles full malnufa‘ctAurer Delivery ARO ?0—95 days 2018 Ford, F-150 XL Super Crew 4xd 3yr/36,000 miles bum[fer to
4 bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, [bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to warranty, 5yr/60,000 miles limited |3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 5.5' Bed, V8, 145" wheelbase bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles
1D Ton, Crew powertrain 5yr/100,000 miles limited powertrain |powertrain, 5yr/36,000 miles bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain warranty (engine, bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles D.eliver ,ARé 180 Days powertrain
Cab, 4-Wheel 525,990-00 roadside assistance powertrain transmission, & drivetrain) powertrain $0 deductible & Y R v .
4 . 36 mo/36,000 miles basic, 60
Drive Chevrolet, Silverado 1500 Crew Cab transferrable

4X4 CK15543 Delivery
ARO 120 days (75 days earliest)
3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper,
5yr/100,000 miles powertrain

mo/60,000 miles powertrain, 60
mo/unlimited corrosion perforation,
60 mo/60,000 miles roadside
assistance




$27,590.00 $28,212.80 $27,313.00 $26,937.00 $34,417.00/unit ($34,800.00]$26,632.00
Chevrolet, Express 3500 Extended Chevrolet, Express 3500 Extended |Chevrolet, 2018 3500 Express Ext Chevrolet, Express 3500 15 pass van Jwith license, registration, & Ford, 2018 Transit Van X2Z
Passenger Van CG33706 passenger van Passenger CG33706 CG33706 fees) Delivery ARO 90 days
Delivery ARO .120 days (75 earliest) Delivery ARO ?-10 weeks Delivery ARO ?O days Delivery ARO ?S-IOO days 2018 Ford, Transit 350 HD Wagon 3yr/36,000 miles bumprer to
Full Size Van, 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to (15 passenger, 10,360 GVWR, 148" bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles
15-Passenger, 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles \WB, 3.7L V6 gas, high roof) powertrain
2A NO BID NO BID powertrain, 5yr/60,000 mile powertrain NO BID powertrain $0 deductible & ! !
Extended, 2- roadside assistance transferrable Delivery ARO 189 days :
Wheel Drive 36 mo/36,009 miles basic, _60
mo/60,000 miles powertrain, 60
mo/unlimited corrosion perforation,
60 mo/60,000 miles roadside
assistance
$20,400.00 $20,761.00 $22,040.53 $19,819.00 $20,987.00 $19,999.00 $18,395.00
Jeep, 2018 Cherokee 4X2 Jeep, Compass Sport Chevrolet, Equinox LS Chevrolet, 2018 Equinox FWD Jeep Cherokee Chevrolet, Equinox LS FWD IXP26 $19,638.00/unit (520,000 Ford, 2018 Escape UOF
Delivery ARO 120 days Delivery ARO 75 days (earliest) Delivery ARO 1-2 days IXP26 Delivery ARO 60-75 days Delivery ARO 80-95 days with licence, registration, & Delivery ARO 90 days
UtiIity 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, |3yr/36,000 miles bumper to Delivery ARO 90 days 3yr/36,000 miles full manufacturer |3yr/36,000 miles bumper to fees) 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to
. bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 5yr/100,000 miles limited powertrain |bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to warranty, 5yr/60,000 mile bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles
Vehicle, 2- powertrain powertrain, 5yr/60,000 mile bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain warranty (engine, powertrain $0 deductible & 2018 Ford Escape S FWD (2.5L powertrain
3A | Wheel Drive, NO BID roadside assistance powertrain transmission, & drivetrain) transferrable engine, 2-wheel drive)
4—Cy|inder, Delivery ARO 189 days .
. 36 mo/36,000 mile basic warranty,
2.41 Engine 60 mo/60,000 mile powertrain, 60
mo/unlimited corrosion perforation,
60 mo/60,000 mile roadside
assistance
$22,358.00 $22,019.00 $23,096.78 $21,396.00 $21,609.00 $22,332.00/unit ($22,700  ]$20,920.00
Jeep, 2018 Cherokee 4X4 Jeep, Compass Sport 4x4 Chevrolet, Equinox LS AWD Chevrolet, 2018 Equinox 4x4 Chevrolet, Equinox LS AWD IXX26  with license, registration, & Ford, 2018 Escape 4x4 U9G
Delivery ARO 120 days Delivery ARO 75 days (earliest) Delivery ARO 8-10 weeks IXX26 Delivery ARO 85-100 days fees) Delivery ARO 90 days
- 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, |3yr/36,000 miles bumper to Delivery ARO 90 days 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to 2018 Ford, Escape SE AWD (151 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to
Utl|lty bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 5yr/100,000 miles limited powertrain |bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles 3yr/36,000 miles bumper to bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles EcoBoost llEngine SE AWD is the bumper, 5yr/60,000 miles
i powertrain powertrain, 5yr/60,000 mile bumper, 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain $0 deductible & ! powertrain
3B Virjcl:ilﬁ’ng\::u NO BID roadside assistance powertrain NO BID transferrable E;iitrjr:;\élj\;;l :::f Escape)
’
2.4L Engine 36 mo/36,000 miles basic, 60
mo/60,000 miles powertrain, 60
mo/unlimited corrosion perforation,
60 mo/60,000 miles roadside
assistance

Jefferson County makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read aloud at the
public opening. The County has not checked the bids for errors, or made any determinations that the solicitations meet all
requirements. In the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and the original hard-copy document, the

original hard copy shall prevail.

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
800 Highway 21 E
Caldwell TX 77836

ph: 979-564-6116

fx: 979-567-0853

attn: Averyt Knapp

aknapp@caldwellcountry.com

Cowboy Motor Co.

1305 US Highway 96 Bypass
Silsbee TX 77656

ph: 409-895-3858/409-895-3800
fx: 409-895-3884

attn: Jarrod Runnels

fleetsales@outlook.com

Grapevine DCJ, LLC

2601 William D. Tate Avenue
Gravpevine TX 76051

ph: 817-410-7541

fx: 817-410-7502

attn: Dennis Thomas

dthomas@grapevinedcj.com

JK Chevrolet

1451 Highway 69 North
Nederland TX 77627
ph: 409-726-8930

fx: 409-726-8944
attn: Sharon Taylor

staylor@jkchevrolet.com

Lake County Chevrolet
2152 N. Wheeler Street
Jasper TX 75951

ph: 800-464-2749
attn: Ken Durbin

Kdurbin.Cowboyfleet@gmail.com

Mid County CDJR

18181 Memorial Boulevard

Port Arthur TX 77640

ph: 409-420-1546 or 409-656-8453
fx: 409-237-5586

attn: Rick Danna
rdanna@midcountycdjr.com

ble Chevrolet

800 North Central Expressway
Richardson TX 75080

ph: 972-952-1561

fx: 972-952-8172

attn: Doug Adams

dadams@reliablechevrolet.com

Sabine River Ford
1601 Green Avenue
Orange TX 77630
ph: 409-883-3581
fx: 409-883-2754
attn: Lee Reeves

LeeReeves@SabineRiverFord.com

Silsbee Ford

1211 US Highway 96N
Silsbee TX 77656

ph: 409-895-3800 ext 261
fx: 409-895-3884

attn: Robert C. Swan

Kdurbin.Cowboyfleet@gmail.com




