
Final Bid Tabulation

IFB 17-039/YS, Term Contract for Herbicides for Jack Brooks Regional Airport

Bid Opening Tuesday, December 19, 2017

Item Description

Container 

Size Brand Bid

MSDS 

Labels 

Attached

Price per 

Container Brand Bid

MSDS 

Labels 

Attached

Price per 

Container

1A POLARIS or equivalent 2.5 gal Polaris yes 129.50 Arsenal Herbicide yes 132.50

1B POLARIS or equivalent 5 gal cube Polaris yes 259.00 Arsenal Herbicide yes 265.00

2 Tordon 101 or equivalent 2.5 gal  NO BID NO BID NO BID yes 98.75

3A Roundup or equivalent 2.5 gal Mad Dog Herbicide yes 31.15 Ranger Pro yes 27.50

3B Roundup or equivalent 5 gal cube Mad Dog Herbicide yes 62.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID

4 Nalco Trol II or equivalent case

Reign LC (case is 12 

x 1qts) yes 105.00 Elite Secure Ultra yes 120.00

5 Krovar I DF or equivalent case

Krovar  I DF (case is 

48lbs, 8x6lb bags) yes 348.00 yes 528.00

6 Oust Extra or equivalent 4 lb Oust Extra yes 114.00 yes NO BID

7 Sufactant or equivalent 2.5 gal Brewer 90 yes 23.65 RRSI NIS yes 25.00

8A Plateau or equivalent 2.5 gal Plateau (1 gal) yes

112.50/gal 

(281.25/2.5gal) NO BID NO BID NO BID

8B Plateau or equivalent 5 gal cube Plateau yes 562.50 yes 540.00

9A 24-D or equivalent 2.5 gal Platoon yes 34.10 Drexel De-Amine yes 25.00

9B 24-D or equivalent 5 gal cube Platoon yes 68.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID

10A Garlon 4 or equivalent 2.5 gal Garlon 4 Ultra yes 135.50 yes 182.50

10B Garlon 4 or equivalent 5 gal cube Garlon 4 Ultra yes 271.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Crop Production Services                                          

13622 E Hardy Road                                                         

Houston TX  77039                                                    

Attn:  Mike Standish                                       

mike.standish@cpsagu.com                                             

ph:  512-887-0318                                                              

fx:  303-222-2928

Red River Specialties, Inc.                                    

1324 North Hearne Avenue - Suite 120                                      

Shreveport LA  71107                                           

Attn:  Chad Chambliss                                            

chad.chambliss@rrsi.com                                          

ph:  318-425-5944                                          fx:  

318-227-3032                        

Crop Production Services Red River Specialties


