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Associated Supply Brookside Doggett Heavy Doggett
Company, Inc. (ASCO)  Equipment Sales, Inc. Machinery Services Toyota Lift of Houston
5980 South MLK Parkway 3715 S. Sam Houston Pkwy E 4355 West Cardinal Dr 7110 North Freeway
Beaumont, TX 77705 Houston, TX  77047 Beaumont, TX  77705 Houston, TX  77076
Contact: Don Norton Contact: Brant North Contact: Charlie Cotton Contact: Jeremy Breed

Reclaimer/Stabilizer or Equivalent don@ascoeq.com bnorth@brooksideusa.com charlie.cotten@doggett.com jeremy.breed@doggett.com
Trade-In: 281-987-1990 phone 713-943-7100 phone 409-842-1754 phone 713-675-1000 phone
BOMAG MPH100-R (SN: 85489) 409-212-8101 fax 281-501-3994 fax 409-842-1765 fax 713-699-6525 fax
Bid Price $335,000.00
Trade-In Value $1,000.00

Lead Time 2 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid 2015 Roadtec

Soil Stabilizer SX-2E
Demo Unit  
w/ approximately  334 hours

Mustang CAT R.B. Everett  Shoppa's Waukesha-Pearce
7990 Eastex Frwy & Company Farm Supply Industries, LLC.
Beaumont, TX 77708 PO Box 7300 9135 College St. 8903 Highway 69 South
Contact: Stevan deLeon Pasadena, TX 77508 Beaumont, TX 77707 Port Arthur, TX 77640
sdeleon@mustangcat.com Contact: Dean Henderson Contact: Gerard Solano Contact: Ryan Pyburn

Reclaimer/Stabilizer or Equivalent 409-201-9500 phone dhenderson@rbeverett.com gsolano@shoppas.com pyburn@wpi.com
Trade-In: 281-991-8161 phone 409-842-1128 phone 409-648-6764 phone
BOMAG MPH100-R (SN: 85489) 281-991-59676 409-842-6216 fax
Bid Price $361,235.00
Trade-In Value $1,000.00

Lead Time 4-6 weeks 8 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Make/Model as specified. Make/Model as specified.

Item 1. (Continued)
BOMAG Model RS-360 

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) $351,569.00

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) $334,000.00

Beaumont, TX 7707
Contact: Kyle Lee
kyle@beaumonttractor.com
409-866-3360 phone
406-866-5884 fax

Item 1.
BOMAG Model RS-360 

NO BID NO BIDNO BID

NO BID

AWARDED:

bcannon@romco.com
713-492-6619 phone
713-937-7541

NO BID

Beaumont
Tractor Co.
4430 College St.

Briggs
Equipment
6210 Walden

Beaumont, TX  77707
Contact: Gene Landry
gene.landry@briggsequipment.com
409-940-4463 phone
409-840-6060 fax

NO BID $360,235.00

NO BID

$354,069.00
$2,500.00

ROMCO
Equipment Co.
8450 Breen Rd.
Houston, TX 77064
Contact: Bryan Cannon

NO BID
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ALL BIDS REJECTED.

Motor Grader or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
1998 Champion Motor Grader Model 710 A
Bid Price $206,608.00 $256,000.00
Trade-In Value $6,000.00 $13,000.00

Lead Time 4 weeks Lead Time Not Provided
Description of Equivalent Item Bid CASE 865B Motor Grader John Deere 620 G

Motor Grader or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
1998 Champion Motor Grader Model 710 A
Bid Price $247,500.00 $267,075.00
Trade-In Value $6,000.00 $2,500.00

Lead Time 4 weeks 8 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Make/Model as specified. Komatsu GD655

Item 2. (Continued)
Mustang CAT Model 120 M2

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company

NO BID

Mustang CAT Model 120 M2

NO BID

$243,000.00

Item 2.

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) NO BID NO BID

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc. Beaumont Tractor Co. Briggs Equipment

Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

Mustang CAT

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

NO BID NO BID

$241,500.00

$200,608.00

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

NO BID

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

$264,575.00
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Tractor (Dozer ) or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
1997 Komatsu D58 P
Bid Price $119,870.00 $147,000.00
Trade-In Value $12,000.00 $15,000.00

Lead Time 4 weeks Lead Time Not Provided
Description of Equivalent Item Bid CASE 850M Dozer John Deere 650K LGP

Tractor (Dozer ) or Equivalent AWARDED:
Trade-In: 
1997 Komatsu D58 P
Bid Price $133,000.00 $137,620.00
Trade-In Value $4,000.00 $2,500.00

Lead Time 12 weeks 8 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Make/Model as specified. Komatsu D39PX-24

Item 3.  (Continued)
Mustang CAT Model D5K2 LGP CA

NO BID

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

NO BID

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

$135,120.00Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company

NO BID

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

NO BID

$107,870.00Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) NO BID

$129,000.00

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

Mustang CAT

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

$132,000.00

Mustang CAT Model D5K2 LGP CA

Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Item 3.

NO BID NO BID

Beaumont Tractor Co. Briggs Equipment
Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc.
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ALL BIDS REJECTED.

Pneumatic Roller or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Dynapac CP142 (SN: 1000-500C0B000882)
Bid Price $88,420.00 $74,900.00
Trade-In Value $5,000.00 $4,000.00

Lead Time 4 weeks 5 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Leeboy TRU-PAC 915B Dynapac CP1200

Pneumatic Roller

Pneumatic Roller or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Dynapac CP142 (SN: 1000-500C0B000882)
Bid Price $85,180.00
Trade-In Value $2,000.00

Lead Time 2 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid LBP Leeboy PTC-15 Bid Make/Model as specified.

Item 4. 
BOMAG Model BW11RH-5

$83,420.00Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

$5,000.00

$77,001.00

6 weeks
Make/Model as specified.

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company
$82,001.00

Item 4. (Continued)
BOMAG Model BW11RH-5

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

Briggs Equipment
Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

Mustang CAT
Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Beaumont Tractor Co.
Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc.

$70,900.00

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.
$95,376.00
$0.00

$95,376.00

11 weeks

$83,180.00
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Wheel Loader or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
John Deere 544H (SN: DW544HX57290)
Bid Price $154,250.00 $173,800.00
Trade-In Value $20,000.00 $20,000.00

Lead Time 4 weeks Lead Time Not Provided
Description of Equivalent Item Bid CASE 621G Wheel Loader John Deere 544 K

Bidder's Incorrect Total Bid Price:
$134,230.00

Wheel Loader or Equivalent AWARDED:
Trade-In: 
John Deere 544H (SN: DW544HX57290)
Bid Price $179,000.00 $191,940.00
Trade-In Value $12,000.00 $8,500.00

Lead Time 6-8 weeks 2 weeks 6 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid CAT 930M Make/Model as specified. Volvo L70H Komatsu WA320-8

$124,865.00

Item 5. (Continued)
DOOSAN Model DL220-5

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

Mustang CAT

$167,000.00

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company
$140,115.00
$15,250.00

$160,719.00 NO BID

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc.

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

$183,440.00

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

Beaumont Tractor Co. Briggs Equipment
Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

$165,719.00
$5,000.00

NO BID NO BID$134,250.00 $153,800.00

Item 5.
DOOSAN Model DL220-5

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) NO BID NO BID

1 week

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply
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ALL BIDS REJECTED.

Vibratory Tandem Roller or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
CAT CB534-C (SN: 5HN00552)
Bid Price $110,520.00 $125,250.00
Trade-In Value $4,000.00 $6,500.00

Lead Time 4 weeks 5 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid CASE DV209D Dynapac CC4200 VI

Vibratory Tandem Roller

Vibratory Tandem Roller or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
CAT CB534-C (SN: 5HN00552)
Bid Price
Trade-In Value

Lead Time 4-6 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Make/Model as specified.

Item 6.  
BOMAG Model BW161AD-5

$106,520.00

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc.

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

NO BID

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

Item 6.  (Continued)
BOMAG Model BW161AD-5

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company
$135,955.00
$1,250.00

$134,705.00 NO BID

Beaumont Tractor Co. Briggs Equipment
Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Mustang CAT
Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

NO BID

$118,750.00

NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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ALL BIDS REJECTED.

Single Drum Padfoot Roller or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
BOMAG BW213DH213DH-10
(SN: 901582561088)
Bid Price $107,000.00 $124,150.00
Trade-In Value $7,000.00 $4,000.00

Lead Time 4 weeks 5 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid CASE SV212 84" Dynapac CA2500PD

Single Drum Padfoot Roller

Single Drum Padfoot Roller or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
BOMAG BW213DH213DH-10
(SN: 901582561088)
Bid Price $113,500.00
Trade-In Value $2,500.00

Lead Time 2-3 weeks Lead Time not provided 2 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid BOMAG BW211PD-5 Volvo SD115BF Make/Model as specified.

86" Single Drum
Padfoot Roller

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company
$116,344.00
$10,250.00

$106,094.00

Item 7.  
BOMAG Model BW211PD-5 84"

Item 7.  (Continued)
BOMAG Model BW211PD-5 84"

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.
$120,595.00
$0.00

$120,595.00

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) NO BID $120,150.00

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

NO BID NO BID $111,000.00

Mustang CAT

$100,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

NO BID

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc.

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of HoustonBeaumont Tractor Co. Briggs Equipment

Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.
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or Equivalent AWARDED:
Trade-In: 
Gradall G3WD
Bid Price $328,666.98
Trade-In Value $2,000.00

Lead Time 2 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Make/Model as specified.

or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Gradall G3WD
Bid Price
Trade-In Value

Lead Time
Description of Equivalent Item Bid

NO BID

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

NO BIDNO BID

Mustang CAT

Item 8. (A) (Continued)
Gradall XL3100 Hydraulic Excavator

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company

NO BID

Item 8. (A)

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc.

Gradall XL3100 Hydraulic Excavator

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) $326,666.98

Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

NO BID

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

NO BID

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

NO BID NO BID

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
ServicesBriggs EquipmentBeaumont Tractor Co.

NO BID NO BID
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or Equivalent AWARDED:
Trade-In: 
Gradall XL3100  
Bid Price $328,666.98
Trade-In Value $10,000.00

Lead Time 2 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Make/Model as specified.

or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Gradall XL3100  
Bid Price
Trade-In Value

Lead Time
Description of Equivalent Item Bid

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

NO BID

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company

NO BID

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

NO BID

Item 8. (B) (Continued)
Gradall XL3100 Hydraulic Excavator

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

Item 8. (B)  
Gradall XL3100 Hydraulic Excavator

NO BID

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc.

NO BID

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) NO BID$318,666.98

Mustang CAT

Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

NO BID

NO BID

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

NO BID NO BID

Beaumont Tractor Co. Briggs Equipment
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ALL BIDS REJECTED.

or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Ford 5000 Tractor
Bid Price $26,250.00 $31,475.00
Trade-In Value $0.00 $300.00

Lead Time 3 weeks 4-8 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid CASE Farmall 70A Kubota M7060 HD12 Make/Model as specified.

Tractor, 4WD

or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Ford 5000 Tractor
Bid Price $29,999.00
Trade-In Value $1,000.00

Lead Time 1-6 week(s)
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Make/Model as specified.

Item 9. (Continued)
John Deere 5065E Utility Tractor OOS 4WD

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company

NO BID

Mustang CAT

NO BID

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) $26,250.00

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

Briggs Equipment

$29,850.00

$1,000.00
$30,850.00

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc. Beaumont Tractor Co.

NO BID

Item 9.
John Deere 5065E Utility Tractor OOS 4WD

30 days

$31,175.00 NO BID

NO BID $28,999.00 NO BID

NO BID

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.
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(with Alamo Side Mower) or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Case 685 Tractor 
with Alamo Versa Side Mower
Bid Price $75,438.00
Trade-In Value $500.00

Lead Time 6-12 weeks
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Tractor: Kubota M5-091 HDC12  Tractor: Make/Model as specified.

Side Mower: Diamond Mfg.
Side Mount Hydraulic 60"
Mower Complete

(with Alamo Side Mower) or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Case 685 Tractor 
with Alamo Versa Side Mower
Bid Price $77,794.94
Trade-In Value $1,000.00

Lead Time 1-6 week(s)
Description of Equivalent Item Bid Make/Model as specified.

John Deere 5085E Utility Tractor Cab 4WD

$73,500.00

Item 10.  (Continued)
John Deere 5085E Utility Tractor Cab 4WD

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company

NO BID

AWARDED:

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

NO BID

Item 10.

Mustang CAT

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc. Beaumont Tractor Co. Briggs Equipment

Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

NO BID $74,938.00 NO BID

NO BID

$1,000.00

NO BIDNO BID

120 days

Ditch Mower

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

$76,794.94

NO BID

Side Mower: Terrain King  

$72,500.00
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Model GP050VX or Equivalent
Trade-In: 
Clark Model: C500-YS60
(SN: Y355-1362-4324-1081)
Bid Price $25,586.00 $33,949.00
Trade-In Value $0.00 $500.00

Lead Time 5 weeks 2-3 weeks (if still in-stock)
Description of Equivalent Item Bid DOOSAN G-25 Make/Model as specified. Toyota 8FDU25

Model GP050VX or Equivalent
Clark Model: C500-YS60
(SN: Y355-1362-4324-1081)
Bid Price
Trade-In Value

Lead Time
Description of Equivalent Item Bid

ROMCO                                           
Equipment Co.

NO BID

R.B. Everett                                    
& Company

NO BID

Shoppa's                                          
Farm Supply

NO BID

11 weeks

Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value)

Mustang CAT

NO BID

Item 11. (Continued)
Yale Veracitor Pneumatic Tire Forklift

Doggett Heavy Machinery 
Services

Yale Veracitor Pneumatic Tire Forklift
Item 11.

Associated Supply                          
Company, Inc. Beaumont Tractor Co. Briggs Equipment

Brookside Equipment               
Sales, Inc.

Doggett                                       
Toyota Lift of Houston

$0.00

AWARDED:

$31,995.00

$33,449.00Total Bid Price                                                         
(Minus Trade-In Value) $25,586.00 NO BID $31,995.00 NO BID

NO BID

Waukesha-Pearce                      
Industries, LLC.

NO BID


