
IFB 08-007/AW 
TERM CONTRACT FOR PAPER STOCK & ENVELOPES 

FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY 
FINAL TABULATION – DECEMBER 3, 2007 

 
 

PAPER STOCK 

No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand 
Unit Price 

per M 
Sheets 

per case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

1 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x11 
Paper grade:  Premium #4 Olmstead-Kirk Paper Domtar Meteor 5.74 5000 28.70 

2 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper Domtar Meteor 6.18 5000 30.90 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x11, 3-hole 
punched 
Paper grade:  Premium #4      

3 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x14 
Paper grade:  Premium #4 Olmstead-Kirk Paper Domtar Meteor 7.86 5000 39.30 

4 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 11x17 
Paper grade:  Premium #4 Olmstead-Kirk Paper Domtar Meteor 12.36 2500 30.90 

5 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

24 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x11 
Paper grade:  Laser Print #1 Olmstead-Kirk Paper IP Hammermill 10.45 5000 52.25 

6 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

24 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, white 8½x14 
Paper grade:  Laser Print #1 Olmstead-Kirk Paper IP Hammermill 13.28 5000 66.40 

7 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper 6.98 5000 34.90 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, colors (peach, orchid, 
cherry, ivory, grey), 8½x11 
– ream wrap only (com-
bined total).  Paper grade:  
prem. #4 

 

Wauau Exact 
MP    

8 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper 9.44 5000 47.20 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, colors (peach, orchid, 
cherry, ivory, grey), 8½x14 
– ream wrap only (com-
bined total).  Paper grade:  
prem. #4 

 

Wauau Exact 
MP    

9 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper 6.98 5000 34.90 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, 
colors (buff, salmon, 
goldenrod, pink, blue, 
canary, green), 8½x11  

Wauau Exact 
MP    
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No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand 
Unit Price 

per M 
Sheets 

per case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

10 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper 9.44 5000 47.20 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, long 
grain, colors (ivory, 
goldenrod, pink, blue, 
canary, green), 8½x14  

Wauau Exact 
MP    

11 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper 14.08 4000 56.32 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, 25% 
rag, long grain, cockle 
finish, white, 8½x11.  Paper 
grade:  #1  

Wauau Royal 
Cotton    

12 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper 32.15 3000 96.45 

 

20 pound Bond Paper, 25% 
rag, long grain, cockle 
finish, white, 8½x14.  Paper 
grade:  #1  

Wauau Royal 
Cotton    

CARD STOCK 

No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand 
Unit Price 

per M 
Sheets 

per case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

13 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper Wausau Exact 12.84 2000 25.68 

 

67 pound Vellum cover 
stock (white) 8½x11, shrink 
wrap acceptable (combined 
total).  Paper grade:  #4      

14 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper Wausau Exact 13.80 2000 27.60 

 

67 pound Vellum cover 
stock (aqua, green, gold, 
blue, pink, ivory, yellow, 
grey) 8½x11, shrink wrap 
acceptable (combined total).  
Paper grade:  #4 

     

15 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

75 pound High Buff Offset, 
white, 8½x14.  Paper grade:  
high bulk Olmstead-Kirk Paper IP Williamsburg 24.25 2000 48.50 

16 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper IP Hammermill 10.12 5000 50.60 

 

20 pound #1 White Sulfite, 
long grain white, 8½x11 
Hammermill.  Paper grade:  
Grade 1 watermark      

17 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

10¾ x14 cut – white 75 
pound return card Olmstead-Kirk Paper IP Williamsburg 24.25 2000 48.50 

18 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

8½x14 100 pound manila 
Springhill tag Olmstead-Kirk Paper IP Springhill 40.00 1000 40.00 

19 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

8x8 110 lb. Springhill index 
white Olmstead-Kirk Paper IP Springhill 22.15 1000 22.15 

20 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

Hammermill accent opaque 
28/70 pound white – vellum 
finish, long grain, 8½x11 Olmstead-Kirk Paper Wausau Exact Ice 9.10 3000 27.30 
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No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand Unit Price 

per M 
Sheets 

per case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

21 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

Brite Hue – 60 pound text & 
cover 8½x11 (red, violet, 
green, orange, ultra fuchsia) Olmstead-Kirk Paper Wausau 

Astrobright 
13.79 5000 68.95 

22 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#80 8½x11 Classic Crest 
Avon Brilliant White Olmstead-Kirk Paper Neenah Classic 57.52 2000 115.04 

23 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#80 8½x11 Classic Crest 
Avon Ivory Olmstead-Kirk Paper Neenah Classic 58.60 2000 117.20 

ENVELOPES 

No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand 
Unit Price 

per M 
Env. per 

case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

24 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

24 pound catalog envelopes 
10x13 white woven Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 59.00 500 29.50 

25 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

28 pound white catalog 
envelopes 9x12 Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 56.50 500 28.25 

26 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

15x10 brown kraft gummed 
flap document envelopes 
32# Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 159.08 500 79.54 

27 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#9 window envelopes – 24 
pound white wove Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 18.06 2500 45.15 

28 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#9 regular envelopes – 24 
pound white wove Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 14.50 2500 36.25 

29 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#10 window envelopes – 24 
pound white wove (hard 
boxes) Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 17.42 2500 43.55 

30 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#10 regular envelopes – 24 
pound white wove (hard 
boxes) Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 14.48 2500 36.20 

31 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#11 window envelopes – 28 
pound white wove Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 56.90 2500 142.25 

32 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#11 regular envelopes – 28 
pound white wove Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 49.06 2500 122.65 

33 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#12 window envelopes – 24 
pound white wove Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 53.40 2500 133.50 

34 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#12 regular envelopes – 24 
pound white wove Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 47.66 2500 119.15 
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No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand 
Unit Price 

per M 
Env. per 

case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

35 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#10 brown kraft envelopes – 
28 pound Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 25.80 2500 64.50 

36 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#12 brown kraft envelopes – 
28 pound Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 61.94 2500 154.85 

37 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

#14 brown kraft envelopes – 
28 pound Olmstead-Kirk Paper OKCO 65.96 2500 164.90 

38 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 Olmstead-Kirk Paper 44.27 2500 110.65 

 

Opaque envelopes  - 4½x9 
(blue, green, natural, cream, 
gold, pink, gray, ivory, 
yellow)  

Wausau Exact 
Opaque    

NO CARBON REQUIRED PAPER 

No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand 
Unit Price 

per M 
Sets per 

case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

39 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter1 Excel 25.00 5000 125.00 

 

8½x11 CFB white-black image 
long grain 

Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 18.28 5000 91.41 

40 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 31.05 5000 155.25 

 

8½x14 CFB white-black image 
long grain 

Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 23.24 5000 116.20 

41 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 17.78 2500 88.90 

 

8½x11 2-part black image 
carbonless reverse collated 

Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 13.46 2500 67.30 

42 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 20.06 1667 100.32 

 

8½x11 Mead 3-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 15.14 1666 75.70 

43 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 21.45 1250 107.25 

 

8½x11 Mead 4-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 16.18 1250 80.90 

44 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 22.02 1000 110.10 

 

8½x11 Mead 5-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 16.64 1000 83.20 

45 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 22.75 2500 113.75 

 

8½x14 Mead 2-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 17.12 2500 85.60 

46 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 25.69 1667 128.45 

 

8½x14 Mead 3-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 19.24 1666 96.20 

47 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 27.46 1250 137.30 

 

8½x14 Mead 4-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 20.58 1250 102.90 

48 Clampitt Paper Gladfelter Excel 28.19 1000 $140.95 

 

8½x14 Mead 5-part black 
image carbonless reverse 
collated Olmstead-Kirk Paper Appleton Superior 21.20 1000 106.00 

 

                                                 
1 Gladfelter bought Mead and changed the name, but kept the paper the same. 

IFB 08-007/AW – Term Contract for Paper Stock & Envelopes for Jefferson County – Preliminary Tabulation Page 4 of 5 



REPORTER PADS 

No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand 
Unit Price 

per M 
Pads per 

case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

49 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

Pro-Line Original White 
Numbered Reporter Pads 
(300 sheets/pad) Olmstead-Kirk Paper    No Bid 

50 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

Pro-Line Original White 
Unnumbered Reporter Pads 
(300 sheets/pad) Olmstead-Kirk Paper    No Bid 

SPECIALTY PAPER 

No. Description Vendor Mfg./Brand 
Unit Price 

per M 
Sheets 

per case 
Unit Price 
per Case 

51 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

14" Vital Records Bank 
Note Paper Olmstead-Kirk Paper    No Bid 

52 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

36 pound Security Paper, 
8½x11 Certified Birth 
Certificate Olmstead-Kirk Paper    No Bid 

53 Clampitt Paper    No Bid 

 

36 pound Weston Ledger or 
Equal, 8½x14 Marriage 
License Stock Olmstead-Kirk Paper  142.30 4500 640.35 
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