
John Deere Landscapes Chemsearch Bio Dept. Red River Specialties Townsend Chemical Div. UAP Timberland LLC
1301 E. 9th Street Suite 1300 PO Box 152170 8930 Lawndale Suite B 9211 E. Jackson St. 13622 E. Hardy Road
Cleveland, OH  44114 Irving, TX  75015 Houston, TX  77012 Selma, IN  47383 Houston, TX  77083
Attn:  Keith O. McGinty Attn:  Deb Hall Attn:  Stan Jones Attn:  James R. Brayton Attn:  A. J. Thibodeaux
Phone:  800-321-5325 Phone:  972-438-0511 Phone:  713-924-6929 Phone:  800-616-4221 Phone:  713-705-9800
Fax:  216-706-1612 Fax:  972-438-0634 Fax:  713-921-0074 Fax:  765-289-4451 Fax:  281-987-8969

Price per Total Price per Total Price per Total Price per Total Price per Total
Item Description Gallon Price Gallon Price Gallon Price Gallon Price Gallon Price

1 MSMA Herbicide $20.42 $51.05/2.5gal No Bid $17.00 $510.00 $17.20 $43.00/2.5gal $16.00 $40.00/2.5gal
or Equivalent

2 Tordon 101 herbicide No Bid No Bid $36.00 $1,080.00 $33.50 $83.75/2.5gal $38.50 $96.25/2.5gal
or Equilvalent

3 Roundup herbicide $43.33$100.00/2.5gal $68.09 340.45/5 Gal $45.50 $1,365.00 $36.50 $91.25/2.5gal $39.00 $97.50/2.5gal
or Equilvalent

4 Nalco Trol II No Bid No Bid $9.00/qt $9.00/qt $20.00 $20.00/gal $7.45/qt $7.45/qt
or Equilivalent

5 Krovar I DF No Bid No Bid $11.80/lb $70.80/6lb $10.50/lb $63.00/6lb $11.50/lb $69.00/6lb
or Equilvalent

6 Oust Extra No Bid No Bid $74.00/lb $296.00/4lb $39.20/8oz $39.20 $75.00/lb $300.00/4lb
or Equivalent

7 Sufactant $22.00 $55.00/2.5gal No Bid $10.75 322.50/30gal $13.00 $32.50/2.5gal $13.00 $32.50/2.5gal
or Eqilvalent

8 Nu-Film $35.00/64oz $35.00/64oz No Bid $66.00/2.5gal $66.00/2.5gal $23.00 $57.50/2.5gal $27.40 $68.50/2.5gal
or Eqilvalent

9 24-D $23.00 $57.50/2.5gal No Bid $13.50/GAL $405.00 $12.70 $31.75/2.5gal $13.00 $32.50/2.5gal
or Equilant

10 Agnique Monomolecular No Bid No Bid $88.00 $2,640.00 $79.00$197.50/2.5gal $53.00$132.50/2.5gal
or Eqilivalent

11 Journey No Bid No Bid $104.00 $3,120.00 $98.00$245.00/2.5gal $112.00$280.00/2.5gal
or Equivalent
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IFB 08-005/DC, Herbicides for the Southeast Texas Regional Airport

Final  Tabulation - June 9, 2008

Krovar

Oust Extra

Red River 90

Sun Spot 100

Weedhoe 108

Tordon 101m

Helosate Plus

Secure

LESCO Spreader Sticker

Hawkeye Organosilicone

Target 6.6

Prosecutor Pro

Amine 400, 24-D

MSMA + 6

Dow Agro

Razor-Nufarm

MistTrol 336

Dupont

Dupont

Invade 90

Miller Chemical

Krovar IDF

oust Extra

Spreader 90

NuFilm

WeedHoe 108 

Tordon 101

Razor Pro 

Poty Control II

Phatoon

Element 4

NuFarm

Dow Agro

Journey Journey


