IFB 10-039/KJS

Term Contract for Trash Container Service for Jefferson County
Preliminary Tab - June 29, 2010

Iltem |. Standard Waste Containers Allied Waste Coastal Waste IESI Tx. Corporation Triangle Waste Waste Management
Price per Price per Price per Price per Price per

Cap. Frequency | Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price
Location Qty (CY) of Service | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month
Airport - Main Terminal 1 8 1 day/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid 90.93 90.93 73.71 73.71 75.49 75.49
Airport - Fuel Service 1 8 1 day/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid 90.93 90.93 73.71 73.71 75.49 75.49
Airport - Maintenance Shop 1 8 1 day/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid 90.93 90.93 73.71 73.71 75.49 75.49
Jefferson County Annex | 1 10 5 days/week 400.53 472.62 No Bid 568.32 568.32 460.71 460.71 410.51 410.51
Jefferson County Annex Il 1 10 5 days/week 400.53 472.62 No Bid 568.32 568.32 460.71 460.71 410.51I 410.51
Jefferson County Annex IV 1 10 5 days/week 400.53 472.62 No Bid 568.32 568.32 460.71 460.71 410.51I 410.51
Correctional Facility 1 40 1 day/week 365.00 1,460.00 369.15 1,598.42 1,480.00 1,480.00 478.52 1,914.03 400.00 1,720.00
Correctional Facility 1 4 1 day/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid 90.93 90.93 73.71 73.71 124.53 124.53
Mosquito Control 1 8 1 day/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid 90.93 90.93 73.71 73.71 75.49 75.49
Women's Center 1 10 1 day/week 80.11 94.51 No Bid 113.67 113.67 92.14 92.14 82.10 82.10
JC Pct. 2 Service Center 1 8 1 day/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid 90.93 90.93 73.71 73.71 75.49 75.49
Mid-County Office Building 1 8 1 day/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid 90.93 90.93 73.71 73.71 75.49 75.49
JP Pct. 4 1 6 1 day/week 48.06 56.71 No Bid 68.21 68.21 110.57 110.57 69.18 69.18
JC Service Center 1 4 5 days/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid 90.93 90.93 184.28 184.28 124.53 124.53
Juvenile Justice Center 1 10 5 days/week 400.53 472.62 No Bid 568.32 568.32 460.71 460.71 410.51 410.51
Ford Park Baseball Field 2 20 1 day/week 220.00 3,520.00 251.45 2,177.56 1,120.00 2,240.00 313.60 2,508.80 275.00 2,365.00
Ford Park Arena 1 40 1 day/week 365.00 1,460.00 369.15 1,598.42 1,480.00 1,480.00 459.20 1,836.80 400.00 1,720.00
JC Pct. 4 Service Center 1 1 day/week 17.32 37.80 No Bid 45.47 45.47 36.86 36.86 62.54 62.54
JC Pct. 1 Service Center 1 1 day/week 17.32 37.80 No Bid 45.47 45.47 36.86 36.86 62.54 62.54
Iltem Il. Compactor Allied Waste Coastal Waste IESI Tx. Corporation Triangle Waste Waste Management

Price per Price per Price per Price per Price per

Cap. Frequency | Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price
Location Qty (CY) of Service | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month  Per Month
Airport - Maintenance 1 30 1 day/week 295.00 1,180.00 310.30 1,343.60 1,600.00 1,600.00 459.20 1,836.80 345.00 1,483.50
Correctional Facility 1 30 1 day/week 295.00 1,180.00 310.30 1,343.60 1,600.00 1,600.00 459.20 1,836.80 345.00 1,483.50
Ford Park Arena 1 30 1 day/week 295.00 1,180.00 310.30 1,343.60 1,600.00 1,600.00 459.20 1,836.80 345.00 1,483.50




Item Ill. Cardboard Recycling Allied Waste Coastal Waste IESI Tx. Corporation Triangle Waste Waste Management
Price per Price per Price per Price per Price per
Cap. Frequency | Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price
Location Qty (CY) of Service | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month  Per Month
Ford Park Arena 1 8 1 day/week 64.08 75.61 No Bid No Bid 73.71 73.71 75.49 75.49
Iltem IV. Biomedical Waste Containers Allied Waste Coastal Waste IESI Tx. Corporation Triangle Waste Waste Management
Price per Price per Price per Price per Price per
Cap. Frequency | Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price| Container Total Price
Location Qty (LB) of Service | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month | Per Month Per Month
Public Health Dept - Bmt 1 30 1 day/mo. 200.00 200.00 No Bid 125.00 125.00 No Bid 65.00 65.00
Public Health Dept - PA 1 30 1 day/mo. 200.00 200.00 No Bid 125.00 125.00 No Bid 65.00 65.00
JC Crime Lab 6 30 1 day/mo. 200.00 1,200.00 No Bid 125.00 750.00 No Bid 65.00 390.00
JC Employee Health 1 30 1 day/mo. 200.00 200.00 No Bid 125.00 125.00 No Bid 65.00 65.00
Adult Probation (Pt Arthur) 1 30 1 day/mo. 200.00 200.00 No Bid 125.00 125.00 No Bid 65.00 65.00
Community Supervision 1 30 1 day/mo. 200.00 200.00 No Bid 125.00 125.00 No Bid 65.00 65.00
Women's Center 1 30 1 day/mo. 200.00 200.00 No Bid 125.00 125.00 No Bid 65.00 65.00
Juvenile Justice Center 1 30 1 day/mo. 200.00 200.00 No Bid 125.00 125.00 No Bid 65.00 65.00
Allied Waste Coastal Waste IESI Tx. Corporation Triangle Waste Waste Management
LUMP SUM TOTAL 1 8 1 day/week 15,377.79 9,405.20 14,898.54 14,736.97 13,796.39

Allied Waste Services
6425 Highway 347
Nederland, TX 77627
Attn: Derek Thompson
Phone: 409-721-2231
Fax: 480-718-4450

Coastal Waste Disposal Inc.
4749 Odom Road, #101
Beaumont, TX 77706

Attn: Jared C. Bishop
Phone: 409-898-0063

Fax: 409-898-8988

IESI Tx Corporation
2339 FM 770

Kountze, TX 77625
Attn: Sharon S. McBee
Phone: 409-246-4022
Fax: 409-246-4042

Triangle Waste Solutions
1000 S. Business Park Dr.
Port Arthur, TX 77640
Attn: Catherine Hillin
Phone: 409-736-3600
Fax: 409-736-2872

Waste Management
2175 W. Cardinal Drive
Beaumont, TX 77705
Attn: Mike Wilson
Phone: 409-951-2910
Fax: 409-842-4965




