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Term Contract for Correctional Facility (Jefferson County) Law Enforcement Equipment and Uniforms
Final Tab - Awarded July 18, 2011

Item Description 10-32 Supply GT Distributors* Lone Star Uniform Texas Code Blue

1 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/zip - F - LS NO BID 42.42 33.00 36.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco A9314LC Elbeco 9814 Z9314

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

2 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/zip - F - SS NO BID 38.75 30.00 35.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco Z9814LC Elbeco 9814 Z9814

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

3 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/zip - M - LS NO BID 42.42 33.00 36.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco Z314 Elbeco Z3314 Z314

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

4 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/zip - M - SS NO BID 38.75 30.00 35.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbec Z3314 Elbeco Z3314 Z3314

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

5 Male Tex-Trop Trouser E314 NO BID 36.56 33.95 38.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco E314 Elbeco E314 E314

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

6 Elbeco Tex-Trop - F - LS NO BID 37.42 33.00 36.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9314LC Elbeco 9814 '9314

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

7 Elbeco Tex-Trop - F - SS NO BID 33.75 30.00 34.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9814LC Elbeco 9314 9814

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

8 Elbeco Tex-Trop - M - LS NO BID 37.42 33.00 36.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 314 Elbeco 2314 314

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

9 Elbeco Tex-Trop - M - SS NO BID 33.75 30.00 34.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 3314 Elbeco Z3314 3314

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

10 Female Tex-Trop Trouser E9314 NO BID 36.56 33.95 38.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Elbeco 9314LC Elbeco E9314 E314

Days to delivery 14 15 15-45

11 Duty Jacket NO BID NO BID 62.95 89.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Blauer 6030 Spiewak S3609

Days to delivery 15 20-30

12 Coach's Windbreaker NO BID NO BID 17.90 20.55
Manufacturer/Style No. Liberty 560MBK Liberty 560MBK

Days to delivery 15 15

13 Raincoat w/ emblem NO BID 66.85 89.00 98.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Neese NI-447RSC Gerber 70CL (w/ ID) Spiewak 5309 w/ hood

Days to delivery 7-21 15 15-30

14 Raincoat w/o emblem NO BID 56.85 85.00 92.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Neese NI-447RSC Gerber 70CL (w/ ID) Spiewak 5309 w/ hood

Days to delivery 7-21 15 15-30

15 Polo Shirt NO BID 39.37 22.95 42.80
Manufacturer/Style No. 511 Tactical 41060-724 Ash City Elbeco UFX w/badge

Days to delivery 7-21 15 15-20

16 Dutyman Garrison Belt 24.00 12.98 14.95 18.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Boston 6605 Dutyman 1611 Dutyman 1511V 1511 1-1/2

Days to delivery 15 15 15 15-20

17 Kevlar Gloves 48.00 38.90 49.50 28.05
Manufacturer/Style No. Damascus Damascus DSX100 Damascus DSX100 Damascus DSX100

Days to delivery 15 15 15 15-20

18 Name Badge NO BID 7.90 9.95 12.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Blackinton J2 Blackinton J2 Blackinton J1

Days to delivery 15 15 15
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19 Cuff Case - Safariland 190 42.00 25.12 28.95 27.85
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland 190 Safariland 190 Gould & Goodrich 580

Days to delivery 15 15 15 30

20 Handcuffs, Nickel 31.00 20.80 26.50 24.80
Manufacturer/Style No. Peerless Peerless 700 Peerless 4710 Peerless 700

Days to delivery 15 15 15 30

21 Handcuffs, color-plated 34.00 22.80 29.50 28.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Peerless Peerless 750 Peerless 4712P Peerless 750

Days to delivery 15 15 15 30

22 Leg irons, standard 45.00 35.74 47.50 45.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Peerless Peerless 703 Peerless 4740 S&W 1900

Days to delivery 15 15 15 30

23 One-man restraint chain 28.00 ** 53.90 67.50 67.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Peerless Peerless 7002 Peerless 4764 (w/ cuff) Peerless 7002

Days to delivery 15 15 15 30

24 Additional Items (% off) NO BID 8% 25% 36%
Days to delivery

Vendor shall comply with (Left blank) Yes Yes Yes   No
15-day delivery

Vendor shall notify department (Left blank) Yes Yes Yes
of anticipated delays

* GT Distributors - 12 piece minimum first order; 6 piece minimum on new order thereafter - this disqualifies the bid.
** Model not identified.


