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Item Description 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 Notes

1 Coverall - Yellow, X-Sm 10.50 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.00 No bid 12.61 Item 1
Coverall - Yellow, Sm 10.50 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.25 No bid 12.61 Bob Barker - the following sizes have a min. order of
Coverall - Yellow, M 11.40 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.75 No bid 12.61 6 each and a lead time of 6-8 weeks ARO:
Coverall - Yellow, L 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 12.00 No bid 12.61 XS, 5XL, 7XL, 9XL
Coverall - Yellow, XL 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 12.50 No bid 12.61 Robinson - Bid all or none.
Coverall - Yellow, 1XL 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 12.50 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Yellow, 2XL 13.00 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 13.00 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Yellow, 3XL 13.66 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 13.50 No bid 13.35
Coverall - Yellow, 4XL 13.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.00 No bid 13.35
Coverall - Yellow, 5XL 13.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.50 No bid 13.99
Coverall - Yellow, 6XL 15.55 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.50 No bid 13.99
Coverall - Yellow, 7XL 15.55 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 16.00 No bid 15.07
Coverall - Yellow, 8XL 15.55 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 16.00 No bid 15.07
Coverall - Yellow, 9XL 16.44 No bid No bid No bid 14.00 16.00 No bid 16.09
Coverall - Yellow, 10XL 17.99 No bid No bid No bid 14.00 16.00 No bid 16.09
Coverall - Yellow, 11XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 16.89
Coverall - Yellow, 12XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 17.74
Coverall - Yellow, 13XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 18.63
Coverall - Yellow, 14XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 19.56
Coverall - Yellow, 15XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 20.54
Coverall - Navy Bl, X-Sm 10.50 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.00 No bid 11.32
Coverall - Navy Bl, Sm 10.50 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.00 No bid 11.32
Coverall - Navy Bl, M 11.40 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.25 No bid 11.32
Coverall - Navy Bl, L 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 10.00 No bid 11.32
Coverall - Navy Bl, XL 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 11.00 No bid 11.32
Coverall - Navy Bl, 1XL 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 11.00 No bid 11.32
Coverall - Navy Bl, 2XL 13.00 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 11.40 No bid 11.32
Coverall - Navy Bl, 3XL 13.66 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 11.80 No bid 12.79
Coverall - Navy Bl, 4XL 13.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 12.20 No bid 12.79
Coverall - Navy Bl, 5XL 13.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 12.60 No bid 13.76
Coverall - Navy Bl, 6XL 15.55 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 13.00 No bid 13.76
Coverall - Navy Bl, 7XL 15.55 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.00 No bid 14.69
Coverall - Navy Bl, 8XL 15.55 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.00 No bid 14.69
Coverall - Navy Bl, 9XL 16.44 No bid No bid No bid 14.00 14.00 No bid 15.63
Coverall - Navy Bl, 10XL 17.99 No bid No bid No bid 14.00 14.00 No bid 15.63
Coverall - Navy Bl, 11XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 16.14
Coverall - Navy Bl, 12XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 17.23
Coverall - Navy Bl, 13XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 18.09
Coverall - Navy Bl, 14XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 19.00
Coverall - Navy Bl, 15XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 19.95
Coverall - Orange, X-Sm 10.50 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.00 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Orange, Sm 10.50 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.25 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Orange, M 11.40 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.75 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Orange, L 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 12.00 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Orange, XL 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 12.50 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Orange, 1XL 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 12.50 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Orange, 2XL 13.00 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 13.00 No bid 12.61
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Coverall - Orange, 3XL 13.66 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 13.50 No bid 13.35
Coverall - Orange, 4XL 13.66 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.00 No bid 13.35
Coverall - Orange, 5XL 13.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.50 No bid 13.99
Coverall - Orange, 6XL 14.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.50 No bid 13.99
Coverall - Orange, 7XL 14.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 16.00 No bid 15.07
Coverall - Orange, 8XL 14.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 16.00 No bid 15.07
Coverall - Orange, 9XL 16.44 No bid No bid No bid 14.00 16.00 No bid 16.09
Coverall - Orange, 10XL 16.75 No bid No bid No bid 14.00 16.00 No bid 16.09
Coverall - Orange, 11XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 16.89
Coverall - Orange, 12XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 17.74
Coverall - Orange, 13XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 18.63
Coverall - Orange, 14XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 19.56
Coverall - Orange, 15XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 19.00 No bid 20.54
Coverall - Red, X-Sm 10.50 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.00 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Red, Sm 12.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.00 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Red, M 13.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 9.25 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Red, L 13.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 10.00 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Red, XL 13.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 11.00 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Red, 1XL 13.00 No bid No bid No bid 9.60 11.00 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Red, 2XL 13.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 11.40 No bid 12.61
Coverall - Red, 3XL 13.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 11.80 No bid 13.35
Coverall - Red, 4XL 13.92 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 12.20 No bid 13.35
Coverall - Red, 5XL 15.44 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 12.60 No bid 13.99
Coverall - Red, 6XL 16.35 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 13.00 No bid 13.99
Coverall - Red, 7XL 16.35 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.00 No bid 15.07
Coverall - Red, 8XL 17.44 No bid No bid No bid 10.40 14.00 No bid 15.07
Coverall - Red, 9XL 17.44 No bid No bid No bid 14.00 14.00 No bid 16.09
Coverall - Red, 10XL 18.75 No bid No bid No bid 14.00 14.00 No bid 16.09
Coverall - Red, 11XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 16.89
Coverall - Red, 12XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 17.74
Coverall - Red, 13XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 18.63
Coverall - Red, 14XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 19.56
Coverall - Red, 15XL No bid No bid No bid No bid 14.00 17.00 No bid 20.54

2 Navy Cruiser Shoes, 5 No bid No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 6 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 7 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 8 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 9 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 10 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 11 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 12 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 13 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 14 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44
Navy Cruiser Shoes, 15 4.88 No bid 2.90 2.89 2.88 4.37 No bid 6.44

3 Shower Shoes Pr - 5 No bid No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 6 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
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Shower Shoes Pr - 7 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 8 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 9 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 10 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 11 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 12 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 13 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 14 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 15 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59
Shower Shoes Pr - 16 1.23 No bid 1.36 1.36 1.33 1.67 No bid 2.59

4 Nightshirt - S 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 7.40 12.00 No bid 6.50 Item 4
Nightshirt - M 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 7.40 12.00 No bid 6.50 Bob Barker - this is a cotton jersey knit.
Nightshirt - L 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 7.40 12.00 No bid 6.50 Uniforms Mfg. - light colors only
Nightshirt - 1XL 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 7.40 12.00 No bid 6.50
Nightshirt - 2XL 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 7.40 12.00 No bid 7.48
Nightshirt - 3XL 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 7.40 12.00 No bid 8.45
Nightshirt - 4XL 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 9.00 12.00 No bid 9.43
Nightshirt - 5XL 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 9.00 12.00 No bid 10.40
Nightshirt - 6XL 5.18 No bid No bid No bid 9.00 12.00 No bid 11.38

4A MH Gown - S No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 5.53
MH Gown - M No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 5.53
MH Gown - L No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 5.53
MH Gown - 1XL No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 5.85
MH Gown - 2XL No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 5.85
MH Gown - 3XL No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 5.85
MH Gown - 4XL No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 7.15
MH Gown - 5XL No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 7.15
MH Gown - 6XL No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 7.15

5 Mattress 46.48 No bid 39.36 No bid 34.40 39.00 No bid No bid Item 5 ICS - light green.

6 Mattress Cover 6.95 No bid 5.90 No bid 6.96 6.40 No bid No bid Item 6 Bob Barker - sold by the dozen.

7 Blanket 8.11 9.72 7.18 No bid 7.20 15.00 5.75 8.71 Item 7 Bob Barker - 2.5 lb.

8 Bath Towel (doz.) 17.81 16.39 11.54 No bid 16.99 14.80 9.25 20.24 Item 8 Carolina - 25 doz. Bale.
ICS - size 20"x40"
Charm-Tex - size 20"x20"

9 Laundry Bag 1.59 2.31 1.83 No bid 26.00 2.50 No bid 2.03 Item 9 Bob Barker - size is 18"x24"; sold by doz.
Carolina - Size is 24"x36"
Charm-Tex - Size is 24"x36"



VENDORS

1 Bob Barker 5 ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
134 N. Main Street PO Box 21056
Fuquay-Vienna, NC  27526 Waco, TX  76702
Attn:  Allison Wilmesmeier Attn:  Michelle Markum
Phone:  800-334-9880 Phone:  800-524-5427
Fax:  800-322-7537 Fax:  254-751-0299
allisonwilmesmeier@bobbarker.com icswaco@hotmail.com

2 Carolina Textiles 6 Robinson Textiles
PO Box 11211 152 West Walnut, #250
Charlotte, NC  28220 Gardena, CA  90248
Attn:  Bob Jones Attn:  Gary Lovemark
Phone:  704-525-1272 Phone:  800-421-5582
Fax:  704-525-0607 Fax:  800-370-7019
carolinatextiles@netzero.com robtexemail@aol.com

3 Charm-Tex 7 Tabb Textile Co., Inc.
1618 Coney Island Ave. 511 Pleasant Drive
Brooklyn, NY  11230 Opelika, AL  36801
Attn:  Stan Danzger Attn:  Marsha Thrift
Phone:  718-252-8100 Phone:  334-745-6762
Fax:  718-258-8303 Fax:  334-745-2377
Stan@charm-tex.com tabb@textilegroup.net

4 Gold Water Industries 8 Uniform Manufacturing
17221 S. Western Ave. PO Box 12716
Gardena, CA  90247 Scottsdale, AZ  85267
Attn:  Jack Wang Attn:  Emily Pelligreen
Phone:  310-538-4560 Phone:  480-368-9316
Fax:  310-538-5169 Fax:  480-368-8556
bids@goldwaterusa.com emily@umidirect.com


