IFB 12-036/JW - Term Contract for Inmate Clothing & Supplies for Jefferson County

FINAL TABULATION

AOSS Medical Bob Barker Company Carolina Textiles |Charm-Tex Gold Water ICS Jail Supplies
Item|Description Industries
1 [Inmate Coveralls Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Coverall - Yellow, X-Sm No Bid $10.88 * No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Yellow, Sm No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Yellow, M No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Yellow, L No Bid $11.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Yellow, XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Yellow, 1XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Yellow, 2XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Yellow, 3XL No Bid $12.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Yellow, 4XL No Bid $13.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Yellow, 5XL No Bid $13.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Yellow, 6XL No Bid $14.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Yellow, 7XL No Bid $14.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Yellow, 8XL No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Yellow, 9XL No Bid $15.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Yellow, 10XL No Bid $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Yellow, 11XL No Bid $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Yellow, 12XL No Bid $17.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Yellow, 13XL No Bid $17.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Yellow, 14XL No Bid $20.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Yellow, 15XL No Bid $23.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Navy BI, X-Sm No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Navy Bl, Sm No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Navy Bl, M No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Navy BI, L No Bid $11.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Navy BI, XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Navy BI, 1XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58
Coverall - Navy BI, 2XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Navy BI, 3XL No Bid $12.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Navy BI, 4XL No Bid $13.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Navy BI, 5XL No Bid $13.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38




Coverall - Navy BI, 6XL No Bid $14.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Navy BI, 7XL No Bid $14.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Navy BI, 8XL No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Navy BI, 9XL No Bid $15.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Navy Bl, 10XL No Bid $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Navy BI, 11XL No Bid $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Navy Bl, 12XL No Bid $17.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Navy BI, 13XL No Bid $17.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Navy Bl, 14XL No Bid $20.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Navy BI, 15XL No Bid $23.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
ltem|Description AOSS Medical Bob Barker Company Carolina Textiles Charm-Tex ﬁ?jljg\'::fsr ICS Jail Supplies
1 [Inmate Coveralls Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Coverall - Orange, X-Sm No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Orange, Sm No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Orange, M No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Orange, L No Bid $11.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Orange, XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Orange, 1XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Orange, 2XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Orange, 3XL No Bid $12.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Orange, 4XL No Bid $13.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Orange, 5XL No Bid $13.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Orange, 6XL No Bid $14.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Orange, 7XL No Bid $14.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Orange, 8XL No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38




Coverall - Orange, 9XL No Bid $15.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Orange, 10XL No Bid $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Orange, 11XL No Bid $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Orange, 12XL No Bid $17.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Orange, 13XL No Bid $17.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Orange, 14XL No Bid $20.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Orange, 15XL No Bid $23.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Red, X-Sm No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Red, Sm No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Red, M No Bid $10.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Red, L No Bid $11.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Red, XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Red, 1XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.58

Coverall - Red, 2XL No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Red, 3XL No Bid $12.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Red, 4XL No Bid $13.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Red, 5XL No Bid $13.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Red, 6XL No Bid $14.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Red, 7XL No Bid $14.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Red, 8XL No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.38
Coverall - Red, 9XL No Bid $15.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Red, 10XL No Bid $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Red, 11XL No Bid $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Red, 12XL No Bid $17.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Red, 13XL No Bid $17.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Red, 14XL No Bid $20.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98
Coverall - Red, 15XL No Bid $23.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.98




L AOSS Medical Bob Barker Company Carolina Textiles Charm-Tex Goldwqter ICS Jail Supplies
[tem|Description Industries
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
2 |Deck Shoe with Toecap (per Pair) (per Pair) (per Pair) (per Pair) (per Pair) (per Pair)
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 5 No Bid $5.44 * No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 6 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 7 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 8 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 9 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 10 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 11 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 12 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 13 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 14 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
Navy Cruiser Shoes, Size 15 No Bid $5.44 No Bid $4.18 $3.15 $4.42
3 |[Night Shirt - Female Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Nightshirt - S No Bid $4.88 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nightshirt - M No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nightshirt - L No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nightshirt - 1XL No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nightshirt - 2XL No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nightshirt - 3XL No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nightshirt - 4XL No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nightshirt - 5XL No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nightshirt - 6 XL No Bid $4.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 [Mattress Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No Bid $44.00 * No Bid $36.18 * No Bid $34.38
5 |Mattress Cover |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price




|No Bid |$16.22 * |No Bid |$5.90 * No Bid $9.86
Inmate Blanket Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
$9.00 $6.77 * $7.83 * $6.36 * No Bid $5.74
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Inmate Bath Towel (per Dozen) (per Dozen) (per Dozen) (per Dozen) (per Dozen) (per Dozen)
$12.00 * $12.41 * $15.92 * $10.90 * No Bid $9.24 *
Laundry Bag Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
$4.90 * $1.59 * $2.53 $1.57 * No Bid $1.59
Bidder Notes * AOSS: * Bob Barker: * Carolina Textiles: |* Charm-Tex: * Goldwater: * |CS:
Iltem 7: Size: 20" X 40" |ltem 1: Note: Size XS, 5XL, 7XL, [ltem 6: 50 ea.Bale Pack [ltem 4: MT1IDENS3075Y ([N/A Item 7: Size: 20" X 40"

Item 8: Size: 18 X 24,
84-1824 WT

OXL, 11XL, 12XL, 13XL, 14XL,
15XL, have a minimum order
requirement of 6 each. Sample
Enclosed. Yellow: 24223 Navy
Blue:24212 Orange: OJS Red:
24217

Item 2: BBC #355NV

Item 3: BBC #NWNGP/NWNGR
This item is a Cotton Jersey Knit.

Item 7: 250 or Bale

Item 5: MC130756 TW1IH
Item 6: snag free

Item 7: BT2040S1SE
Size: 20 X 40

ltem 8: BAG-SL182YWT
Size: 18" X 24"




Item 4: BBC #PMP30754
Item 5: BBC #JVMC3075AW
Item 6: BBC #BLSFW, 2.5 |b
Item 7: BBC #BT2040, 5 Ib.
Item 8: BBC #W1824

Size: Item is 19" X 24"
Sold by Dozen Only ($19.08)

AOSS Medical

4971 Central Avenue

Monroe, LA 71203

318-325-8290 phone

3 18-325-8299 fax

Attn: Linda Liew Ipruettaoss@aol.com

Bob Barker Company, Inc.

134 N Main Street

Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526

800-334-9880 phone 800-322-7537 fax

Attn: Allison Wilmesmeier allisonwilmesmeier@bobbarker.com

Carolina Textiles

O Box 11211

Charlotte, NC 28220

704-525-1272 phone 704-525-0607 fax

Attn: Bob Jones CarolinaTextiles@netzero.com

Charm-Tex

1618 Coney Island Ave.

Brooklyn, NY 11230

718-252-8100 phone 718-258-8303 fax
Attn: Stan Danzer stan@charm-tex.com

Gold Water Industries, Inc.

17221 S. Western Ave.

Gardena, CA 90247

310-538-4560 phone 310-538-0644 fax

Attn: David Wang sales@goldwaterusa.com

Justin Trend

6900 Capitol View Ct

Johnston, 1A 50131

515-707-1744 phone 515-331-9072 fax

Attn: Lakshman "Cal" Kalwani ckalwani@justintrend.com

Kentron Healthcare, Inc.

PO Box 120

Springfield, TN 37172

615-384-0573 phone  615-384-0574 fax

Attn: Nari Sadarangani kentron@kentronmedical.com

Robinson Textiles

152 W. Walnut St., Ste. 250

Gardena, CA 90248

800-421-5582 phone 800-370-7019 fax
Attn: Jennifer Kutsch robtexemail@aol.com

Shoe Corp of Birmingham

125-45th Place North

Birmingham, AL 35222

205-326-2800 phone 205-326-2808 fax

Attn:James F. Calhoun procurement@shoecorp.com

Tabb Textile Co., Inc.

511 Pleasant Drive

Opelika, AL 36801

334-745-6762 phone 334-745-2377 fax
Attn: Marsha Thrift tabb@textilegroup.net




ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.

P O Box 21056

Waco, TX 76702-1056

800-524-5427 phone 254-751-0299 fax
Attn: J. M. Bogan, Il

bids@icswaco.com

Uniforms Manufacturing

P O Box 12716

Scottsdale, AZ 85267-2716
480-368-9316 phone 480-368-8556 fax
Attn: Emily Pelligreen
emily@umidirect.com



Page 1 of 4

Justin Kentron Robinson |Shoe Corp |Tabb Uniforms
Trend Healthcare |Textiles Textile Manufacturing
Unit Price [Unit Price Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price
$9.25 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.25 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.50 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $12.55
$11.00 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $12.55
$11.00 No Bid $12.40 No Bid No Bid $13.81
$11.50 No Bid $12.90 No Bid No Bid $13.81
$11.50 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $15.20
$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $15.20
$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $16.75
$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $16.75
$14.25 No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $18.45
$14.50 No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $18.45
$14.50 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $20.30
$14.50 No Bid $19.00 No Bid No Bid $20.30
$14.50 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $23.00
$9.25 No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $10.30
$9.25 No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $10.30
$9.50 No Bid $9.75 No Bid No Bid $10.30
$9.50 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $10.30
$10.50 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $10.30
$10.50 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $10.30
$10.50 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $10.30
$10.50 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.35
$11.00 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.35
$11.00 No Bid $11.40 No Bid No Bid $12.50




$11.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $12.50
$11.50 No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid $13.75
$14.25 No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid $13.75
$14.25 No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid $15.15
$14.25 No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid $15.15
$14.25 No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid $16.70
$14.50 No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $16.70
$14.50 No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $18.40
$14.50 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $18.40
$14.50 No Bid $19.00 No Bid No Bid $21.00
Just In Kentron Robinson . Uniforms
Trend Health Care |Textiles Shoe Corp | Tabb Textile Manufacturing
Unit Price |Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
$9.25 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.25 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.50 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $12.55
$11.00 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $12.55
$11.00 No Bid $12.40 No Bid No Bid $13.81
$11.50 No Bid $12.90 No Bid No Bid $13.81
$11.50 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $15.20
$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $15.20




$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $16.75
$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $16.75
$14.25 No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $18.45
$14.50 No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $18.45
$14.50 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $20.30
$14.50 No Bid $19.00 No Bid No Bid $20.30
$14.50 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $23.00
$9.25 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.25 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.50 No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$9.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $11.40
$10.50 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $12.55
$11.00 No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid $12.55
$11.00 No Bid $12.40 No Bid No Bid $13.81
$11.50 No Bid $12.90 No Bid No Bid $13.81
$11.50 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $15.20
$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $15.20
$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $16.75
$14.25 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid $16.75
$14.25 No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid $18.45
$14.50 No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $18.45
$14.50 No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $20.30
$14.50 No Bid $19.00 No Bid No Bid $20.30
$14.50 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $23.00




Just In Kentron Robinson .. |Uniforms
Trend Health Care |Textiles Shoe Corp | Tabb Textile Manufacturing
Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price [Unit Price |Unit Price
(per Pair) [(per Pair) (per Pair) |(per Pair) [(per Pair) [(per Pair)
No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $4.13 No Bid $6.40
Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price [Unit Price |Unit Price
No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $7.15

No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $7.15

No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $7.15

No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $7.15

No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid $7.15

No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $7.85

No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $7.85

No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $8.65

No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid $8.65
|Unit Price |Unit Price  [Unit Price [Unit Price [Unit Price [Unit Price
No Bid No Bid $44.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

|Unit Price [ Unit Price [Unit Price [Unit Price |Unit Price [Unit Price




NoBid  [$15.69 $12.63 No Bid [No Bid |No Bid

Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price [Unit Price |Unit Price

No Bid No Bid $8.95 No Bid $5.70 $17.00

Unit Price |Unit Price Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price

(per Dozen) [(per Dozen) (per Dozen) (per Dozen) [(per Dozen) (per Dozen)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.20 $15.15 *

Unit Price |Unit Price Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price |Unit Price

No Bid $1.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.00

Trend: * Kentron: * Robinson: |* Shoe Corp:|* Tabb: * Uniforms Manu.:
N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A ltem 7: Size: 20" X 40"










