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FINAL Bid Tabulation
I. Paper Stock Bosworth Papers, Inc. Hernandez Office Supply Olmsted Kirk Paper Co.
Manufacturer  |Unit Price [Sheets per |Unit Price Manufacturer  |Unit Price Per |Sheets per [Unit Price  [Manufacturer |Unit Price [Sheets per |Unit Price
Item |Description & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white Unit Price
8v4x11, PerM
1 [Paper grade: Premium #4 G.P. Spectrum $6.27 5/m $31.35|Business Choice  [Not Given 5,000 $29.50]Suzano One $5.85 5,000 $29.35
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white
8v4x11,
3-hole punched —
2 |Paper grade: Premium #4 G.P. Spectrum $6.73 5/m $33.65 No Bid No Bid JIP Tidal $6.70 5,000 $33.50
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white
8Y2x14,
3 |Paper grade:Premium #4 G.P. Spectrum $8.57 5/m $42.85 No Bid No Bid JIP Tidal $8.52 5,000 $42.60
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white
11x17,
4 |Paper grade: Premium #4 G.P. Spectrum $13.47 2,500 $33.67 No Bid No Bid 1P Tidal $13.40 2,500 $33.50
24 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white
82x11, Hammermill Laser
5 |Paper grade: Laser Print #1 Print $10.73 5/m $53.65 No Bid No Bid J!P Hammermill $10.10 5,000 $50.50
24 |b. Bond Paper, long grain, white
8Y2x14, Hammermill Laser
6 |Paper grade: Laser Print #1 Print $13.65 5/m $68.25 No Bid No Bid IP Hammermill $12.82 5,000 $64.10
Domtar
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors Earth Choice
(peach, orchid, cherry, ivory, grey), 8%2x11 Note: peach not
— ream wrap only (combined total), Iavail. sub w/
7 |Paper grade: premium #4 salmon $8.07 5/m $40.35 No Bid No Bid IP Hammermill $8.47 5,000 $42.35
Domtar
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors Earth Choice
(peach, orchid, cherry, ivory, grey), 8¥2x14 [Note: peach
— ream wrap only (combined total), not avail. sub w/
8 |Paper grade: Premium #4 Jsalmon $10.85 5/m $54.25 No Bid No Bid IP Hammermiill $11.35 5,000 $56.75
20 Ib. Bond Paper, colors (buff, salmon,
goldenrod, pink, blue, canary, green), Domtar
9 |[8%xl1l Earth Choice $8.07 5/m $40.35 No Bid No Bid IP Hammermiill $8.47 5,000 $42.35
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors
(ivory, goldenrod, pink, blue, canary, Domtar
10 |green), 8%x14 Earth Choice $10.85 5/m $54.25 No Bid No Bid IP Hammermill $11.35 5,000 $56.75
20 Ib. Bond Paper, 25% rag, long grain,
cockle finish, white, 8%x11.
11 |Paper grade: #1 Neenah $20.09 5/m|  $100.45 No Bid No Bid Neenah Atlas $17.61 5,000 $88.05
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I. Paper Stock (Cont'd) Bosworth Papers, Inc. Hernandez Supply Olmsted Kirk Paper Co.
Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price Sheets per |Unit Price  [Manufacturer |Unit Price |Sheets per |Unit Price
Item [Description & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand PerM case Per Case |& Brand PerM case Per Case
20 Ib. Bond Paper, 25% rag, long grain,
cockle finish, white, 8¥2x14.
12 [Paper grade: #1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Neenah Atlas $36.50 5,000] $182.50
Bosworth Papers, Inc. Hernandez Office Supply Omsted Kirk Paper Co.
Il. Card Stock
Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price Per |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price [Sheets per [Unit Price
Item [Description & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Per Case |& Brand PerM case Per Case
67 Ib. Vellum cover stock (white) 8¥2x11,
shrink wrap acceptable (combined total). JDomtar
13 |Paper grade: #4 EarthChoice $15.32 2/m $30.64 No Bid No Bid IP Springhill $16.64 2,000 $33.28
67 Ib. Vellum cover stock (aqua, green, Domtar
gold, blue, pink, ivory, yellow, grey) Earth Choice
8Y2x11, shrink wrap acceptable Note: Aqua Not IP Springhill
14 |(com-bined total). Paper grade: #4 Avalil. $16.23 2/m $32.46 No Bid No Bid Note: Aqua N/A. $17.52 2,000 $35.04
20 Ib. #1 White Sulfite, long grain white,
8%2x11 Hammermill.
15 |Paper grade: Grade 1 watermark Hammermill Bond $8.83 5/m $44.15 No Bid No Bid IP Hammermill $10.60 5,000 $53.00
16 |8%2x14 100 Ib. manila Springhill tag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid IP Springhill $40.90 2,000 $81.80
17 |8x8 110 Ib. Springhill index white No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid P Springhill $27.50 2,000  $55.00
Hammermill accent opaque 28/70 Ib. white|
18 |- vellum finish, long grain, 8%x11 Lynx Domtar $10.49 4/m $41.96 No Bid No Bid IP Accent $10.80 4,000 $43.20
Brite Hue — 60 Ib. text & cover 8%2x11 (red,JNeenah Neenah
19 |violet, green, orange, ultra fuchsia) Astrobrights $15.90 5/m $79.50 No Bid No Bid Astrobright $16.22 5,000 $81.10
#80 8%x11 Classic Crest Avon Brilliant Neenah
20 |White Neenah Crest $61.80 2/m $123.60 No Bid No Bid Classic Crest $60.45 2,000 $120.90
Note: sub w/ Neenah
21 |#80 8%:x11 Classic Crest Avon Ivory Bouonial Ivory $62.80 2/m $125.60 No Bid No Bid Classic Crest $61.44 2,000 $122.88
Olmsted-Kirk
80 Ib, Starwhite Smooth Text Archiva,
22 [8vex11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Neenah Starwhite| — $38.64 2,000{  $77.28]
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Bosworth Papers, Inc. Hernandez Supply Omsted Kirk Paper Co.
lll. Envelopes
Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Envelopes |Unit Price  |Manufacturer [Unit Price Per [Envelopes |Unit Price |Manufacturer |[Unit Price [Envelopes |Unit Price
Item |Description & Brand Per M per case Per Case & Brand M per case Per Case & Brand Per M per case Per Case
24 Ib. catalog envelopes 10"x13” white
23 |woven Independence $63.30 500 $31.65 No Bid No Bid (Cenveo OKCO $56.30 500 $28.15
24 |28 Ib. white catalog envelopes 9"x12" Independence $53.66 500 $26.83 No Bid No Bid Cenveo OKCO $47.22 500 $23.60,
15"x10” brown kraft gummed flap
document
25 |env. 32# No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Cenveo $44.31 100| $443.12
#9 window envelopes — Bosworth Incomplete
26 |24 Ib. white wove Papers, Inc. Price Given 2,500 $56.60 No Bid No Bid Cenveo OKCO $18.00 2,500 $45.00,
#9 regular envelopes — Bosworth
27 |24 Ib. white wove Papers, Inc. $19.98 2,500 $49.95 No Bid No Bid Cenveo OKCO $15.50 2,500 $38.75
#10 window envelopes —
24 Ib. white wove Bosworth
28 |(hard boxes) Papers, Inc. $22.64 2,500 $56.60 No Bid No Bid (Cenveo OKCO $18.00 2,500 $45.00
#10 regular envelopes—
24 Ib. white wove Bosworth
29 |(hard boxes) Papers, Inc. $19.98 2,500 $49.95 No Bid No Bid Cenveo OKCO $15.50 2,500 $38.75
#11 window envelopes — Bosworth
30 (28 Ib. white wove Papers, Inc. $37.80 2,500 $94.50 No Bid No Bid Cenveo OKCO $137.12 2,500 $342.80
#11 regular envelopes — Bosworth
31 |28 Ib. white wove Papers, Inc. $35.00 2,500 $87.50 No Bid No Bid Cenveo $104.70 2,500| $261.75
Bosworth Papers, Inc. Hernandez Office Supply Omsted Kirk Paper Co.
lll. Envelopes
Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Envelopes |Unit Price Manufacturer |Unit Price Per |Envelopes |Unit Price |Manufacturer |Unit Price [Envelopes |Unit Price
Item |Description & Brand Per M per case Per Case & Brand M per case Per Case & Brand Per M per case Per Case
#12 window envelopes —
32 |24 Ib. white wove No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Cenveo $48.50 2,500 $121.25
#12 regular envelopes — Bosworth
33 |24 Ib. white wove Papers, Inc. $47.62 2,500 $119.05 No Bid No Bid Cenveo $44.56 2,500| $111.40
JEosworth
34 [#10 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. Papers, Inc. $25.72 2,500 $64.30 No Bid No Bid Cenveo $56.74 2,500| $141.85
Bosworth
35 [#12 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. Papers, Inc. $61.26 2,500| $153.15 No Bid No Bid Cenveo $57.86 2,500| $144.65
36 [#14 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Cenveo $114.30 2,500| $285.75
Opaque envelopes - 4%2x9 (blue, green,
natural, cream, gold, pink, gray, ivory, Domtar Cenveo
37 |vellow) Earth Choice $27.52 2,500 $68.80 No Bid No Bid Springhill $24.00 2,500  $60.00




IV. No Carbon Required Paper
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Bosworth Papers, Inc.

Hernandez Office Supply

Olmsted Kirk Paper Co.

Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price Per |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price [Sheets per [Unit Price
Item |Description & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Per Case |& Brand Per M case Per Case
Appvion
38 |8%x11 CFB white-black image long grain [Superior $43.27 5/m $216.35 No Bid No Bid Appvion NCR $26.05 5,000 $130.25
Appvion
39 |8%2x14 CFB white-black image long grain [Superior $54.99 5/m $274.95 No Bid No Bid Appvion NCR $33.11 5,000 $165.55
8Y2x11 2-part black image carbonless Appvion
40 [reverse collated Superior $29.42 5/m| $147.10 No Bid No Bid Appvion NCR $19.18 5,000 $95.90
8vx11 Mead 3-part black image Appvion
41 |carbonless reverse collated Superior $33.09 5/m $165.45 No Bid No Bid Appvion NCR $21.58 5,000 $107.90
8%2x11 Mead 4-part black image Appvion
42 |carbonless reverse collated Superior $35.36 5/m $176.80 No Bid No Bid Appvion NCR $23.07 5,000 $115.35
8%2x11 Mead 5-part black image Appvion
43 |carbonless reverse collated Superior $36.36 5/m $181.80 No Bid No Bid Appvion NCR $23.72 5,000( $118.60
8Y2x14 Mead 2-part black image Appvion
44 |carbonless reverse collated Superior $37.40 5/m $187.00 No Bid No Bid Appvion NCR $24.40 5,000 $122.00
8v2x14 Mead 3-part black image Appvion
45 |carbonless reverse collated Superior $42.04 5/m $210.20 No Bid No Bid Appvion NCR $27.42 5,000 $137.10
8v2x14 Mead 4-part black image Appvion
46 |carbonless reverse collated Superior $44.95 5/m $224.75 No Bid No Bid [Appvion NCR $29.33 5,000| $146.65
Bosworth Papers, Inc. Hernandez Office Supply Olmsted Kirk Paper Co.
IV. No Carbon Required Paper
Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Sheets per |Unit Price Manufacturer |Unit Price Per |Sheets per [Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price [Sheets per |Unit Price
Item |Description & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case
8Y2x14 Mead 5-part black image Appvion
47 |carbonless reverse collated Superior $46.32 5/m $231.60 No Bid No Bid [Appvion NCR $30.22 5,000| $151.10
Neenah Neenah
48 |8%2x11 Astro Bright Text, 60T Astrobrights $15.90 5/m $79.50 No Bid No Bid Astrobright $16.19 5,000 $80.95
Neenah Neenah
49 |8%2x11 Astro Bright Cover, 65C Astrobrights $31.57 2/m $62.94 No Bid No Bid Astrobright $25.22 2,000 $50.44




V. Specialty Paper
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Bosworth Papers, Inc.

Hernandez Office Supply

Olmsted Kirk Paper Co.

Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price Per |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price [Sheets per [Unit Price
Item [Description & Brand Per M case Per Case  |& Brand M case Per Case |& Brand PerM case Per Case
36 Ib. Weston Ledger or Equal, 8¥2x14
50 [Marriage License Stock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Neenah Weston $90.06 2,000| $180.12

Bosworth Papers, Inc.
10425 Okanella St., Ste. 600
Houston, TX 77041

Contact: Maureen Shields

713-460-5060 phone
713-460-2037 fax
customerservice@bosworthpapers.cc christyw@hernandezsupply.com

Hernandez Supply

119 17th Street
Nederland, TX 77627
contact: Christy Williams
409-724-0135 phone
409-724-0210 fax

Olmsted Kirk Paper Co.
1601 Valley View

Dallas, TX 75234
Contact: Alan Proctor
214-637-7146 phone
214-537-2131 fax
aproctor@okpaper.com
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