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Term Contract for Trash and Biomedical Waste Container Service for Jefferson County

Final Tabulation

Item I.  Standard Waste Containers (10 cubic yards & under)

Cyntox                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

LLC

Excel                           

Medical                    

Waste

Industrial                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

Transportation            

Waste LLC

Republic                

Services                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                   

of Beaumont

*Sprint Waste                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Services LLP

Waste              

Management                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

of Texas

Location Qty Capacity

Frequency                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           

of Service

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Jack Brooks Regional Airport-Main Terminal 1 8 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.60 $167.33 $129.89

Jefferson Cty Airport-Fuel Service 1 8 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.60 $167.33 $129.89

Jefferson Cty Airport-Maintenance Shop 1 8 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.60 $167.33 $129.89

Jefferson Cty Annex I 1 10 cu yd 5 days per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $455.00 $1,041.74 $662.10

Jefferson Cty Annex II 1 10 cu yd 5 days per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $455.00 $1,041.74 $662.10

Jefferson Cty Annex IV 1 10 cu yd 5 days per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $455.00 $1,041.74 $662.10

Jefferson Cty Correctional Facility 1 4 cu yd 2 days per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 $166.68 $133.89

Jefferson Cty Mosquito Control District 1 8 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.60 $166.68 $129.89

Jefferson Cty Women's Center 1 10 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.00 $208.35 $141.25

Jefferson Cty-Service Center 1 8 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.60 $166.68 $129.89

Jefferson Cty-Pct #1 Service Center 1 4 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 $112.49 $100.88

Jefferson Cty-Pct #2 Service Center 1 8 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.60 $166.68 $129.89

Mid-County Office Building 1 8 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.60 $166.68 $129.89

Jefferson Cty-Pct #4 Justice of the Peace 1 6 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.50 $118.12 $111.59

Jefferson Cty-Pct #4 Service Center 1 4 cu yd 2 days per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 $166.68 $133.89

Minnie Rogers Juvenile Justice Center 1 10 cu yd 5 days per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $455.00 $1,041.74 $662.10

Ben J. Rogers Regional Visitors Center 1 8 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.60 $166.68 $129.89 *Sprint - Compactor Repairs will be billed at cost plus 15%

Jefferson Cty-Sheriff's Dept. Narcotics Div. 1 4 cu yd 1 day per wk No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 $83.34 $100.88

Item II.  Standard Waste Containers (Roll-Off)

Cyntox                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

LLC

Excel                           

Medical                    

Waste

Industrial                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

Transportation            

Waste LLC

Republic                

Services                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                   

of Beaumont

*Sprint Waste                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Services LLP

Waste              

Management                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

of Texas

Location Qty.Capacity

Frequency                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           

of Service

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Jack Brooks Regional Airport-Maint. Shop 1 30 cu yd "Will Call" No Bid No Bid $360.00 $365.00 $638.00 $375.00

Jefferson County Correctional Facility 1 40 cu yd "Will Call" No Bid No Bid $430.00 $400.00 $638.00 $400.00

Ford Park Arena 1 40 cu yd "Will Call" No Bid No Bid $430.00 $400.00 $530.00 $400.00

Ford Park Baseball Fields 2 20 cu yd "Will Call" No Bid No Bid $290.00/each $400.00 $398.00 $317.00

Item III.  Compactor (Roll-Off)

Cyntox                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

LLC

Excel                           

Medical                    

Waste

Industrial                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

Transportation            

Waste LLC

Republic                

Services                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                   

of Beaumont

*Sprint Waste                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Services LLP

Waste              

Management                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

of Texas

Location Qty.Capacity

Frequency                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           

of Service

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Price                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

Jefferson Cty Correctional Facility 1 30 cu yd "Will Call" No Bid No Bid $360.00 $475.00 $794.00 $450.00 *Sprint - Compactor  Monthly Rent will be $566 per month each

Ford Park Arena 1 30 cu yd "Will Call" No Bid No Bid $360.00 $475.00 $686.00 $450.00

*Sprint - Labor for Compactor Repairs                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         

will be billed at $75 per hours, rate is Portal to Portal
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Term Contract for Trash and Biomedical Waste Container Service for Jefferson County

Final Tabulation (Continued)

Item IV.  Container for Recycling Cardboard

Cyntox                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

LLC

Excel                           

Medical                    

Waste

Industrial                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

Transportation            

Waste LLC

Republic                

Services                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                   

of Beaumont

Sprint Waste                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                    

Services LLP

Waste              

Management                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

of Texas

Location Qty.Capacity

Frequency                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                           

of Service

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Ford Park Arena 1 8 cu yd "Will Call" No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.00 $230.00 $129.89

Item V.  Biomedical Waste Containers

Location Qty.Capacity

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

per Haul

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

per Haul

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

per Haul

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

per Haul

Price per 

Container                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

per Month

Public Health Dept (Beaumont) Annex II 1 30 lb $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $59.82 $54.00 $45.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Public Health Dept (Port Arthur) 1 30lb $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $59.82 $54.00 $45.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Jefferson County Regional Crime Laboratory 6 30 lb $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $47.85 $90.00 $45.00 $290.00 No Bid No Bid

Jefferson County Employee Health 1 30 lb $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $59.82 $54.00 $45.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Community Supervision-Port Arthur 1 30 lb $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $59.82 $54.00 $45.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Community Supervision-Beaumont 1 30 lb $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $59.82 $54.00 $45.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Jefferson County Women's Center 1 30 lb $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $59.82 $54.00 $45.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Minnie Roger's Juvenile Justice Center 1 30 lb $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $59.82 $54.00 $45.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid

Cyntox LLC Republic Services of Beaumont

2105 W County Line Rd, Ste 1 2300 Hwy 365, Ste 400 6425 Hwy 347

Jackson NJ  08527 Nederland TX  77627 Beaumont TX  77705

Attn:  Shlomo Fried Attn:  Corey Belanger Attn:  Darrell Glenn

718-809-2942 phone 409-727-3335 phone 832-525-0977 phone

212-202-4209 fax 409-724-2911 fax 713-635-2276 fax

sfried@cyntox.com Corey.belanger@itwastellc.com dglenn@republicservices.com

Excel Medical Waste

6410 Long Drive 1000 South Business Park Drive 2175 W. Cardinal Drive

Houston TX  77087 Port Arthur TX  77640 Beaumont TX  77705

Attn:  Lee McMorries Attn:  Greg Gabriele Attn:  Terry Woodson

713-643-0110 phone 409-736-3600 phone 713-423-1762 phone

866-893-6947 fax 409-736-2530 866-233-7683 fax

lmcmorries@excelmedicalwaste.com ggabriel@sprintwaste.com twoodson@wm.com

Sprint Waste Services, LLP Waste Management of Texas

Industrial                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

Transportation Waste LLC

Waste Management                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

of TexasCyntox LLC

Excel                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                         

Medical Waste

Industrial                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                  

Transportation Waste LLC Republic Services                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                   of Beaumont

Sprint                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                             

Waste Services LLP
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