IFB 16-019/YS
Term Contract for Sheriff's Department (Jefferson County) Law Enforcement Equipment and Uniforms

Final Tabulation - August 17, 2016

Miller Uniforms & Emblems,

Item]Description 10-32 Supply Burgoon Company GT Distributors Galls, LLC ICS Jail Supplies Inc Inc. Texas Code Blue
1 Male Prestige Advance no bid no bid 68.59 74.00 no bid 75.79 68.00
Trouser - Elbeco Elbeco E494RN Elbeco E494RN Blauer 8560-04 Elbeco E494RN
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
2 Male Prestige Advance no bid no bid 64.43 57.00 no bid 69.23 60.00
Long Sleeve Shirt Elbeco #840N Elbeco 840N Blauer 8450-04 Elbeco 840N
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
3 Male Prestige Advance no bid no bid 61.29 52.00 no bid 62.47 54.00
Short Sleeve Shirt Elbeco #8840N Elbeco 8840N Blauer 8460-04 Elbeco 8840N
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
4 Female Prestige Advance no bid no bid 64.43 57.00 no bid 69.23 58.00
Long Sleeve Shirt Elbeco #9340LCN Elbeco 9840LCN Blauer 8450W-04 Elbeco 9340LCN
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
5 Female Prestige Advance no bid no bid 61.29 52.00 no bid 62.47 54.00
Short Sleeve Shirt Elbeco #9840LCN Elbeco 9840LCN Blauer 8460W-04 Elbeco 9840LCN
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
6 Female Prestige Advance no bid no bid 68.29 74.00 no bid 75.79 68.00
Trouser Elbeco Elbeco #E9494LCN Elbeco E9454LC Blauer 8560W-04 Elbeco 9494LCN
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
7 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/ no bid no bid 46.64 36.50 no bid 39.51 48.00
Zipper - Female Elbeco #9314LCN Elbeco 9314LCN Blauer 8600W-2-04 Elbeco Z9314LCN
Long Sleeve with zip
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
8 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/ no bid no bid 42.69 33.50 no bid 35.82 44.00
Zipper - Female Elbeco #Z9814LCN Elbeco Z9814LCN Blauer 8610W-2-04 Elbeco Z9814LCN
Short Sleeve
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
9 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/Zip no bid no bid 46.64 36.50 no bid 39.51 48.00
Male Long Sleeve Elbeco #Z314N Elbeco Z314N Blauer 8600-2-04 Elbeco Z314N
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
10 Elbeco Tex-Trop w/Zip no bid no bid 42.69 33.50 no bid 35.82 44.00
Male Short Sleeve Elbeco #23314N Elbeco Z3314N Blauer 8610-2-04 Elbeco Z3314N
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days




11 Male Tex-Trop Trouser no bid no bid 48.34 41.95 no bid 45.66 50.00
Style E314 Elbeco #E314RN Elbeco E314RN Blauer 8650-04 Elbeco E314RN
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
12 Elbeco Tex-Trop no bid no bid 46.64 34.00 no bid 44.51 48.00
Female Long Sleeve Elbeco #9314LCN Elbeco 9314LCN Blauer 8600W-04 Elbeco 9314LCN
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
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13 Elbeco Tex-Trop no bid no bid 41.17 31.00 no bid 40.82 44.00
Female Short Sleeve Elbeco #9814LCN Elbeco 9814LCN Blauer 8610W-04 Elbeco 9814LCN
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
14 Elbeco Tex-Trop no bid no bid 46.64 34.00 no bid 4451 48.00
Male Long Sleeve Elbeco #314N Elbeco 314N Blauer 8600-04 Elbeco 314N
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
15 Elbeco Tex-Trop no bid no bid 41.17 31.00 no bid 40.82 44.00
Male Short Sleeve Elbeco #3314N Elbeco 3314N Blauer 8610-04 Elbeco 3314N
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
16 Female Tex-Trop Trouser no bid no bid 48.34 41.95 no bid 45.66 50.00
Style E9314 Elbeco #E9314LC Elbeco E9314LC Blauer 8650W-04 Elbeco E9314LC
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
17 Jacket no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 114.00
Manufacturer/Style No. discontinued Elbeco 3800
Days to delivery
18 Polo Shirt no bid no bid 32.98 30.95 no bid 43.05 52.00
Manufacturer/Style No. 5.11 Tactical #41180-724 Cornerston CS410 Blauer 8139 Proper Polo
Days to delivery 14-28 days 15 days 15 days
19 Horace Small Sentry no bid no bid 62.83 19.90 no bid 78.90 48.00
Windbreaker Horace Small #HS 3426 Liberty 560MBK Horace Small HS3426 Dutyman/J31
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 7-14 days 15 days 15 days
20 Name Badge no bid no bid 10.95 10.95 no bid 13.00 16.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Blackington J2 Blackinton J2 Blackinton J2 Blackington J2
Days to delivery custom 15-30 days 15 days 20-30 days
21 Raincoat no bid no bid 63.48 107.49 no bid 70.32 124.00
Neese Industries Gerber 70C3 Neese 447RSC3M Spiewak S309
#447TRSC3M
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 14-28 days 15 days 15 days




48.25 (additional cost for size

22 Belt - Safariland Model 87 80.00 60.00 46 & up) 56.00 no bid no bid 25.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland Model 87 Safariland 87 G&G B59F4R
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days vendor rescinding bid on item
25.15 (additional cost for size
23 Belt - Safariland Model 99 39.00 34.00 46 & up) 28.66 no bid no bid 35.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland Model 99 Safariland 99 G&G B57
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
24 Belt - Safariland Model 852 no bid 30.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid 30.00
Manufacturer/Style No. 5.11 TACTICAL 59501 Perfect Fit PF-5000
Days to delivery 40 days
25 Cuff Case - Safariland 190 32.00 28.00 24.13 27.50 31.50 no bid 36.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland SAF-190-2B Safariland 190 Safariland 190 Safariland 190-2B
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days 10-14 days
26 Cuff Case - Safariland 090 28.00 32.00 18.71 21.33 25.00 no bid 34.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland SAF-090-1-16 Safariland 090 Safariland 090 Safariland 090-16
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days 10-14 days
Miller Uniforms & Emblems,
Item Description 10-32 Supply Burgoon Company GT Distributors Galls, LLC ICS Jail Supplies Inc Inc. Texas Code Blue
27 Baton Holder 15.00 24.00 20.47 20.66 no bid no bid 26.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland SAF-35-FXX-2 Safariland 35 Boston Leather 5490
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
28 Holster Level Ill Safariland 6360 190.00 139.00 139.59 155.00 no bid no bid 140.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland SAF-6360-832-61 Safariland 6360 Safariland 6360
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
29 Holster Level lll Safariland 070 195.00 155.00 131.87 170.00 no bid no bid 150.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland SAF-070-83-161 Safariland 070 Safariland 070
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
30 Double Magazine Holder Saf 70 40.00 32.00 26.48 30.17 no bid no bid 34.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland SAF-77-83-2PBL Safariland 77 G&G B627-7BR
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
31 Double Magazine Holder no bid 32.00 20.47 no bid no bid no bid 34.00
Safariland Model 75 Safariland Safariland SAF-75-83-2 G&G K617
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO
32 OC Spray Holder no bid 25.89 20.47 $23.33 no bid no bid 26.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Gould & Goodrich B681-3BR Safariland SAF-38-4-2B Safariland 38 Boston Leather BL5527-BR
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
33 Belt Keepers 20.00 14.00 4.54 no bid no bid no bid 14.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Safariland Safariland SAF-63-2B Boston Leather BL-5456-1-BR
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO
34 S.O. Lapel Pin no bid no bid 4.72 6.00 no bid 5.70 16.00
Manufacturer/Style No. BL-J110 Blackinton J110 Blackington BLA-J2

Days to delivery

<30 days ARO

Blackiinton J110
15-30 days

15 days




35 Traffic Vest no bid no bid no bid 36.01 no bid 39.35 44.00
Vizguard S912 Blauer 3395 Spiewak S912
Manufacturer/Style No.
Days to delivery 15-30 days 15 days
36 Handcuffs, Nickel 35.00 27.00 20.17 20.33 19.50 no bid 26.00
Manufacturer/Style No. S&W 100 Smith & Wesson SW-350103 Smith & Wesson model 100 Peerless M901P Smith & Wesson 100 Nickel
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days 7-10 days
37 Red Cone Stinger 12.00 8.49 3.76 5.00 no bid no bid 10.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 75903 STL-75903 Steamlight 75903 Streamlight 75903
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
38 Red Cone SL20 10.00 8.29 4.29 5.00 no bid no bid 10.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 22511 STL-22511 Streamlight SL20 Streamlight 22511
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
39 Stinger Flashlight no bid 110.00 124.06 118.00 no bid no bid 120.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 75014 STL-75024 Steamlight 758B Streamlight 75014
Days to delivery 15 days <30 day ARO 15-30 days
40 Stinger Flashlight Battery 24.00 24.00 12.70 16.00 no bid no bid 26.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 75175 STL-75175 Streamlight 75175 Empier D8005
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
41 stinger Flashlight Bulb 10.00 7.84 5.562 8.00 no bid no bid 8.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 75914 STL-75914 Streamlight 75914 Streamlight 75914
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO 15- 30 days
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42 Stinger Flashlight Lens Kit no bid 26.20 28.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 75956 STL-75160
Days to delivery 14 days <30 days ARO
43 Stinger DS LED - aluminum 150.00 131.75 87.24 118.00 no bid no bid 150.00
Manufacturer/Style No. ac/dc charger Streamlight 75813 STL-75866 Steamlight 75813 Streamlight 75454
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
44 Stinger DS LED - polymer no bid 125.00 91.84 no bid no bid no bid 134.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 76813 STL-76113 Streamlight 76813
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO
45 SC20XP LED Flashlight - alum. no bid 94.57 107.45 no bid no bid no bid 118.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 25103 STL-20203 Streamlight 25103
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO
46 SC20XP LED Flashlight - nylon no bid 121.55 87.17 102.00 no bid no bid 138.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Streamlight 20203 STL-25103 Streamlight 25103 Streamlight 20203
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
47 Maglite Flashlight 190.00 120.15 no bid 98.00 no bid no bid no bid
Manufacturer/Style No. LED System ASP 35625 w/battery charger Maglight RL1019
Days to delivery 15 days 15-30 days
48 Maglite Flashlight Battery 40.00 included in line 47 no bid 29.05 no bid no bid no bid
Manufacturer/Style No. Maglight ARX235
Days to delivery 15-30 days




49 Maglite Flashlight Bulb 11.00 included in line 47 no bid 5.00 no bid no bid no bid
Manufacturer/Style No. maglight LRO0001
Days to delivery 15-30 days
50 ASP Baton, Black 99.00 82.00 76.67 87.50 no bid no bid 86.00
Manufacturer/Style No. 21" ASP 52611 ASP-52611 ASP 52611 ASP EB52411 (21")
Days to delivery 15 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days
51 Kevlar Gloves no bid 42.99 33.58 no bid no bid no bid 32.00
Manufacturer/Style No. Damascus DSO150H-B DAM-DMZ33-B Strong Suit Enforcer
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO
52 Leg Irons, Standard 64.00 52.00 37.05 36.00 33.75 no bid 54.00
Manufacturer/Style No. S&W S&W model 1900 SW-350121 Smith & Wesson 1900 Peeless M902 Smith & Warren D2950
Days to delivery 40 days <30 days ARO 15-30 days 7-10 days
53 Molded One-Piece Seat Org. no bid no bid 30.65 42.66 no bid no bid 70.00
Manufacturer/Style No. GT-BR-017 Galls VEO46 Proguard D2952
Days to delivery <30 days ARO 15-30 days
54 Additional ltems (% off) no bid 10% 15% 10% 5% various 28%
GT catalog or website
Days to delivery varies 15 days
55 Ballistic Vests (% off) no bid 10% varies 45% N/A 44% 36%
Manufacturer/Style No. all Safariland brands Point Blank Alpha Elite 3A Point Blank
Days to delivery 30-45 days 30 days
Vendor shall comply with yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
15-day delivery
Vendor shall notify department yes yes yes yes yes yes yes
of anticipated delays
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1048 Neches Street
Beaumont TX 77701
ph: 409-832-4475

fx: 409-832-4481
bfg1032@hotmail.com
attn: Bobby F. Goza

2727 Broadway

Galveston TX 77550

ph: 800-287-4666

fx: 800-724-0267
dhanson@burgooncompany.com
attn: Donna Hanson

2545 Brockton Drive, Suite 100

Austin TX 78758

ph: 800-252-8310
fx: 800-480-5845
txbids@gtdist.com
attn: Jamy Copeland

1340 Russell Cave Road
Lexington KY 40505

ph: 800-876-4242 ext 2245
fx: 859-266-7227
hauswald-rob@galls.com
attn: Rob Hauswald

PO Box 21056

Waco TX 76702

ph: 254-751-1566

fx: 254-751-0299
bids@icswaco.com
attn: Maegan Eisenman

826 Rutland Drive

Austin TX 78758

ph: 512-302-5541

fx: 512-355-4134
benirvine@milleruniforms.com
attn: Ben Irvine

5550 Eastex Freeway, Suite L
Beaumont TX 77708

ph: 409-892-7836

fx: 409-892-7826
tony@texascodeblue.com
attn: Tony Cervantes




