
Preliminary Tabulation

IFB 22-074/MR

Vehicles for Jefferson County

Opening Date:  Wednesday, February 8, 2023

Item No. Item Description Bid Price

Projected Delivery 

Time from Date of 

Purchase

Bid Price

Projected Delivery 

Time from Date of 

Purchase

Bid Price

Projected Delivery 

Time from Date of 

Purchase

Bid Price

Projected Delivery 

Time from Date of 

Purchase

1
Truck – Ford F350 Super Duty Crew 

Cab or Approved Equivalent
$55,685.00 365 Days $59,900.00 180 to 365 Days No Bid $48,459.00 150 to 365 Days

2
Truck – Ford F750 Regular Cab or 

Approved Equivalent
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
Truck – Chevrolet Silverado 1500 or 

Approved Equivalent
$49,540.00 365 Days $46,900.00 180 to 365 Days $44,022.00 120 to 365 Days No Bid

4
Truck – Ford F150 or Approved 

Equivalent
$49,540.00 365 Days $46,900.00 180 to 365 Days No Bid $42,953.00 120 to 365 Days

5
Truck – Ford F150 with Dual Drive 

Conversion or Approved Equivalent
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Proposed Equivalent Item 1 Description: 2023 Ram 3500 Crew Cab

Proposed Equivalent Item 2 Description:

Proposed Equivalent Item 3 Description: 2023 Ram 1500 Trademan

Southwest CDJR LLC Triple Crown Ford Lincoln LLC

Ford F150

Proposed Equivalent Item 4 Description: 2023 Ram 1500 Trademan

Proposed Equivalent Item 5 Description:

Caldwell Country Chevrolet Rockdale Country Ford



Item No. Item Description Bid Price

Projected Delivery 

Time from Date of 

Purchase

Bid Price

Projected Delivery 

Time from Date of 

Purchase

Bid Price

Projected Delivery 

Time from Date of 

Purchase

Bid Price

Projected Delivery 

Time from Date of 

Purchase

6
SUV – Chevrolet Tahoe or Approved 

Equivalent
$60,995.00 365 Days $59,585.00 180 to 365 Days $51,654.00 120 to 365 Days No Bid

7

Van – Chrysler Pacifica with Manual 

Rear Entry Wheel Chair Lift Package 

or Approved Equivalent

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8
Van – Ford Transit XL or Approved 

Equivalent
$48,205.00 365 Days $53,900.00 180 to 365 Days No Bid $43,177.00 120 to 365 Days

Atten: Vernon Scott

vscott@gilchristautomotive.com

phone: 713-444-0378

2023 Jeep Wagoneer 4 x 2

Southwest CDJR LLC

2235 N. Main St.

Cleburne, TX 76033

Proposed Equivalent Item 7 Description:

Proposed Equivalent Item 8  Description: 2023 1500 Cargo High Roof Van

Proposed Equivalent Item 6 Description: 2023 Ford Expedition XLT 4 x 2

2023 Ford Transit XL E350

Triple Crown Ford Lincoln LLC

2975 W. Washington

Caldwell, TX 77836

Atten: Chis CollinsAtten: Vernon Scott

vscott@gilchristautomotive.com

phone: 713-444-0378

Stephenville, TX 76401

phone: 979-567-1500

Jefferson County makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read aloud at the public opening.  The County has not checked the bids for errors, or made any determinations that the 

solicitations meet all requirements.  In the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and the original hard-copy document, the original hard copy shall prevail.

Southwest CDJR LLC Triple Crown Ford Lincoln LLC Caldwell Country Chevrolet Rockdale Country Ford

Rockdale Country Ford

P.O. Box 72

Rockdale, TX 76567

Atten: Chis Collins

chris@caldwellcountry.comchris@caldwellcountry.com

phone: 979-567-1500

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

P.O. Box 27
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