Preliminary Tabulation

(IFB 23-057/MR) Term Contract for Inmate Clothing and Supplies
Bid Opening: October 18, 2023

Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA
Item Unit Description Size Yellow Navy Blue [ Orange Red Green Yellow Navy Blue | Orange Red Green Yellow Navy Blue | Orange Red Green Yellow Navy Blue | Orange Red Green
1 Each Inmate X-Sm $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75
Coveralls Small $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75
(Average of |Med $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75
;éc;cr);) Per Large $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75
X-L $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75
1X-L $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75 $13.75
2X-L $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.24 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $14.88 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50
3X-L $14.92 $14.92 $14.92 $14.92 $14.92 $15.54 $15.54 $15.54 $15.54 $15.54 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50 $14.50
4X-L $14.92 $14.92 $14.92 $14.92 $14.92 $15.88 $15.88 $15.88 $15.88 $15.88 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95
5X-L $15.59 $15.59 $15.59 $15.59 $15.59 $16.54 $16.54 $16.54 $16.54 $16.54 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95
6X-L $15.59 $15.59 $15.59 $15.59 $15.59 $16.90 $16.90 $16.90 $16.90 $16.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $15.50 $15.50 $15.50 $15.50 $15.50
7X-L $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $17.90 $17.90 $17.90 $17.90 $17.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $15.50 $15.50 $15.50 $15.50 $15.50
8X-L $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90 $18.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $15.95 $15.95 $15.95 $15.95 $15.95
9X-L $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $19.90 $19.90 $19.90 $19.90 $19.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $15.95 $15.95 $15.95 $15.95 $15.95
10X-L $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $16.16 $20.90 $20.90 $20.90 $20.90 $20.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $16.50 $16.50 $16.50 $16.50 $16.50
11X-L $16.87 $16.87 $16.87 $16.87 $16.87 $21.90 $21.90 $21.90 $21.90 $21.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $16.50 $16.50 $16.50 $16.50 $16.50
12X-L $16.87 $16.87 $16.87 $16.87 $16.87 $22.90 $22.90 $22.90 $22.90 $22.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95
13X-L $18.12 $18.12 $18.12 $18.12 $18.12 $23.90 $23.90 $23.90 $23.90 $23.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95 $16.95
14X-L $18.12 $18.12 $18.12 $18.12 $18.12 $24.90 $24.90 $24.90 $24.90 $24.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $17.50 $17.50 $17.50 $17.50 $17.50
15X-L $20.10 $20.10 $20.10 $20.10 $20.10 $25.90 $25.90 $25.90 $25.90 $25.90 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $12.95 $17.50 $17.50 $17.50 $17.50 $17.50

Note: Size XS and 11-15XL will be custom made to order.
Therefore, lead time will be 60-90 days. Other sizes will
be in stock.

Note: Size X-Small and Small are the same size.
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Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Descnriptio Size Yellow Navy Blue | Orange Red Green Yellow Navy Blue | Orange Red Green Yellow Navy Blue | Orange Red Green Yellow Navy Blue | Orange Red Green
1 Each Inmate X-Sm No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66
Coveralls | gma $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66
(Average of | Med $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66
;éi?;) Pl Large $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $15.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66
X-L $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66
IX-L $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66
2X-L $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66 $28.66
3X-L $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11
4X-L $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11
5X-L $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $17.99 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11 $31.11
6X-L $18.81 $18.81 $18.81 $18.81 $18.81 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92
7X-L $18.81 $18.81 $18.81 $18.81 $18.81 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92
8X-L $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92 $33.92
9X-L $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87
10X-L $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $20.19 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87
11X-L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87 $36.87
12X-L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37
13X-L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37
14X-L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37
15X-L No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $31.75 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37 $40.37

Note: Sizes 5XL, 7XL and 9XL are all custom sizes and
have 80-95 day lead time.

Note: Please note Acme is bidding Jumpsuits All or

None.
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Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
2 Each Inmate  [x-sm $17.66 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid $25.79
(iarﬁii:;tj) Small $17.66 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid $25.79
(Average of Med $17.66 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid $25.79
500 per yean) || arge $17.66 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid $25.79
X-L $17.66 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid $25.79
1X-L $17.66 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid $25.79
2X-L $18.04 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid $30.42
3X-L $19.29 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid $34.17
4X-L $19.83 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid No Bid
5X-L $20.35 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid No Bid
6X-L $20.86 No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No Bid No Bid
Note: Size XS will be
custome made to order,
therefore lead time will be
60-90 days if ordered. Will
only accept award on 2XL +
if awarded S-XL as well.
Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
3 Each Inmate  |x-sm No Bid $19.90 $14.98 No Bid No Bid $43.85 No Bid $56.34
J(T:ﬁzzt)s Small No Bid $19.90 $14.98 No Bid No Bid $43.85 No Bid $56.34
(Average of |Med No Bid $19.90 $14.98 No Bid $17.46 $43.85 No Bid $56.34
500 peryean || rge No Bid $19.90 $14.98 No Bid $18.47 $43.85 No Bid $56.34
X-L No Bid $19.90 $14.98 No Bid $21.57 $43.85 No Bid $56.34
1X-L No Bid $19.90 $14.98 No Bid $21.57 $43.85 No Bid $56.34
2X-L No Bid $19.90 $14.98 No Bid $22.94 $43.85 No Bid $56.34
3X-L No Bid $20.54 $14.98 No Bid $22.94 $43.85 No Bid $58.00
4X-L No Bid $20.90 $14.98 No Bid $24.48 $43.85 No Bid $59.67
5X-L No Bid $21.90 $14.98 No Bid No Bid $43.85 No Bid $61.34
6X-L No Bid $22.90 $14.98 No Bid $24.48 $43.85 No Bid $63.01

Note: Size X-Small
and Small are the
same size.
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Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
4 Pal | [eck Shoe |Navy Blue 5 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
with Toecap |njavy Blue 6 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
(Average of |Navy Blue 7 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
300 pair per
year) Navy Blue 8 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
Navy Blue 9 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
Navy Blue 10 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
Navy Blue 11 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
Navy Blue 12 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
Navy Blue 13 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
Navy Blue 14 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
Navy Blue 15 $5.83 $6.54 No Bid No Bid $4.99 $6.65 No Bid $9.34
Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
5 Pair Leather Boot — Black 7 $23.34 $37.90 No Bid No Bid $19.99 $43.75 No Bid $33.95
(Average of 50 per year) 8 $23.34 $37.90 No Bid No Bid $19.99 $43.75 No Bid $33.95
9 $23.34 $37.90 No Bid No Bid $19.99 $43.75 No Bid $33.95
10 $23.34 $37.90 No Bid No Bid $19.99 $43.75 No Bid $33.95
11 $23.34 $37.90 No Bid No Bid $19.99 $43.75 No Bid $33.95
12 $23.34 $37.90 No Bid No Bid $19.99 $43.75 No Bid $33.95
13 $23.34 $37.90 No Bid No Bid $19.99 $43.75 No Bid $33.95
14 $23.34 $37.90 No Bid No Bid $19.99 $43.75 No Bid $33.95
Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
6 Each Mattress
No Color |25'x75"x4.5 No Bid $93.89 No Bid No Bid $91.23 $175.73 No Bid $139.82

(Average of | Specified
300 per year)
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Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Mattress
Cover —
Fabri " X 75"
7 Each aprie Bue | 3% No Bid $7.50 No Bid No Bid $7.61 $27.00 No Bid $10.38
(Average of
400 per year)
Note: Order by the Note: Sold per dozen. Note: Sold per dozen.
dozen $89.90.
Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Inmate
Blanket
8 Each Blue 66"x90" $7.29 $7.72 $5.98 No Bid $9.29 $33.17 $7.00 $7.52
(Average of
400 per year)
Note: White only.
Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Inmate Bath
Towel
9 Doz. (Average of White 30"x40" $11.54 $11.87 No Bid No Bid $19.77 $7.73 $9.60 $14.66
85 dozen per
year)
Note: Towel size is
20" x 40"
Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies
Item Unit Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Laundry Bag
10 Each (Average of White 18"x30" No Bid $2.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.75 No Bid $4.08

100 per year)

Note: Sold per Dozen.
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Victory Supply Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA Bob Barker Damysus Enterprises Acme Supply ICS Jail Supplies

Item Unit Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Laundry Bag

(mesh)

11 Each White 18" x 24” No Bid $2.36 No Bid No Bid $1.76 $3.70 No Bid $3.40

(Average of

100 per year)

Note: Sold per DZ Note: Sold per Dozen.
Victory Supply LLC Charm-Tex Bordova Innovations Mini Wing USA
7025 Industrial Park Rd. 1618 Coney Island Ave.

Mount Pleasant, TN 38474
Attn: Bruce Miller
Phone: (888) 376-1205
bids@victorysupplyinc.com

Damysus Enterprises, Inc.
424 Anders Lane
Kemah, TX 77565
Attn: Michael Okechukwu
Phone: (832) 719-4996
michael@damysusenterprises.com

Brooklyn, NY 11230
Attn: Stan Danzger
Phone: (718) 252-8100
stan@charm-tex.com

Acme Supply Co.

10 Cedar Swamp Rd, Suite 7
Glen Cove, NY 11542
Attn: Zaheer Sheik
Phone: (800) 567-8025
bn@acmesupply.us

915 E. Elizabeth Ave.
Linden, NJ 07036
Attn: Dov Appel

Phone: (718) 480-0290
dov@bordovabrand.com

ICS Jail Supplies Inc.
P.O. Box 21056
Waco, TX 76702
Attn: Jennifer Johnson
Phone: (800) 524-5427
biddesk@icswaco.com

Jefferson County makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read aloud at the public opening. The County has not checked the
bids for errors, or made any determinations that the solicitations meet all requirements. In the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and the original

hard-copy document, the original hard copy shall prevail.

2516 Via Tejon, Ste. 216
Palos Verdes Estates, CA 90274
Attn: Matt Huang
Phone: (424) 558-3867
matt@miniwinghealth.com

Bob Barker Company, Inc.
7925 Purfoy Road
Fuquay Varina, NC 27526
Attn: Ryan McNeill
Phone: (800) 334-9880
ryanmcneill@bobbarker.com
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