Preliminary Tabulation
IFB 24-054/CG

Term Contract for Gray Limestone (Commonly Referred to as 610 Base) for Jefferson County

Bid Opened: Wednesday, February 12, 2025

Texas Materials,

a CRH Company|

Vulcan Construction Materials

Modern Concrete & Materials

A. Gray Limestone Base - delivered from

Price per ton,

Price per ton,

Price per ton,

Price per ton,

Price per ton,

Price per ton,

vendor's hopper to job site. tandem dump trailer tandem dump trailer tandem dump trailer
1. 1-10 miles $57.00 $57.00 $62.00 $62.00 no bid no bid
2. 11 -20 miles $59.00 $59.00 $64.00 $64.00 no bid no bid
3. 21 - 30 miles $60.00 $60.00 $66.00 $66.00 no bid no bid
4. 31 + miles $61.00 $61.00 $70.00 $70.00 no bid no bid

B. Hopper Pick Up

Texas Materials,

a CRH Company

Vulvcan Construction Materials

Modern Concrete & Materials

Location

Address

Price per ton

Address

Price per ton

Address

Price per ton

. Beaumont

860 Pine Street

$51.50

. Port Neches

2170 S. Gulf Dr.

$55.00

1
2
3. Port Arthur
4. Other

3116 Texas Ave Bridge City

$62.50

5. Other

Hours of Hopper Operation

Mon-Fri, 7am - 4 pm

7am-4pm

7am- 5pm

Loose weight in lbs/cy

2000 Ibs/cy

Modern Concrete & Materials
4825 Romeda Rd

Beaumont, TX 77705

attn: Jennifer Frederick

jfrederick@modernconcretetx.com
409-842-2100

Vulcan Construction Materials
10101 Reunion Pl Suite 500
San Antonio, TX 78216

attn: Melanie Manrique
manriguem@vmcmail.com
ph: 210-965-0449

Texas Materials, a CRH Company

PO Box 20779

Beaumont TX 77720

attn: Jeremy Hemmings
Jeremy.hemmings@texasmaterials.com
ph: 409-718-8082

Jefferson County makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than
the information read aloud at the public opening. The County has not checked the bids
for errors, or made any determinations that the solicitations meet all requirements. In
the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and the original hard-
copy document, the original hard copy shall prevail.
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