Final Bid Tabulation

IFB 24-069/CG

Term Contract for Inmate Shoes for Jefferson County

Bid Opening: March 5, 2025

. JAB Trading P ;
Vendor: Bob Barker Charm-Tex ICS. Jail Industries, Mini Wing KAN Heritage Inc Victory Supply
Company, Inc. Supplies, Inc. LLC USA LLC
Item Unit |Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Small $3.85 $3.82 $8.55 No bid $3.59 $3.69 $3.44
Medium $3.85 $3.82 $8.55 No bid $3.59 $3.69 $3.44
. EVA "Step-In" Large $3.85 $3.82 $8.55 No bid $3.59 $3.69 $3.44
1 Pair Orange -
Style Shoe 1-XL $3.85 $3.82 $8.55 No bid $3.59 $3.69 $3.44
2-XL $3.85 $3.82 $8.55 No bid $3.59 $3.69 $3.44
3-XL $3.85 $3.82 $8.55 No bid $3.59 $3.69 $3.44
Bob Barker
Company, Inc ICS Jail JAB Trading Mini Wing Victory Supply
Vendor: | ' | Charm-Tex . Industries, KAN Heritage Inc
sold by dozen Supplies, Inc. LLC USA LLC
only
Item Unit  [Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Small $3.00 $3.98 $8.55 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
Medium $3.00 $3.98 $8.55 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
. EVA Clog Large $3.00 $3.98 $8.55 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
2A Pair Orange
Shoe 1-XL $3.00 $3.98 $8.55 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
2-XL $3.92 $3.98 $8.55 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
3-XL $3.92 $3.98 $8.55 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
Bob Barker
Company, Inc ICS Jail JAB Trading Mini Wing Victory Supply
Vendor: | ' | Charm-Tex . Industries, KAN Heritage Inc
sold by dozen Supplies, Inc. LLC USA LLC
only
Item Unit |Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Small $3.00 $3.98 $7.78 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
Medium $3.00 $3.98 $7.78 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
B Pair EVA Clog Black Large $3.00 $3.98 $7.78 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
Shoe 1-XL $3.00 $3.98 $7.78 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
2-XL $3.92 $3.98 $7.78 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84
3-XL $3.92 $3.98 $7.78 $4.40 $3.99 $3.99 $3.84




. JAB Trading .
Bob Bark ICS Jail . ini Wi . Vict 1

Vendor: ob barker Charm-Tex CS. a Industries, Mini Wing KAN Heritage Inc ictory Supply

Company, Inc. Supplies, Inc. LLC USA LLC
Item Unit  |Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Small $3.15 $3.69 $5.39 $2.75 No bid $2.39 $2.99
Medium $3.15 $3.69 $5.39 $2.75 No bid $2.39 $2.99
. EVA Uni-foot Large $3.15 $3.69 $5.39 $2.75 No bid $2.39 $2.99
3A Pair Orange -
Sandal 1-XL $3.15 $3.69 $5.39 $2.75 No bid $2.39 $2.99
2 - XL $3.15 $3.69 $5.39 $2.75 No bid $2.39 $2.99
3-XL $3.15 $3.69 $5.39 $2.75 No bid $2.39 $2.99
. JAB Trading .
Bob Bark ICS Jail . ini Wi . A% 1

Vendor: ob Barker Charm-Tex CS. a Industries, Mini Wing KAN Heritage Inc ictory Supply

Company, Inc. Supplies, Inc. LLC USA LLC
Item Unit [Description Color Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Small $3.15 $3.69 $4.08 No bid No bid $2.39 $2.99
Medium $3.15 $3.69 $4.08 No bid No bid $2.39 $2.99
. EVA Uni-foot Large $3.15 $3.69 $4.08 No bid No bid $2.39 $2.99
3B Pair Black - -
Sandal 1-XL $3.15 $3.69 $4.08 No bid No bid $2.39 $2.99
2 - XL $3.15 $3.69 $4.08 No bid No bid $2.39 $2.99
3-XL $3.15 $3.69 $4.08 No bid No bid $2.39 $2.99
Bob Barker Company, Inc. Charm-Tex ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. JAB Trading Industries

7925 Purfoy Road

Fuquay Varina NC 27526
attn: Ryan McNeill
RyanMcNeill @bobbarker.com
ph: 919-346-2172

fx: 800-322-7537

Mini Wing USA

2516 Via Tejon Ste 216
P.V.E, CA 90274

attn: Matt Huang
Matt@miniwinghealth.com
ph: 424-558-3867

KAN Heritage Inc

7620 Folsom Auburn Rd
Folsom, CA 95630

attn: Nidhi Aggarwal
Kanheritage@gmail.com
ph: 916-990-5719

1618 Coney Island Avenue
Brooklyn NY 11230

attn: Stan Danzger

Stan @ Charm-tex.com

ph: 718-252-8100

fx: 718-258-8303

Victory Supply LLC

7025 Industrial Park Road
Mount Pleasant TN 38474
attn: Bruce Miller
bids@victorysupplyinc.com
ph: 888-376-1205

fx: 931-325-5521

PO Box 21056

Waco TX 76702-1056
attn: Jennifer Johnson
biddesk@icswaco.com
ph: 800-524-5427

fx: 254-751-0299

4907 Callaghan Road, Suite 119
San Antonio TX 78228

attn: Danielle Martindale
danielle@jabtrading.com

ph: 210-681-2188
fx: 210-941-0150
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