
Final Tabulation

IFB 18-003/YS, Term Contract for Inmate Clothing and Supplies for Jefferson County

Opening Date:  Tuesday, April 10, 2018

Item Size

1 Acme Supply Co., LTD

Inmate Coveralls XS 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID 10 Cedar Swamp Road, Suite #7

Yellow (each) S 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID Glen Cove NY  11542

M 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID attn:  Zaheer Sheik

L 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID bn@acmesupply.us

XL 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID ph:  800-567-8025

1XL 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID fx:  800-567-8026

2XL 10.45 12.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID

3XL 10.45 12.98 13.54 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID Bob Barker Company, Inc.

4XL 10.45 12.98 13.90 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID 134 N. Main Street *10-12 week lead time for special order sizes.

5XL 10.45 13.98 14.54 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 12.00 NO BID Fuquay Varina NC  27526

6XL 10.45 13.98 14.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 13.00 NO BID attn:  Ryan Wilkie

7XL 10.45 15.98 15.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID RyanWilkie@BobBarker.com

8XL 10.45 15.98 15.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID ph:  800-334-9880

9XL 10.45 16.98 15.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID fx:  800-322-7537

10XL 10.45 16.98 16.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID

11XL 10.45 17.98 17.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 16.00 NO BID Charm Tex 

12XL 10.45 17.98 18.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 17.00 NO BID 1618 Coney Island Avenue

13XL 10.45 18.98 19.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 18.00 NO BID Brooklyn NY  11230

14XL 10.45 19.98 20.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID attn:  Stan Danzger

15XL 10.45 19.98 21.90 NO BID 19.47 NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID stan@charm-tex.com

Navy Blue (each) XS 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 10.99 NO BID ph:  718-252-8100

S 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 10.99 NO BID fx:  718-258-8303

M 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 10.99 NO BID

L 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 10.99 NO BID Goaltex Corp

XL 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 10.99 NO BID 146 Split Rock Road

1XL 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.60 NO BID Syosset NY  11791

2XL 10.45 12.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.60 NO BID attn:  Robert Grubman

3XL 10.45 12.98 13.54 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 11.60 NO BID Robert@goaltex.com

4XL 10.45 12.98 13.90 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 11.60 NO BID ph:  516-682-5775

5XL 10.45 13.98 14.54 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 12.00 NO BID fx:  516-682-5718

6XL 10.45 13.98 14.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 13.00 NO BID

7XL 10.45 15.98 15.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.

8XL 10.45 15.98 15.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID PO Box 21056 *shoe bid does not have toe cap, please see attached letter and specifications

9XL 10.45 16.98 15.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID Waco TX  76702

10XL 10.45 16.98 16.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID attn:  Maegan Eisenman

11XL 10.45 17.98 17.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 16.00 NO BID bids@icswaco.com

12XL 10.45 17.98 18.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 17.00 NO BID ph:  800-524-5427

13XL 10.45 18.98 19.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 18.00 NO BID fx:  254-751-0299

14XL 10.45 19.98 20.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID

15XL 10.45 19.98 21.90 NO BID 19.47 NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID O.D. Taragin & Bros., LLC

Orange (each) XS 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID 1400 Aliceanna Street

S 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID Baltimore MD  21231

Uniforms 

Manufacturing

Victory Supply 

Inc.

Acme Supply 

Co. Ltd.

Bob Barker 

Company, Inc. Charm Tex Goaltex Corp. ICS

O.D. Taragin & 

Bros. LLC Tabb Textiles
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M 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID attn:  Tehila Halpert

L 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID odtaragin@gmail.com

XL 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID ph:  410-276-7570

1XL 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID fx:  410-276-1414

2XL 10.45 12.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID

3XL 10.45 12.98 13.54 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID Tabb Textile

4XL 10.45 12.98 13.90 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID 511 Pleasant Drive

5XL 10.45 13.98 14.54 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 12.00 NO BID Opelika AL  36801

6XL 10.45 13.98 14.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 13.00 NO BID attn:  Masha Thrift

7XL 10.45 15.98 15.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID marsha@textilegroup.net

8XL 10.45 15.98 15.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID ph:  334-745-6762

9XL 10.45 16.98 15.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID fx:  334-745-2377

10XL 10.45 16.98 16.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID

11XL 10.45 17.98 17.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 16.00 NO BID Uniforms Manufacturing

12XL 10.45 17.98 18.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 17.00 NO BID 7575 E. Redfield Road #131

13XL 10.45 18.98 19.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 18.00 NO BID Scottsdale AZ  85260

14XL 10.45 19.98 20.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID attn:  Kimly Tran

15XL 10.45 19.98 21.90 NO BID 19.47 NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID kimly@umidirect.com

Red (each) XS 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID ph:  480-368-9316 ext 105

S 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID fx:  480-368-8556

M 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID

L 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID Victory Supply, Inc.

XL 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.49 NO BID 7025 Industrial Park Road

1XL 10.45 11.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID Mount Pleasant TN  38474

2XL 10.45 12.98 12.90 NO BID 12.32 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID attn:  Pam Whitmill

3XL 10.45 12.98 13.54 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID pam@victorysupplyinc.com  or  cheryl@victorysupplyinc.com

4XL 10.45 12.98 13.90 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 11.75 NO BID ph:  931-325-5517

5XL 10.45 13.98 14.54 NO BID 13.49 NO BID NO BID 12.00 NO BID fx:  931-325-5521

6XL 10.45 13.98 14.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 13.00 NO BID

7XL 10.45 15.98 15.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID

8XL 10.45 15.98 15.90 NO BID 14.74 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID

9XL 10.45 16.98 15.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID

10XL 10.45 16.98 16.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 14.00 NO BID

11XL 10.45 17.98 17.90 NO BID 16.32 NO BID NO BID 16.00 NO BID

12XL 10.45 17.98 18.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 17.00 NO BID

13XL 10.45 18.98 19.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 18.00 NO BID

14XL 10.45 19.98 20.90 NO BID 17.94 NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID

15XL 10.45 19.98 21.90 NO BID 19.47 NO BID NO BID 19.00 NO BID

2 XS 14.00 8.88 14.36 NO BID 22.64 26.05 NO BID 13.72 NO BID

Inmate Jackets - unlined S 14.00 8.88 14.36 NO BID 22.64 26.05 NO BID 13.72 NO BID

(each) M 14.00 8.88 14.36 NO BID 22.64 26.05 NO BID 13.72 NO BID

L 14.00 8.88 14.90 NO BID 22.64 26.05 NO BID 13.72 NO BID

XL 14.00 9.88 14.90 NO BID 22.64 26.05 NO BID 13.72 NO BID

1XL 14.00 9.88 14.90 NO BID 22.64 26.05 NO BID 14.40 NO BID

2XL 14.00 9.88 15.18 NO BID 22.64 26.05 NO BID 14.40 NO BID

3XL 14.00 9.88 15.54 NO BID 23.75 27.13 NO BID 14.40 NO BID

4XL 14.00 10.88 16.54 NO BID 23.75 27.13 NO BID 14.40 NO BID

5XL 14.00 10.88 17.54 NO BID 24.86 28.12 NO BID 15.00 NO BID
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6XL 14.00 10.88 18.90 NO BID 25.97 28.12 NO BID 15.00 NO BID

3 XS 14.00 17.88 14.36 NO BID 28.27 29.29 NO BID 18.40 NO BID

Inmate Jackets - lined S 14.00 17.88 14.36 NO BID 28.27 29.29 NO BID 18.40 NO BID

(each) M 14.00 17.88 14.36 NO BID 28.27 29.29 NO BID 18.40 NO BID

L 14.00 17.88 14.90 NO BID 28.27 29.29 NO BID 18.40 NO BID

XL 14.00 17.88 14.90 NO BID 28.27 29.29 NO BID 18.40 NO BID

1XL 14.00 17.88 14.90 NO BID 28.27 29.29 NO BID 18.40 NO BID

2XL 14.00 17.88 15.18 NO BID 28.27 29.29 NO BID 18.40 NO BID

3XL 14.00 17.88 15.54 NO BID 29.38 30.37 NO BID 18.40 NO BID

4XL 14.00 17.88 16.54 NO BID 29.38 30.37 NO BID 18.90 NO BID

5XL 14.00 19.88 17.54 NO BID 30.50 31.45 NO BID 18.90 NO BID

6XL 14.00 19.88 18.90 NO BID 30.50 31.45 NO BID 18.90 NO BID

4 5 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

6 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

7 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

8 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

9 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

10 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

11 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

12 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

13 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

14 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

15 NO BID 5.05 4.26 4.43 2.78* 7.95 NO BID NO BID 4.67

5 S NO BID 4.88 NO BID NO BID 6.36 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

Night Shirt - Female (each) M NO BID 4.88 NO BID NO BID 6.36 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

L NO BID 4.88 NO BID NO BID 6.36 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

1X NO BID 4.88 NO BID NO BID 6.36 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

2X NO BID 4.88 NO BID NO BID 7.19 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

3X NO BID 5.38 NO BID NO BID 8.08 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

4X NO BID 5.38 NO BID NO BID 8.97 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

5X NO BID 5.38 NO BID NO BID 9.86 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

6X NO BID 5.38 NO BID NO BID 10.75 NO BID NO BID 6.35 NO BID

6 30"x75"x4"

Mattress (each) NO BID 33.98 34.36 NO BID 33.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7 30"x75"x4"

Mattress Cover  (each) NO BID 12.22 9.84 NO BID 11.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8 30"75"x6"

Mattress Cover Heavy 

Weight Twill (each) NO BID 5.99 5.18 NO BID 4.93 NO BID 8.00 NO BID NO BID

9 66"x90"

Deck Shoe w/Toecap  Navy 

Blue (pair)



Inmate Blanket (each) 5.00 7.80 5.90 NO BID 4.67 NO BID 5.60 NO BID

8.47                              

(8.17 beige 

alternate)

10 30"x40"

Inmate Bath Towel (doz) 10.50 17.98 10.90 NO BID 12.50 19.60 9.15 NO BID 10.74

11 18"x30"

Laundry Bag (each) NO BID NO BID 1.90 NO BID 2.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.8833/each                   

22.60/doz

12 18"x24"

Laundry Bag Mesh (each) NO BID 1.32 1.72 NO BID 2.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2.1333/each             

25.60/doz


