IFB 19-038/YS, Term Contract for Paper Stock 7 Envelopes for Jefferson County
Final Bid Tabulation

Bid Opening: Tuesday, August 20, 2019
Olmsted Kirk Paper Co. Western BRW Paper - Bosworth Paper
I. Paper Stock P P P
Manufacturer  |Unit Price Per [Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer  [Unit Price  |Sheets per  |Unit Price
Item | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white 8%2x11, Paper grade:
1 |Premium #4 Carvajal $6.05 5000 $30.25 | Domtar Copy|  $5.69 5000 $28.45
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white 8%2x11,
2 _|3-hole punched — Paper grade: Premium #4 IP $7.10 5000 $35.50 | Domtar Copy| $6.34 5000 $31.70
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white 8%2x14, Paper
3 _[grade:Premium #4 1P $9.05 5000 $45.25 | Domtar Copy|  $8.06 5000 $40.30
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white 11x17, Paper grade:
4 |Premium #4 IP $14.20 2500 $35.50 ] Domtar Copy| $12.68 2500 $31.70
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors (peach, orchid,
cherry, ivory, grey), 8/5x11 — ream wrap only (combined Domtar Earth
5 |total), Paper grade: premium #4 1P $9.60 5000 $48.00 [Choice Colors| $8.00 5000 $40.00
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors (peach, orchid,
cherry, ivory, grey), 8/5x14 — ream wrap only (combined Domtar Earth
6 [total), Paper grade: Premium #4 1P $13.08 5000 $65.40 [Choice Colors| $10.78 5000 $53.90
20 Ib. Bond Paper, colors (buff, salmon, goldenrod, pink, Domtar Earth
7 _[blue, canary, green), 8%x11 1P $9.60 5000 $48.00 JChoice Colors|  $8.00 5000 $40.00
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors (ivory, goldenrod, Domtar Earth
8 |pink, blue, canary, green), 8%x14 1P $13.08 5000 $65.40 JChoice Colors| $10.78 5000 $53.90
20 Ib. Bond Paper, 25% rag, long grain, cockle finish, Nenah Atlas
9 |white, 8%x11. Paper grade: #1 Neenah $28.97 5000 $144.85 Bond $24.46 5000 $122.30
20 Ib. Bond Paper, 25% rag, long grain, cockle finish,
10 |white, 8%4x14. Paper grade: #1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Olmsted Kirk Paper Co. Western BRW Paper - Bosworth Paper
11. Card Stock
Manufacturer |Unit Price Per [Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer  [Unit Price  |Sheets per  |Unit Price
Item | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case
67 Ib. Vellum cover stock (white) 8%x11, shrink wrap
acceptable (combined total).
11 |Paper grade: #4 1P $16.86 2000 $33.72 Cenveo $16.04 2000 $32.08
67 Ib. Vellum cover stock (aqua, green, gold, blue, pink, Domtar Earth
ivory, yellow, grey) 8%2x11, shrink wrap acceptable Choice
12 |(com-bined total). Paper grade: #4 1P $18.30 2000 $36.60 JVellum Bristol|  $16.90 2000 $33.80
20 Ib. #1 White Sulfite, long grain white, 82x11
13 |Hammermill. Paper grade: Grade 1 watermark No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brite Hue — 60 Ib. text & cover 8'2x11 (red, violet, green, Neenah
14 |orange, ultra fuchsia) Neenah $14.42 5000 $72.10 | Astrobrights | $13.37 5000 $66.85
Neenah
Classic Crest
15 |#80 8%x11 Classic Crest Avon Brilliant White Neenah $68.00 2000 $136.00 Cover $63.60 2000 $127.20
Neenah
Classic Crest
16 |#80 8%x11 Classic Crest Avon Ivory Neenah $68.95 2000 $137.90 Cover $65.70 2000 $131.40
Olmsted-Kirk
17 |80 Ib, Starwhite Smooth Text Archiva, 8%x11 Neenah $50.40 2000 $100.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
111. Envelopes I- Olmsted Kirk Paper Co. I- Western BRW Paper - Bosworth Paper
Manufacturer — [Unit Price Per  |Sheets per |Unit Price  [Manufacturer [Unit Price  |Sheets per  [Unit Price
Item | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case
18 |24 Ib. catalog envelopes 10”x13” white woven Cenveo $64.70 500 $32.35 Cenveo $62.70 500 $31.35
19 |28 Ib. white catalog envelopes 9”x12” Cenveo $54.48 500 $27.24 Cenveo $54.20 500 $27.10
15”x10” brown kraft gummed flap document
20 |env. 32# Cenveo $99.00 500 $49.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 |#9 window envelopes — 24 Ib. white wove Cenveo $19.50 2500 $48.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 |#9 regular envelopes — 24 Ib. white wove Cenveo $17.26 2500 $43.15 Cenveo $18.67 2500 $46.68
#10 window env. — 24 Ib. white wove
23 |(hard boxes) Cenveo $19.50 2500 $48.75 Cenveo $21.50 2500 $53.75
#10 regular env. — 24 Ib. white wove
24 |(hard boxes) Cenveo $17.26 2500 $43.15 Cenveo $18.66 2500 $46.65
25 |#11 window envelopes — 28 Ib. white wove Cenveo $37.30 2500 $93.25 Cenveo $34.55 2500 $86.38




26 _|#11 regular envelopes — 28 Ib. white wove Cenveo $34.20 2500 $85.50 Cenveo $36.25 2500 $90.63
27 |#12 window envelopes — 24 Ib. white wove Cenveo $49.10 2500 $122.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 |#12 regular envelopes — 24 Ib. white wove No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Cenveo $52.75 2500 $131.88
29 |#10 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. Cenveo $26.10 2500 $65.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 [#12 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. Cenveo $50.85 2500 $127.12 Cenveo $66.34 2500 $165.85
31 |#14 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Opaque envelopes - 4%2x9 (blue, green, natural, cream, Leader
32 |gold, pink, gray, ivory, yellow) Cenveo $23.26 2500 $58.15 Cenveo $28.84 2500 $72.10
IV. No Carbon Required Paper Olmsted Kirk Paper Co. Western BRW Paper - Bosworth Paper
Manufacturer  |Unit Price Per [Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer  [Unit Price  |Sheets per  |Unit Price
Item | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case
Neekoosa
33 [8%x11 2-part black image carbonless reverse collated Appvion $26.05 5000 $130.25 | Carbonless $16.46 5000 $82.30
8Yx11 Mead 3-part black image carbonless reverse Neekoosa
34 |collated Appvion $29.30 5000 $146.50 | Carbonless $18.54 5000 $92.70
8Y2x11 Mead 4-part black image carbonless reverse Neekoosa
35 [collated Appvion $31.30 5000 $156.50 | Carbonless $19.81 5000 $99.05
8Y2x11 Mead 5-part black image carbonless reverse Neekoosa
36 |collated Appvion $32.20 5000 $161.00 | Carbonless $20.07 5000 $100.35
8Y2x14 Mead 2-part black image carbonless reverse Neekoosa
37 _|collated Appvion $33.15 5000 $165.75 | Carbonless $21.76 5000 $108.80
8Y2x14 Mead 3-part black image carbonless reverse Neekoosa
38_|collated Appvion $56.90 5000 $284.50 | Carbonless $24.50 5000 $122.50
8Y2x14 Mead 4-part black image carbonless reverse Neekoosa
39 |collated Appvion $39.85 5000 $199.25 | Carbonless $26.20 5000 $131.00
8Y2x14 Mead 5-part black image carbonless reverse Neekoosa
40 [collated Appvion $41.05 5000 $205.25 | Carbonless $27.75 5000 $135.75
Neenah
41 |8Y%x11 Astro Bright Text, 60T Neenah $14.42 5000 $72.10 ] Astrobrights | $13.37 5000 $66.85
Neenah
42 |8Y%x11 Astro Bright Cover, 65C Neenah $28.55 2000 $57.10 ] Astrobrights | $26.50 2000 $53.00

Olmsted Kirk Paper Co.
1601 Valley View Lane
Dallas TX 75234
attn: Alan Proctor
aproctor@okpaper.com
ph: 214-637-7146
fx: 214-637-2131

Western-BRW Paper Co. - Bosworth Papers
10425 Okanella #600

Houston TX 77041

attn: Joseph T. Jordan
jtiordan@bosworthpapers.com

ph: 713-460-5060

fx: 713-460-2037










