CURRENT PRICING

IFB 19-034/YS
Term Contract for Herbicides for Jack Brooks Regional Airport
Awarded: August 19, 2019

Renewal 1: 8/18/2020 — 8/17/2021
Renewal 2: 8/17/2021 — 8/18/2022
Renewal 3: 8/18/2022 — 8/17/2023

updated: 8/02/2022

Container Price per
Item | Description Size Brand bid Container Vendor
1A | POLARIS or equivalent 2.5¢al. Polaris $122.90 $187.50 | Red River Specialties
1B | POLARIS or equivalent 5 gal. cube NO BID
2 | Tordon 101 or equivalent 2.5 gal NO BID
3A | Roundup or equivalent 2.5 gal Ranger Pro $34.90 $93.75 | Red River Specialties
3A | Roundup or equivalent 5 gal. cube NO BID
4 | Opensight 1.25 Ibs Opensight $105.00 Red River Specialties
$111.75
5a | Esplanade 200 SC Quart Esplanade 200SC $325.25 Red River Specialties
$348.80
5b | Espanade 200 SC Gallon Esplanade 200SC $2924.30 Red River Specialties
$3,168.00
6 | Oust Extra or equivalent 4 1b. Oust Extra $119.80 Red River Specialties
7 | Sunset Sufactant or equivalent 2.5 ¢gal. RRSI NIS 90-10 $23-63 Red River Specialties
Surfactant $31.40
8A | Plateau or equivalent 2.5 gal Plateau (1-gal $118.16 Red River Specialties
container) $125.24
8B | Plateau or equivalent 5 gal. cube Plateau $584.75 Red River Specialties
$619.83
9A | 24-D or equivalent 2.5 gal Weedar 64 $33.88 Red River Specialties
$68.75
9B | 24-D or equivalent 5 gal. cube NO BID
10A | Garlon 4 or equivalent 2.5 gal Element 4 $130.00 Morning Star Industries
$179.00
10B | Garlon 4 or equivalent 5 gal. cube NO BID

Morning Star Industries
PO Box 1266

Jensen Beach FL 34958
attn: Steve Cook
steve@morningstarusa.com
ph: 800-440-6050

fx: 772-334-7999

Red River Specialties

1324 North Hearne Avenue, Suite 120

Shreveport LA 71107
attn: Chad Chambliss
chad.chambliss@rrsi.com
ph: 318-226-2604

fx: 318-227-3032
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