Current Pricing

(IFB 23-048/MR) Term Contract for Road Building Materials for Jefferson County

Awarded: November 14, 2023
Renewal 1: 11/13/2024 to 11/12/2025

1. Rock Asphalt Item 302 - Truck Delivery

Updated 12/3/2024

Description Location
Uncoated Limestone Rock Asphalt 12911 Hwy | 7759 Viterbo | 24420 Hwy 2202 Hebert
A. |Aggregate for Surface Treatments: | 205 Hwy 90 | 9550 Viterbo Rd. 365 Rd. 124 9059 Boyt Rd. | 7780 Boyt Rd. Rd.
Item 302 Type B Grade 3, Non-
1.|Lightweight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.|ltem 302 Type B Grade 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.[ltem 302 Type B Grade 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vulcan Construction Materials * Item B1 is not Non-Leightweight.
Precoated Limestone Rock Asphalt 12911 Hwy | 7759 Viterbo | 24420 Hwy 2202 Hebert
B. |Aggregate for Surface Treatments: | 205 Hwy 90 | 9550 Viterbo Rd. 365 Rd. 124 9059 Boyt Rd. | 7780 Boyt Rd. Rd.
Item 302 Type B Grade 3, Non-
1.|Lightweight $120.08/ton $132.08/ton $129.20/ton | $132.56/ton | $126.80/ton | $129.20/ton | $129.20/ton | $131.60/ton
2.|ltem 302 Type PB Grade 4 $120.08/ton $132.08/ton $129.20/ton | $132.56/ton | $126.80/ton | $129.20/ton | $129.20/ton | $131.60/ton
3.[Item 302 Type PB Grade 4S $120.08/ton $132.08/ton $129.20/ton | $132.56/ton | $126.80/ton | $129.20/ton | $129.20/ton | $131.60/ton
2. Rock Asphalt Item 302- Railroad Delivery
Description Location
Uncoated Limestone Rock Asphalt 12911 Hwy | 7759 Viterbo | 24420 Hwy 2202 Hebert
A. Aggregate for Surface Treatments: | 205 Hwy 90 | 9550 Viterbo Rd. 365 Rd. 124 9059 Boyt Rd. | 7780 Boyt Rd. Rd.
Item 302 Type B Grade 3, Non-
1.|Lightweight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.|ltem 302 Type B Grade 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.[Item 302 Type B Grade 4S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vulcan Construction Materials * Item B1 is not Non-Leightweight. Minimum order 4,000 tons
Precoated Limestone Rock Asphalt 12911 Hwy | 7759 Viterbo | 24420 Hwy 2202 Hebert
B. |Aggregate for Surface Treatments: | 205 Hwy 90 | 9550 Viterbo Rd. 365 Rd. 124 9059 Boyt Rd. | 7780 Boyt Rd. Rd.
Item 302 Type B Grade 3, Non-
1.[Lightweight $110.66/ton $110.66/ton $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton
2.|ltem 302 Type PB Grade 4 $110.66/ton $110.66/ton $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton
3.|ltem 302 Type PB Grade 4S $110.66/ton $110.66/ton $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton | $110.66/ton
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3. Flexible Base, Item 247 Type A Grade 1-2 (Minimum P.l. 4 - Maximum P.l. 10)
Truck Delivery - Prices F.0.B. delivered with freight prepaid and allowed by type of equipment indicated. Material shall be delivered from vendor's
closest location to job site or storage yard.

A. Delivery to Job Site Martin Marietta Materials
Distance Vehicle Type
Tandem
Dump Trailer
1.[1 - 10 Miles $43.50/ton $43.50/ton
2.[11 - 20 Miles $45.50/ton $45.50/ton
3.121 - 30 Miles $48.00/ton $48.00/ton
4.(31+ Miles $51.00/ ton $51.00 /ton
Martin Marietta Materials
12911 Hwy | 7759 Viterbo | 24420 Hwy 2202 Hebert
B. Delivery to Storage Yard 205 Hwy 90 | 9550 Viterbo Rd. 365 Rd. 124 9059 Boyt Rd. | 7780 Boyt Rd. Rd.
Tanden Dump $43.50/ton $43.50/ton $45.50/ton $45.50/ton $45.50/ton $43.50/ton $43.50/ton $43.50/ton
Trailer $43.50/ton $43.50/ton $45.50/ton $45.50/ton $45.50/ton $43.50/ton $43.50/ton $43.50/ton
C. Hopper Pick -Up Martin Marietta Materials
Location Address Hours of Hopper Operation Prices F.O.B. for Pick-Up
1.[Beaumont 11800 Hwy 90 (lron Horse Terminal) 7:00am - 5:00 pm $38.00/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.[Port Arthur 2190 South Gulfway Drive (Hwy 87) 7:00 am - 5:00 pm $38.00/ton
4.|0ther 2525 Dollinger Rd, Beaumont, TX 7:00 am - 5:00 pm $38.00/ton
5.|Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
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4. Flexible Base, Item 247 Type D Grade 1-2, Crushed Concrete (Minimum P.l. 4 - Maximum P.I. 10)
Truck Delivery - Prices F.0.B. delivered with freight prepaid and allowed by type of equipment indicated. Material shall be delivered from vendor's
closest location to job site or storage yard.

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC

A. Delivery to Job Site. Vehicle Type
Tandem
Distance Dump Trailer
1.[1 - 10 Miles $38.00/ton $38.00/ton
2.[11 - 20 Miles $39.00/ton $39.00/ton
3.121 - 30 Miles $43.00/ton $43.00/ton
4.(31+ Miles $45.00/ton $45.00/ton
Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
12911 Hwy | 7759 Viterbo | 24420 Hwy 2202 Hebert
B. Delivery to Storage Yard 205 Hwy 90 | 9550 Viterbo Rd. 365 Rd. 124 9059 Boyt Rd. | 7780 Boyt Rd. Rd.
Tanden Dump $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton
Trailer $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton $40.00/ton
C. Hopper Pick -Up Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
Location Address Hours of Hopper Operation Prices F.O.B. for Pick-Up
1.[Beaumont 6016 MLK Parkway 7:00 am - 5:00 pm $33.00/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.[Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.[Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
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5. DMS-9202 Gradation IV Asphaltic Concrete Patching Material (Stockpile Storage)
Truck Delivery - Prices F.O.B. delivered with freight prepaid and allowed by type of equipment indicated. Material shall be delivered from vendor's
closest location to job site or storage yard.

Waller County Asphalt *$0.38/ton

mile over 40 miles

A. Delivery to Job Site Vehicle Type
Tandem
Distance Dump Trailer

1.]1 - 10 Miles $113.80/ton $113.80/ton

2.|11 - 20 Miles $117.60/ton $117.60/ton

3.121 - 30 Miles $121.40/ton $121.40/ton

4.131+ Miles $125.20/ton $125.20/ton

Waller County Asphalt
12911 Hwy | 7759 Viterbo | 24420 Hwy 2202 Hebert

B. Delivery to Storage Yard 205 Hwy 90 | 9550 Viterbo Rd. 365 Rd. 124 9059 Boyt Rd. | 7780 Boyt Rd. Rd.

Tanden Dump

$148.76/ton

$162.44/ton

$163.96/ton

$163.58/ton

$163.96/ton

$159.21/ton

$159.78/ton

$163.96/ton

Trailer $148.76/ton $162.44/ton $163.96/ton | $163.58/ton | $163.96/ton | $159.21/ton | $159.78/ton | $163.96/ton
C. Hopper Pick -Up Waller County Asphalt
Location Address Hours of Hopper Operation Prices F.O.B. for Pick-Up
1.[Beaumont No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.|Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.|0ther 22010 Fairgrounds Rd, Hempstead, TX 7:00 am - 5:00 pm $110.00/ton
5.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid
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6. CMD-9000-002 Asphaltic Concrete Patching Material (Stockpile Storage)

Truck Delivery - Prices F.O.B. delivered with freight prepaid and allowed by type of equipment indicated. Material shall be delivered from vendor's
closest location to job site or storage yard.

Texas Materials

A. Delivery to Job Site Vehicle Type
Tandem
Distance Dump Trailer
1.]1 - 10 Miles $132.00/ton $132.00.ton
2.|11 - 20 Miles $134.00/ton $134.00/ton
3.[21 - 30 Miles $137.00/ton $137.00/ton
4.131+ Miles $143.00/ ton $143.00/ ton

B. Delivery to Storage Yard

Texas Materials

205 Hwy 90

9550 Viterbo Rd.

12911 Hwy
365

7759 Viterbo
Rd.

24420 Hwy
124

9059 Boyt Rd.

7780 Boyt Rd.

2202 Hebert
Rd.

Tanden Dump

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$137.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

Trailer

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$137.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

$135.00/ton

C. Hopper Pick -Up

Texas Materials

Location Address Hours of Hopper Operation Prices F.O.B. for Pick-Up
1.[Beaumont 860 Pine Street 7:00 am - 4:00 pm $123.00/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.|Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.(Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.|Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
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7. Hot-Mix Cold-Laid Asphalt Concrete Pavement, Item 8013, Type D (Patching Material)
Truck Delivery - Prices F.O.B. delivered with freight prepaid and allowed by type of equipment indicated. Material shall be delivered from vendor's
closest location to job site or storage yard.

Texas Materials

A. Delivery to Job Site Vehicle Type
Tandem
Distance Dump Trailer
1.]1 - 10 Miles $127.00/ton $127.00/ton
2.{11 - 20 Miles $129.00/ton $129.00/ton
3.]21 - 30 Miles $132.00/ton $132.00/ton
4.131+ Miles $138.00/ ton $138.00/ ton
Texas Materials
12911 Hwy | 7759 Viterbo | 24420 Hwy 2202 Hebert
B. Delivery to Storage Yard 205 Hwy 90 | 9550 Viterbo Rd. 365 Rd. 124 9059 Boyt Rd. | 7780 Boyt Rd. Rd.
Tanden Dump $130.00/ton $130.00/ton $130.00/ton | $130.00/ton | $132.00/ton | $130.00/ton | $130.00/ton | $130.00/ton
Trailer $130.00/ton $130.00/ton $130.00/ton | $130.00/ton | $132.00/ton | $130.00/ton | $130.00/ton | $130.00/ton
C. Hopper Pick -Up Texas Materials
Location Address Hours of Hopper Operation Prices F.O.B. for Pick-Up
1.|Beaumont 860 Pine Street 7:00am - 4:00 pm $118.00/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.|Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid
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8. Cement Stabilized Base, Item 276 (Plant Mixed) Crushed Limestone

Truck Delivery - Prices F.0.B. delivered with freight prepaid. Material shall be delivered from vendor's closest location to job site.

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC

A. Delivered to Job Site Description
Distance 11/2 sack/ton 2 sack/ton 3 sack/ton 4 sack/ton
1. |1-10 Miles $54.50/ton $59.50/ton $68.00/ton $75.50/ton
2. |11-20 Miles $55.50/ton $60.50/ton $69.00/ton $76.50/ton
3. |21-30 Miles $59.50/ton $64.50/ton $73.00/ton $80.50/ton
4. [31+ Miles $61.50/ton $66.50/ton $75.00/ton $82.50/ton
B. Hopper Pick Up Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
Hours of
Location Address Operation |11/2 sack/ton| 2 sack/ton 3 sack/ton 4 sack/ton
7:00 am- 5:00
1.[|Beaumont 2120 N. 7th St. pm $49.50/ton $54.50/ton $63.00/ton $70.50/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.|Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.10ther No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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9. Cement Stabilized Base, Item 276 (Plant Mixed) Crushed Concrete

Truck Delivery - Prices F.O.B. delivered with freight prepaid. Material shall be delivered from vendor's closest location to job site.

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC

A. Delivered to Job Site Description
Distance 11/2 sack/ton 2 sack/ton 3 sack/ton 4 sack/ton
1. [1-10 Miles $52.00/ton $56.00/ton $63.00/ton $71.00/ton
2. [11-20 Miles $53.00/ton $57.00/ton $64.00/ton $72.00/ton
3. [21-30 Miles $57.00/ton $61.00/ton $68.00/ton $76.00/ton
4. |31+ Miles $59.00/ton $63.00/ton $70.00/ton $78.00/ton
B. Hopper Pick up Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
Hours of
Location Address Operation |11/2 sack/ton| 2 sack/ton 3 sack/ton 4 sack/ton
7:00 am- 5:00
1.|Beaumont 6025 Highland Ave. pm $47.00/ton $51.00/ton $58.00/ton $66.00/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.|Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.10ther No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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10. Cement Stabilized Sand, Item 400, Plant Mixed

Truck Delivery - Prices F.O.B. delivered with freight prepaid. Material shall be delivered from vendor's closest location to job site.

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC

A. Delivered to Job Site Description
Distance 11/2 sack/ton 2 sack/ton 3 sack/ton 4 sack/ton
1. |1-10 Miles $40.00/ton $45.00/ton $52.50/ton $60.50/ton
2. [11-20 Miles $41.00/ton $46.00/dom $53.50/ton $61.50/ton
3. |21-30 Miles $45.00/ton $50.00/ton $57.50/ton $65.50/ton
4. |31+ Miles $47.00/ton $52.00/ton $59.50/ton $67.50/ton

Truck Delivery - Prices F.O.B. delivered with freight prepaid. Material shall be delivered from vendor's closest location to job site.

B. Hopper Pick up

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC

Hours of
Location Address Operation |11/2 sack/ton| 2 sack/ton 3 sack/ton 4 sack/ton
7:00 am- 5:00

1.[Beaumont 2120 N. 7th St/ 6025 Highland Ave. pm $35.00/ton $40.00/ton $47.50/ton $55.50/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.|Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.10ther No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.[Other No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11. Flowable Backfill, Item 401

Truck Delivery - Prices F.0.B. delivered with freight prepaid. Material shall be delivered from vendor's closest location to job site.

Martin Marietta Materials

Distance Cost
1.|1 - 10 Miles $116.00/C.Y.
2.[11 - 20 Miles $116.00/C.Y.
3.]21 - 30 Miles $116.00/C.Y.
4.131+ Miles $116.00/C.Y.
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12. Dense-Graded Hot-Mix Asphalt, Item 340, Gradation D, PG64-22, Max 20% RAP, No RAS

Hopper Pick -Up

Texas Materials

Location Address Hours of Hopper Operation Prices F.O.B. for Pick-Up
1.|Beaumont 860 Pine Street 7:00am - 4:00 pm $135.00/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.|Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid

13. Dense-Graded Hot-Mix Asphalt, Item 340, Gradation F, PG64-22, Max 20% RAP, No RAS

Hopper Pick -Up

Texas Materials

Location Address Hours of Hopper Operation Prices F.O.B. for Pick-Up
1.[Beaumont 860 Pine Street 7:00 am - 4:00 pm $148.00/ton
2.|Port Neches No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.|Port Arthur No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.(Other No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.|0ther No Bid No Bid No Bid

14. Hydraulic Cement Concrete, Item 421

Truck Delivery - Prices F.0.B. delivered with freight prepaid. Material shall be delivered from vendor's closest location to job site.

Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
A. Delivered to Job Site Description
Distance Item 421, Type A Item 421, Type B Item 421, Type S6
1.11-10 Miles $140.00/C.Y. $130.00/C.Y. $150.00/C.Y,
2.{11-20 Miles $140.00/C.Y. $130.00/C.Y. $150.00/C.Y,
3./21-30 Miles $140.00/C.Y. $130.00/C.Y. $150.00/C.Y,
4.131+ Miles $140.00/C.Y. $130.00/C.Y. $150.00/C.Y,
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Modern Concrete & Materials, LLC
P.O. Box 21557
Beaumont, TX 77720
Attn: Trent Almond
Phone: (409) 840-2080
talmond@modernconcretetx.com
jfrederick@modernconcretetx.com

Texas Materials, a CRH Company
12907 US Highway 90
Beaumont, TX 77713

Attn: Jeremy Hemmings
Phone (409) 718-8082
jeremy.hemmings@texasmaterials.com

Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC
P.O. Box 791550
San Antonio, TX 78279
Attn: Melanie Manrique
Phone: (210) 965-0448
manriguem@vmcmail.com

Martin Marietta Materials, LLC
5675 Fannett Road
Beaumont, TX 77705
Attn: Bill Kelley
Phone (409) 835-4933
william.kelley@martin marietta.com
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Waller County Asphalt, Inc.

22010 Fairgrounds Rd.
Hempstead, TX 77445
Attn: Kyle Dawson
Phone: (979) 826-7075
info@wcasphalt.com
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