
Preliminary Tabulation

IFB 22-023/YS

Term Contract for Insecticides, Herbicides, Spray Adjuvants, and Adulticides for Jefferson County Mosquito Control District 

Opening Date:  Wednesday, May 11, 2022

1 700
MSMA Herbicide – 2.5 

gal. container
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Target 6+ yes 32.23 $22,561.00

MSMA 6 
Plus

yes 44.00 $30,800.00 Drexel yes 40.94 $28,658.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 20,000
Malathion Insecticide – 

bulk shipment only

FMC 
Fyfanon 
ULV (260 
gl totes)

yes 59.50/gal $1,190,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fyfanon 
ULV

yes 55.46

8 1,100
Bio Mist 3-15 ULV – 

275 gal containers

CSI 
Permasease 
3-15 ULV

yes 47.73/gal $52,503.00
Clarke 
Biomist 
3+15

yes 91.55 $100,705.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Deltagard 
Permanone 
RTU

no
224.00                                 
38.25

$246,400.00                 
$42,075.00

No Bid No Bid

9 600
Envion 30/30 insecticide 
– 2.5 gal. containers

CSI 
Permasease 
30-30 ULV 
(2x2.5 
gal/cs)

yes 124.00/gal $74,400.00
Clarke 
Biomist 
30+30

yes 68.67 $41,202.00 No Bid No Bid
Perm-X UL 
30-30

yes 105.00 $63,000.00
Permethrin 
SFR 1.25 
gal

yes 86.99 $52,194.00
Aquaperm-
x Aqua-
Reslin

no
108.44               
100.00

$65,064.00                 
$60,000.00

Perm X yes 69.95 $174.88

fx:  630-443-3070

Item #5 Per clarification Site One Landscape Supply bid a surfactant and not a drift control-does not meet spectifications. Item#9  Per clarification ADAPCO, LLC, Clarke Mosquito Control, Pro Pest and Lawn Store, SiteOne Landscape and Target Specialty are not water compatibledoes not meet specifications.

attn:  John West 

John.West@Veseris.com 

ph:  979-574-5275

Jefferson County makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read 
aloud at the public opening.  The County has not checked the bids for errors, or made any determinations that 
the solicitations meet all requirements.  In the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and 
the original hard-copy document, the original hard copy shall prevail.

Item
Est Qty. 

(Gal.)
Description Brand bid

MSDS 
Labels 

Attached

Price per 
Gallon

Verseris
PO Box 20301 

Beaumont TX  77720 

36.58

2 700 No Bid No Bid
Tordon 101 Herbicide or 
equivalent –2.5 gal 

container

No Bid No Bid
Rodeo Herbicide or 
equivalent – 2.5 gal 

container

3 700 No Bid No Bid
Roundup Herbicide or 
equivalent – 2.5 gal 

container

Total Brand bid
MSDS 
Labels 

Attached

Price per 
Gallon

6 400 No Bid No Bid
Aqua-King Surfactant or 
equivalent – 2.5 gal (or 

smaller) container

5 100 No Bid No Bid
Nalco Trol II or 
equivalent – 2.5 gal. (or 

smaller) container

4 100

No Bid No Bid

Brand bid
MSDS 
Labels 

Attached

Ranger Pro yes

Aqua King yes

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Total

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Rodeo yes 31.60 $3,160.00

No Bid No Bid

Price per 
Gallon

Total

Tordon K yes 61.00 $42,700.00

41.00 $16,400.00

Brand bid
MSDS 
Labels 

Attached

Price per 
Gallon

Total

Gunslinger 
P&D

yes 36.75 $25,725.00

$25,606.00

Novita 
Drift 
Control (4 
x 1 gal)

yes 27.50 $2,750.00

No Bid No Bid

Makaze yes 48.00 $33,600.00

Round Up yes 55.00 $5,500.00

Lesco 
Spreader 
Sticker

yes 23.28 $9,312.00

Lesco 
Prosecutor 
Pro

yes 40.87 $28,609.00

Polaris yes 82.13 $8,213.00

Brand bid
MSDS 
Labels 

Attached

Price per 
Gallon

Total

No Bid No Bid

No Foam A yes 20.82 $2,082.00

Brand bid
MSDS 
Labels 

Attached

Price per 
Gallon

Total

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

yes 102.16 $255.40

No Bid No Bid

Brand bid
MSDS 
Labels 

Attached

Price per 
Gallon

Total

No Bid No Bid

Target Specialty Products Verseris

ADAPCO, LLC
100 Colonial Center Parkway, Ste. 170 

Lake Mary FL  32746
attn:  Kathy Russell 

Nutrien Solutions
13622 E. Hardy Road
Houston TX  77039
attn:  Kevin Evans

ADAPCO, LLC Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. Nutrien Solutions Pro Pest and Lawn Store SiteOne Landscape Supply

No Bid No Bid

Surfac AC 
2.5 gal

yes 15.99 $39.96

Finale XL 
2.5 gal

bids@myadapco.com
ph:  407-328-6519

*ADAPCO to provide technical support, 
droplet testing and calibrations if required.

Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc.
675 Sidwell Court
St Charles IL  60174
attn:  Doug Carroll
customercare@clarke.com
ph:  817-600-5353

kevin.evans@nutrien.com
ph:  832-328-4734
fx:  281-590-5043

Pro Pest and Lawn Store
3333 East Texas
Bossier City LA  71111 

attn:  Royal Tyler 

propestandlawn@gmail.com 

ph:  318-584-7217

fx:  225-351-8862
fx:  248-581-1433

Target Specialty Products
1225 N. Post Oak Road
Houston TX  77055
attn:  Kirsti Rodney or David Herter 

kirsti.rodney@ target-specialty.com 

david.herter@target-specialty.com 

ph:  225-999-8307 or 318-254-3330 

SiteOne Landscape Supply
1385 East 36th Street
Cleveland OH  44114
attn:  Monique Potts
bids@SiteOne.com
ph:  216-706-9250
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