Final Tabulation
IFB 23-024/MR
Re-Bid Term Contract for Generator Inspections, Routine Maintenance and Service for

Jefferson County
Awarded: May 9, 2023

Clifford Power Systems,
Inc.

22811 Industry Lane
Tomball, TX 77375
Peter Psarovarkas
Phone: 346-237-5884

email:

ppsavorarkas @cliffordpo narmstrong @mustangcat.

Mustang Machinery

Company, LLC

12800 Northwest Fwy
Houston, TX 77040
Natassia Armstrong

Phone: 409-719-1862

email:

ARCCO Company
Services, Inc.
3400 Awesome Ln
LaPorte, TX 77571
Tom Sanders
Phone: 281-885-4231
Fax: 225-275-1198

email:

Cat5 Resources LLC

6757 Patillo Road
Beaumont, TX 77705
Cindy Perez
Phone: 409-460-3069
Fax: 888-663-4161

email:

Emergency Power
Services
P.O.Box 8
Silsbee, TX 77656
John Baker
Phone: 409-658-0765
Fax: 409-246-8164

wer.com com tsanders@arccoc.om  rfps@catSresources.com  email: jb17 @wt.net
Item |Description Labor Charge per Labor Charge per Labor Charge per Labor Charge per Labor Charge per
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Generator Technician during working hours (Monday-Friday, $99.00 Gemerator Tech.
b [5:00 am 10 5:00 pm) $170.00 $196.00 $119.00 Electrician LY $165.00
Helper accompanying Generator Technician during working .
2 hours (Monday-Friday. 8:00 am to 5:00 pm) No Bid $196.00 $79.00 $85.00 $82.50
Generator Technician during after-hours (Monday-Friday $225 - Saturday ~ $340 $99.00 Generator Tech.
3 5:00 pm — 8:00 am, and all day Saturday & Sunday) - Sunday $294.00 $149.00 Electrician $125.00 $247.50
Helper accompanying Generator Technician during after-
4  |hours (Monday-Friday 5:00 pm — 8:00 am, and all day No Bid $294.00 $79.00 $110.00 $123.75
Saturday & Sunday)
5 |Generator Technician for services on Holidays $340'.0 0 -4 hour $368.00 $148.50 Generatqr .Tech. $125.00 $330.00
minimum $149.00 Electrician
6 Helper accompanying Generator Technician for services on No Bid $368.00 $118.50 $110.00 $165.00

Holidays
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. . Labor Charge per Labor Charge per Labor Charge per Labor Charge per Labor Charge per
Item |Description gep gep gep gep gep
Hour Hour Hour Hour Hour
Generator Technician for disaster relief service during
. tor Tech.

7  |mandatory/voluntary County evacuation (Monday-Friday, $170.00 $196.00 $9§ 1(2109 C(})(e)rr];ra to.r ¢ $130.00 $165.00
8:00 am to 5:00 pm) ) ectrician
Helper accompanying Generator Technician for disaster relief

8 |service during mandatory/voluntary County evacuation No Bid $196.00 $79.00 $120.00 $82.50
(Monday-Friday, 8:00 am to 5:00 pm)
Generator Technician for emergency disaster relief service

340.00 - 4 h 148.50 G tor Tech.

9 |after-hours during mandatory/voluntary County evacuation $ .. our $294.00 $ $149 Ooelgizratqr . e $130.00 $247.50
(Monday-Friday 5:00 pm to 8:00 am) minimum ) ectrician
Helper accompanying Generator Technician for emergency

10 |disaster relief service after-hours during mandatory/voluntary No Bid $294.00 $118.50 $120.00 $123.50
County evacuation (Monday-Friday 5:00 pm to 8:00 am)

11 Ger}erator Technician for emergency disaste.r service. relief $340.00 $368.00 $148.50 $130.00 $330.00
during mandatory/voluntary County evacuation (Holidays)
Helper accompanying Generator Technician for emergency

12 |disaster service during mandatory/ voluntary county No Bid $368.00 $118.50 $120.00 $165.00
evacuation (Holidays)
Materials, supplies, and/or equipment furnished by contractor

13 shall be billeq at % max'“kup. J effgrson County 20% 359% 20% 15% 359%
reserves the right to request copies of invoices made to
contractor from supplier including freight charges.
Additional charges (Including, but no limited to inspection $0.50/mile. inspection

14 |fee, service call charge, mileage charges, fuel surcharges, $3.25/mile $4.40/mile ) - 10SP Fuel Cost + 10% $2.85/mile

miscellaneous supply charges)

fees




