IFB 24-038/CG, Term Contract for Paper Stock & Envelopes for Jefferson County
Preliminary Bid Tabulation

Bid Opening: Wednesday, September 4, 2024

Lindenmeyr Munroe Western BRW Paper Staples Red Buffalo Transportation
I. Paper Stock v P P P
Manufacturer  |Unit Price Per  [Sheets per [Unit Price  |Manufacturer [Unit Price  [Sheets per  |Unit Price  jManuf: er  |Unit Price  [Sheets per |Unit Price  fManufacturer ~ |Unit Price Per |Sheets per  [Unit Price Per
Item | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Case
20 1b. Bond Paper, long grain, white 8%2x11, Paper grade: International Hammermill
1 |Premium #4 Global office $9.85 5000 $49.25 | Suzan Report $6.85 5000 $34.25 | paper Staples $8.52 5000 $42.62 /HP $11.20 2500 $56.00
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white 8%x11, Sylvamo Domtar Domtar
2 _|3-hole punched — Paper grade: Premium #4 Hammermill $12.08 5000 $60.40 Lettermark $10.10 5000 $50.50 Staples $10.83 5000 $54.15 Hammermill $9.00 2500 $45.00
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white 8%x14, Paper Sylvamo Domtar Domtar
3 _|grade:Premium #4 Hammermill $15.37 5000 $76.85 Lettermark $12.79 5000 $63.96 Staples $13.80 5000 $69.01 Hmmermill $12.00 2500 $60.00
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white 11x17, Paper grade: Sylvamo Domtar Domtar
4 |Premium #4 Hammermill $24.16 2500 $60.40 Lettermark $20.30 2500 $50.75 Staples $23.13 2500 $57.83 Xerox $15.00 2500 $75.00
20 1b. Bond Paper, long grain, colors (peach, orchid, Sylvamo
cherry, ivory, grey), 8/2x11 — ream wrap only (combined Sylvamo Domtar North America
5 |total), Paper grade: premium #4 Hammermill $15.40 5000 $77.00 Lettermark $12.82 5000 $64.10 Staples $16.98 500 $8.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors (peach, orchid,
cherry, ivory, grey), 8/5x14 — ream wrap only (combined Sylvamo
6 _|total), Paper grade: Premium #4 Hammermill $21.05 5000 $105.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Ib. Bond Paper, colors (buff, salmon, goldenrod, pink, Sylvamo Domtar International
7 _|blue, canary, green), 8%x11 Hammermill $15.40 5000 $77.00 Lettermark $12.82 5000 $64.10 | paper Staples | $17.68 5000 $88.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sylvamo
20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors (ivory, goldenrod, Sylvamo Domtar North America
8 |pink, blue, canary, green), 8¥2x14 Hammermill $21.05 5000 $105.25 Lettermark $17.54 5000 $87.70 Staples $25.98 500 $12.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Ib. Bond Paper, 25% rag, long grain, cockle finish, Neenah Royal
9 |white, 8%5x11. Paper grade: #1 Cotton $50.85 4000 $203.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Ib. Bond Paper, 25% rag, long grain, cockle finish,
10_|white, 8¥2x14. Paper grade: #1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lindenmeyr Munroe Western BRW Paper Staples Red Buffalo Transportation
II. Card Stock
Manufacturer | Unit Price Per |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer  |Unit Price  |Sheets per  [Unit Price  fManufacturer  |Unit Price  [Sheets per  [Unit Price  fManufacturer | Unit Price Per [Sheets per | Unit Price Per
Item | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Case
67 Ib. Vellum cover stock (white) 8%2x11, shrink wrap Sylvamo
acceptable (combined total). Springhill Domtar Neehah Paper
11 |Paper grade: #4 Vellum $30.20 2000 $60.40 Letterman $25.04 2000 $50.09 | (NSP) Staples |  $32.12 250 $8.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
67 Ib. Vellum cover stock (aqua, green, gold, blue, pink, Sylvamo
ivory, yellow, grey) 8%2x11, shrink wrap acceptable Springhill Domtar Neehah Paper
12 |(combined total). Paper grade: #4 Vellum $32.85 2000 $65.70 Letterman $25.98 2000 $51.98 | (NSP) Staples | $34.84 250 $8.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 Ib. #1 White Sulfite, long grain white, 82x11
13 |Hammermill. Paper grade: Grade 1 watermark No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brite Hue — 60 Ib. text & cover 8%x11 (red, violet, green, Neenah Neenah Neehah Paper
14 |orange, ultra fuchsia) Astrobright $31.70 5000 $158.50 ) Astrobrights $22.70 5000 $113.50 J(NSP) Staples [ $51.76 250 $12.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Neenah Lindenmeyr
15 |#80 8%2x11 Classic Crest Avon Brilliant White Classis crest $122.90 2000 $245.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Munroe $230.92 250 $57.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Neenah
16 _[#80 8Y5x11 Classic Crest Avon Ivory Classic Crest $124.20 2000 $248.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Olmsted-Kirk paper
17 {80 Ib, Starwhite Smooth Text Archiva, 8/2x11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | Hammermill $63.96 250 $15.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




II1. Envelopes Lindenmeyr Munroe Western BRW Paper Staples Red Buffalo Transportation
Manufacturer  [Unit Price Per [Sheets per [Unit Price  |Manufacturer [Unit Price  [Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer ~ |[Unit Price  [Sheets per  |Unit Price  |Manufacturer ~ |Unit Price Per |Sheets per  [Unit Price Per
Item | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Case
Lindenmeyr
18 |24 Ib. catalog envelopes 10”x13” white woven Envelope $123.55 500 $61.77 Cenveo 500 $64.49 Staples $127.80 100 $12.78 | Timber Creek 500 $250.00
TIRICTITICYT
19 |28 Ib. white catalog envelopes 97x12” Envelope $107.60 500 $53.80 Cenveo 500 $48.00 Staples $99.90 100 $9.99 Timber Creek 500 $250.00
15”x10” brown kraft gummed flap document
20 |env. 32# No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Staples $171.50 100 $17.15 Quality Park 100 $60.00
Lindenmeyr Amazon
21 |#9 window envelopes — 24 Ib. white wove Envelope $40.20 2500 $100.51 Cenveo 2500 $87.65 Staples $33.36 500 $16.68 Basics 500 $32.00
Lindenmeyr
22 |#9 regular envelopes — 24 Ib. white wove Envelope $35.00 2500 $87.50 Cenveo 2500 $66.70 Staples $27.00 500 $13.50 Columbian 500 $40.00
#10 window env. — 24 Ib. white wove Lindenmeyr
23 |(hard boxes) Envelope $40.20 2500 $100.51 Cenveo 2500 $76.60 Staples $39.98 500 $19.99 Herkka 500 $50.00
#10 regular env. — 24 Ib. white wove Lindenmeyr
24 |(hard boxes) Envelope $35.00 2500 $87.50 Cenveo 2500 $66.70 Staples $27.08 500 $13.54 Herkka 500 $42.00
Cenveo Envelope of
25 [#11 window envelopes — 28 Ib. white wove Printmaster $79.95 2500 $199.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NI $239.80 50 $11.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cenveo
26 _|#11 regular envelopes — 28 Ib. white wove Printmaster $76.50 2500 $191.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Staples $49.98 500 $24.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 |#12 window envelopes — 24 Ib. white wove No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TeNveoD TIUTSOIT
28 |#12 regular envelopes — 24 Ib. white wove Printmaster $88.45 2500 $221.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | Envelope of | $134.05 1000 $134.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
America
29 [#10 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | Quality Park $89.98 500 $44.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cenveo
30 _|#12 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. Printmaster $137.95 2500 $344.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Staples $59.98 500 $29.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Esselte
31 |#14 brown kraft envelopes — 28 Ib. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid America $89.98 500 $44.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Opaque envelopes - 4%5x9 (blue, green, natural, cream, Sylvamo Envelope of
32 |gold, pink, gray, ivory, yellow) Hammermill $48.70 2500 $121.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NI $279.80 50 $13.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sylvamo
33 |Hammermill Offset 60T #10 Canary Hammermill $48.70 2500 $121.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
IV. No Carbon Required Paper Lindenmeyr Munroe ‘Western BRW Paper Staples Red Buffalo Transportation
Manufacturer  |Unit Price Per |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer  |Unit Price  |Sheets per  [Unit Price  fManufacturer ~ |Unit Price  [Sheets per  [Unit Price  fManufacturer | Unit Price Per [Sheets per | Unit Price Per
Ttem | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Case
5000/250 Enterprise
34 [8%4x11 2-part black image carbonless reverse collated Nekoosa NCR| $86.60 Osets $433.00 Nekoosa $24.41 5000 $122.05 | group Xerox [ $54.97 5000 $274.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8Y4x11 Mead 3-part black image carbonless reverse 5010/167 TST Impreso,
35 _[collated Nekoosa NCR|  $97.30 0 sets $487.96 Nekoosa $27.49 5000 $137.45 Staples $81.81 1100 $89.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8%2x11 Mead 4-part black image carbonless reverse 5000/125 TST Impreso,
36 |collated Nekoosa NCR|  $104.10 0 sets $520.50 Nekoosa $29.38 5000 $146.92 Staples $120.99 800 $96.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8%ax11 Mead 5-part black image carbonless reverse 5000/100
37 |collated Nekoosa NCR|  $107.05 0 sets $535.25 Nekoosa $54.00 5000 $270.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8Y2x14 Mead 2-part black image carbonless reverse 5000/250 Lindenmeyr
38 |collated Nekoosa NCR| — $110.10 0 sets $550.50 Nekoosa $30.80 5000 $154.00 Munroe $294.64 2500 $736.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8Y2x14 Mead 3-part black image carbonless reverse 5010/167
39 |collated Nekoosa NCR| — $123.65 0 sets $620.10 Nekoosa $62.00 5000 $310.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8Y2x14 Mead 4-part black image carbonless reverse 5000/125
40 |collated Nekoosa NCR|  $132.30 0 sets $661.50 Nekoosa $66.40 5000 $332.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




8Y5x14 Mead 5-part black image carbonless reverse

5000/100

41 |collated Nekoosa NCR|  $136.35 0 sets $681.75 Nekoosa $77.35 5000 $386.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
. Lindenmeyr Munroe ‘Western BRW Paper Staples Red Buffalo Transportation
V. Specialty Paper v P P P
Manufacturer  [Unit Price Per  [Sheets per [Unit Price  |Manufacturer [Unit Price  [Sheets per |Unit Price  fManuf: er |Unit Price  [Sheets per |Unit Price ~ |Manuf: er Unit Price Per |Sheets per  |Unit Price Per
Item | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Case
Sylvamo $31.30 2500 | $7825 | Domtar Lynx| $27.00 2500 | se7.50 | LAndenmeyr | giug 08 250 | $37.27 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
42 [651b81/2 x 11 Lynx Digital Smooth cover white Accent Munroe Lynx
801b81/2 x 11 Cougar Digital Cover smooth Domar $52.25 2000 | 10450 | POME | 4503 2000 | $102.46 | LINGERMOYT | gig0 36 250 | $45.09 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
43 |Natural Cougar Cougar Munroe Lynx
Lindenmeyr . . . . .
Domtar Lynx $38.75 2000 $77.50 | Domtar Lynx | $33.62 2000 $67.04 $161.96 250 $40.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 [801b8 1/2 x 11 Lynx Digital Smooth Cover white Munroe Lynx
Neenah exact $74.45 2000 $148.90 | Neenah Exact| $44.95 2000 $89.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 [671b 8 1/2 x 14 Exact vellum Bristol White
Lindenmeyr . . . . .
Domtar Lynx [~ $18.20 4000 $72.80 | Domtar Lynx | $15.72 4000 $62.88 $49.87 4000 $199.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
46 |70 1b 8 1/2 x 11 Lynx Digital Smooth text white Munroe Lynx
Billerud Verso| ~ $45.30 1500 | seros | SR gay g 2000 | $68.34 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
47 |Blazer Digital Gloss text white 11x17- 80-31M-L Gloss text
Neenah Neenah Neenah Paper
48 [8%2x11 Astro Bright Text, 60T astrobrights $31.70 5000 $158.50 | astrobright $22.70 5000 $113.50 | Astrobrights $19.90 500 $9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Neenah Neenah Neenah Paper
49 |8%x11 Astro Bright Cover, 65C astrobrights $62.70 2000 $125.40 Astrobright $45.10 2000 $90.20 Astrobrights $56.72 250 $14.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
. Lindenmeyr Munroe ‘Western BRW Paper Staples Red Buffalo Transportation
VI. Miscellaneous Y P p! P
Manufacturer | Unit Price Per |Sheets per |Unit Price  |Manufacturer |Unit Price  |Sheets per  [Unit Price  fManufacturer  |Unit Price  [Sheets per  |Unit Price  fManufacturer | Unit Price Per [Sheets per |Unit Price Per
Ttem | Description & Brand M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand Per M case Per Case & Brand M case Case
Total roll $40.60 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Box partners 1 $64.29 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
50 |30" Brown Craft paper roll products
Total roll | $46.45 roll $47.00 Danco 1 $61.29 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
51 [36" Brown Craft paper roll products Packaging
NCR Paper Brand Fanaprt high strength padding - |Nekgosa NCR| $216.80ea | 4/Ctn | $867.20 | Nekoosa ea | $17500 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
52 |adhesive-gallon
NCR Paper Brand Fanaprt high strength padding - Nekgosa NCR|  $107.75ea | 16/ctn | $1,149.60 | Nekoosa ca $56.95 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
53 |adhesive-quart
e X HAR $33.60ea 4/ctn $134.40 HAR ea $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54 [Liquid padding Compound- gallon
Amtopp $80.90 4/ctn $80.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid |Staples Brands 4 $96.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 |18" stretch film- roll
GBC Heatseal Ultima 65 25" standard roll No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
56_|lamination film 3 mil
GBC Heatseal Ultima 65 25" standard roll No Bid NoBid | NoBid [ NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
57 |lamination film 1.5 mil
Lo No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Staples 50 $3.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 [8.9" x 11.4" laminating pouches
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Fellowes 50 $15.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
59 19 1/8" x 14 1/2" laminating pouches
. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Staples 25 $4.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60 |11.4" x 17.4" laminating pouches




Lindenmeyr Munroe
9565 West Wingfoot
Houston TX 77041

attn: Eva Pillow

epillow @lindenmeyr.com
ph: 713-868-1531

‘Western-BRW Paper Co.

10425 Okanella #600

Houston TX 77041

attn: Joseph T. Jordan
jtjordan@ovol.us

ph: 713-460-5060 fx: 713-460-2037

Staples Contract and Commercial LLC
500 Staples Dr.

Framingham, MA 01702

attn: Teresa Votaw

Teresa.Votaw @Staples.com

ph: 720-744-1272

Red Buffalo Transporttion

2828 Hayes Rd #2011

Houston TX 77082

attn: Kirby Avila
redbuffalotransportation@gmail.com
ph: 413-309-7375

Jefferson County makes no claim that this bid tabulation represents anything other than the information read aloud at the public opening. The
County has not checked the bids for errors, or made any determinations that the solicitations meet all requirements.
In the case of a discrepancy between information on this tabulation and the original hard-copy document, the original hard copy shall prevail.



