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FINAL TABULATION

Item No.1 Mustang CAT Model 120 M2 Motor Grader or Equivalent
Trade In: 1998 Champion Motor Grader Model 710 A

AWARDED: |
Associated Supply Company IBeaumont Tractor Co. Doggett Heavy Machinery Mustang CAT R.B. Everett & Company ROMCO Equipment Co. Shoppa's Farm Supply
|(ASCO) 4430 College St. 9111 North Freeway 7990 Eastex Freeway PO Box 7300 8450 Breen Rd. 9135 College St.
5980 S. MLK Jr. Parkway Beaumont, TX 77707 Houston, TX 77037 Beaumont, TX 77708 Pasadena, TX 77508 Houston, TX 77064 Beaumont, TX
Beaumont, TX 77705 Contact Person: Kyle Lee Contact Person: Patrick Nickerson |Contact Person: Stevan de Leon Contact Person: Dean Henderson Contact Person: Bryan Cannon Contact Person: Thomas Hulon
Contact Person: Jamie Winkler Jkyle @beaumonttractor.com patrick.nickerson @doggett.com sdeleon @mustangcat.com dhenderson @rbeverett.com bcannon@romco.com thulon @shoppas.com
jwinkler @ascoeq.com 409-866-3360 phone 713-679-6700 phone 409-201-9500 phone 281-991-8161 phone 713-492-6619 phone 409-842-1128 phone
281-627-1714 phone 409-790-5348 alt. phone 713-674-0305 fax 281-991-5967 alt. phone 713-937-3005 alt. phone 979-253-4889 alt. phone
409-866-5884 fax 713-937-7541 fax 409-842-6216 fax

Bid Price $223,182.00 NO BID $232,900.00 $247,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Trade-In Value $6,000.00 $13,000.00 $5,000.00

Total Bid Price

(Minus Trade-In Value) $217,182.00 $219,900.00 $242,500.00

Projected Delivery Lead Time

from Date of Purchase 4 weeks Not Included in Bid 1-2 weeks (subject to availability)

Equivalent Item Description CASE 885B John Deere 620G Model per bid specs

Item No.2 BOMAG Model BW11RH-5 Pneumatic Roller or Equivalent
Trade In: Dynpac CP142 (SN: 1000-500C0B000882)

JAWARDED: |
ASCO Beaumont Tractor Co. Doggett Heavy Machinery Mustang CAT |R.B. Everett & Company Jromco Equipment Co. Shoppa's Farm Supply
Bid Price $91,673.00 NO BID NO BID $79,000.00 $83,368.00 $100,810.00 NO BID
Trade-In Value $5,000.00 $3,500.00 $5,250.00 $5,000.00

Total Bid Price

!Minus Trade-In Valuel $86,673.00 $75,500.00 $78,118.00 $95,810.00

Projected Delivery Lead Time
from Date of Purchase 4-6 weeks 16 weeks (subject to award) 1 week 14 weeks

Equivalent Item Description Rosco Tru-Pac 915 B Caterpillar CW16 Model per bid specs JLeeboy PTC-15B

Item No.3 BOMAG Model BW161AD-5 Vibratory Tandem Roller or Equivalent
Trade In: CAT CB534-C (SN: 5HN00552)

|AWARDED: |

ASCO Beaumont Tractor Co. Doggett Heavy Machinery Mustang CAT |R.B. Everett & Company Jromco Equipment Co. Shoppa's Farm Supply
Bid Price $119,853.00 NO BID $146,200.00 NO BID $119,798.00 $116,312.00 NO BID
Trade-In Value $4,000.00 $6,500.00 $1,250.00 $0.00
Total Bid Price
(Minus Trade-In Value) $115,853.00 $139,700.00 $118,548.00 $116,312.00
Projected Delivery Lead Time
from Date of Purchase 4 weeks Not Included in Bid 1 week 8 weeks
Equivalent Item Description CASE DV209D HF Dynapac CC4200VI Model per bid specs Volvo DD105C
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Item No. 4 BOMAG Model BW211PD-5 84" Single Drum Padfoot Roller or Equivalent
Trade In: BOMAG BW213DH-40 (SN: 901582561088)
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AWARDED: |
ASCO IBeaumont Tractor Co. Doggett Heavy Machinery Mustang CAT R.B. Everett & Company ROMCO Equipment Co. Shoppa's Farm Supply
Bid Price $110,000.00 NO BID $149,400.00 NO BID NO BID $123,838.00 NO BID
Trade-In Value $11,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00
Total Bid Price
sMinus Trade-In Valuel $99,000.00 $145,400.00 $118,838.00
Projected Delivery Lead Time
from Date of Purchase 6 weeks Not Included in Bid 8 weeks
Equivalent Item Description CASE SV212 Dynapac CA-3500-PD Volvo SD115BF

Item No. 5 John Deere 5065E Utility Tractor OOS 4WD or Equivalent
Trade In: Ford 5000 Tractor

|AWARDED: |

ASCO IBeaumont Tractor Co. |Doggett Heavy Machinery Mustang CAT R.B. Everett & Company ROMCO Equipment Co. Shoppa's Farm Supply
Bid Price NO BID $30,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30,923.63
Trade-In Value $1,500.00 $1,000.00
Total Bid Price
(Minus Trade-In Value) $28,700.00 $29,923.63
Projected Delivery Lead Time
from Date of Purchase 3 weeks 2 weeks
Equivalent Item Description Kubota M7060 HD12 Model per bid specs




