Final Tabulation
IFB 19-030/YS

Term Contract for inmate Clothing and Supplies for Jefferson County

Bob Barker
Acme Supply Company, Green
Co. Ltd. (* see | Inc. (* see Carolina Mountain ICS Jail Supplies,
ltem Size notes below) | note below) Textiles Charm-Tex Goaltex Knitting Inc. Victory Supply, Inc.
1
Inmate Coveralls XS $12.00 $11.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
Yellow (each) S $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
M $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
L $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
IXL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
2XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $20.50 $13.40 NO BID
3XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $14.36 NO BID $20.50 $14.60 NO BID
4XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $14.72 NO BID $23.40 $16.63 NO BID
5XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $15.54 NO BID $23.40 $17.38 NO BID
6XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $15.90 NO BID $25.80 $17.38 NO BID
7XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $16.18 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
8XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $16.72 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
9XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $17.18 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
10XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $17.54 NO BID $31.00 $17.38 NO BID
11XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $17.90 NO BID $31.00 $17.38 NO BID
12XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $18.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID
13XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $19.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID
14XL $12.00 $18.90 NO BID $20.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID
15XL $12.00 $20.00 NO BID $21.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID
Navy Blue (each) XS $12.00 $11.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
S $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
M $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID




L $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
IXL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
2XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $20.50 $13.40 NO BID
3XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $14.36 NO BID $20.50 $14.60 NO BID
4XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $14.72 NO BID $23.40 $16.63 NO BID
5XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $15.54 NO BID $23.40 $17.38 NO BID
6XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $15.90 NO BID $25.80 $17.38 NO BID
7XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $16.18 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
8XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $16.72 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
9XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $17.18 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
10XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $17.54 NO BID $31.00 $17.38 NO BID
11XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $17.90 NO BID $31.00 $17.38 NO BID
12XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $18.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID
13XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $19.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID
14XL $12.00 $18.90 NO BID $20.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID
15XL $12.00 $20.00 NO BID $21.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID
Orange (each) XS $12.00 $11.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
S $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
M $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
L $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
IXL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
2XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $20.50 $13.40 NO BID
3XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $14.36 NO BID $20.50 $14.60 NO BID
4xL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $14.72 NO BID $23.40 $16.63 NO BID
5XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $15.54 NO BID $23.40 $17.38 NO BID
6XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $15.90 NO BID $25.80 $17.38 NO BID
7XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $16.18 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
8XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $16.72 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
9XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $17.18 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID
10XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $17.54 NO BID $31.00 $17.38 NO BID
11XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $17.90 NO BID $31.00 $17.38 NO BID




12XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $18.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID

13XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $19.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID

14XL $12.00 $18.90 NO BID $20.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID

15XL $12.00 $20.00 NO BID $21.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID

Red (each) XS $12.00 $11.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID
S $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID

M $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID

L $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID

XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID

1XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $16.25 $13.40 NO BID

2XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $13.90 NO BID $20.50 $13.40 NO BID

3XL $12.00 $11.89 NO BID $14.36 NO BID $20.50 $14.60 NO BID

axL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $14.72 NO BID $23.40 $16.63 NO BID

5XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $15.54 NO BID $23.40 $17.38 NO BID

6XL $12.00 $12.75 NO BID $15.90 NO BID $25.80 $17.38 NO BID

7XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $16.18 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID

8XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $16.72 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID

9XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $17.18 NO BID $28.00 $17.38 NO BID

10XL $12.00 $14.75 NO BID $17.54 NO BID $31.00 $17.38 NO BID

11XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $17.90 NO BID $31.00 $17.38 NO BID

12XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $18.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID

13XL $12.00 $17.75 NO BID $19.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID

14XL $12.00 $18.90 NO BID $20.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID

15XL $12.00 $20.00 NO BID $21.90 NO BID $31.00 $18.96 NO BID

2 XS $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.50 $23.96 NO BID
Inmate Jackets - unlined S $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.50 $23.96 NO BID
(each) M $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.50 $23.96 NO BID
L $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.50 $23.96 NO BID

XL $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.50 $23.96 NO BID

1XL $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.50 $23.96 NO BID

2XL $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.50 $23.96 NO BID

3XL $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.00 $23.96 NO BID




4xL $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.50 $25.13 NO BID

5XL $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.50 $26.31 NO BID

6XL $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.50 $27.49 NO BID

3 S $14.00 $17.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID 13.00 $29.84 $13.94

Inmate Jackets - lined S $14.00 $17.85 NO BID $14.90 NO BID 13.00 $29.84 $13.94
(each) M $14.00 $17.85 NO BID $14.90 NO BID 13.00 $29.84 $13.94
L $14.00 $17.85 NO BID $14.90 NO BID 13.00 $29.84 $13.94

XL $14.00 $17.85 NO BID $14.90 NO BID 13.00 $29.84 $13.94

1XL $14.00 $17.85 NO BID $14.90 NO BID 13.00 $29.84 $13.94

2XL $14.00 $17.85 NO BID $15.54 NO BID 13.00 $29.84 $13.94

3XL $14.00 $17.85 NO BID $15.90 NO BID 14.00 $29.84 $13.94

4XL $14.00 $17.85 NO BID $16.54 NO BID 14.50 $31.02 $13.94

5XL $14.00 $18.85 NO BID $16.90 NO BID 14.50 $31.02 $13.94

6XL $14.00 $18.85 NO BID $17.54 NO BID 14.50 $32.09 $13.94

4 5 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

Deck Shoe w/Toecap Navy [6 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74
Blue (pair) 7 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID §7.10 $4.74
8 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

9 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

10 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

11 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

12 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

13 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

14 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

15 NO BID $4.91 NO BID $4.72 $5.68 NO BID $7.10 $4.74

5 S NO BID $6.79 $5.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.14 $5.24

Night Shirt - Female (each) |m NO BID $6.79 $5.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.14 $5.24
L NO BID $6.79 $5.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.14 $5.24




1X NO BID $6.79 $5.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.14 $5.24
2X NO BID $6.79 $5.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.23 $5.24
3X NO BID $6.79 $5.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.38 $6.49
4X NO BID $6.79 $5.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.54 $6.49
5X NO BID $6.79 $5.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.70 $6.49
6X NO BID $6.79 $5.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.86 $6.49
6 30"x75"x4"
Mattress (each) | NO BID $35.98 NO BID $41.90 NO BID NO BID $37.00 NO BID
7 30"x75"x4"
Mattress Cover (each) NO BID $13.89 NO BID $12.90 NO BID NO BID $9.83 NO BID
8 30"75"x6"
Mattress Cover Heavy
Weight Twill (each) NO BID $8.15 NO BID $5.54 NO BID NO BID $7.80 $4.83
9 66"x90"
Inmate Blanket (each) $4.95 $7.49 $8.34 $6.36 NO BID NO BID $6.35 $5.24
10 30"x40"
Inmate Bath Towel (doz) $9.62 $17.29 $14.91 $10.90 NO BID NO BID $12.80 $9.74
11 18"x30"
$2.4142/each
Laundry Bag (each) NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.97 NO BID NO BID $2.65 ($28.97/doz)
12 18"x24"
Laundry Bag Mesh (each) NO BID $1.54 $2.56 $1.66 NO BID NO BID $2.15 $2.00
*Please note that Acme is bidding jumpsuits as ALL OR NONE, whole group
*Please note that Acme is bidding inmate jackets (unlined) as ALL OR NONE, whole group
*Please note that Acme is bidding inmate jackets (lined) as ALL OR NONE, whole group
*Bob Barker sells laundry bag (mesh) per dozen.
Acme Supply Co., LTD Bob Barker Company Carolina Textiles Charm-Tex
10 Cedar Swamp Road, Suite 7 7925 Purfoy Road PO Box 11211 1618 Coney Island Avenue
Glen Cove NY 11542 Fuquay Varina NC 27526 Charlotte NC 28220 Brooklyn NY 11230

attn: Zaheer Sheik attn: Melody Ballard attn: Bob Jones

attn: Stan Danzger




bn@acmesupply.us
ph: 800-567-8025
fx: 800-567-8026

Goaltex Corp

146 Split Roack Road
Syosset NY 11791
attn: Robert Grubman
robert@goaltex.com
ph: 516-682-5775

fx: 516-682-5718

melodyballard@bobbarker.com

ph: 919-753-1614
fx: 800-322-7537

Green Mountain Knitting
28 Industrial Drive
Milton VT 05468

attn: Danny Morel
dmorel@calkogroup.com
ph: 800-361-1190

fx: 514-495-1629

carolinatextiles@netzero.com

ph: 704-525-1272
fx: 704-525-0607

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.
PO Box 21056

Waco TX 76702
attn: Lacy Key
bids@icswaco.com
ph: 800-524-5427
fx: 254-751-0299

stan@charm-tex.com
ph: 718-252-8100
fx: 718-258-8303

Victory Supply LLC

7025 Industrial Park Road
Mount Pleasant TN 38474
attn: Mariah Macham
mariah@victorysupplyinc.com
ph: 888-376-1205 ext 716

fx: 931-325-5521
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