JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Deborah L. Clark, County Purchasing Agent

IFB 24-038/CG
Term Contract for Paper Stock and Envelopes for Jefferson County

Awarded: September 17, 2024

1149 Pearl Street, Beaumont, TX 77701 409-835-8593 Fax 409-835-8456

CURRENT PRICING
Renewal 1: 9/16/2025—9/15/2026
updated 10/14/2025
I. Paper Stock
e Manufacturer | Unit Price Per Sheets Unit Price
Item Description & Brand M per case Per Case Vendor
1 20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white Suzan Report $6.85 5000 $34.25 Western BRW
8%x11, Paper grade: Premium #4 Paper dba
Ovol USA
2 20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white Domtar $10.10 5000 $50.50 Western BRW
8%x11, 3-hole punched — Lettermark Paper dba
Paper grade: Premium #4 Ovol USA
3 20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white Domtar $12.79 5000 $63.96 Western BRW
8%:x14, Paper grade: Premium #4 Lettermark Paper dba
Ovol USA
4 20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, white Domtar $20.30 2500 $50.75 Western BRW
11x17, Paper grade: Premium #4 Lettermark Paper dba
Ovol USA
5 20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors Domtar $12.82 5000 $64140 Western BRW
(peach, orchid, cherry, ivory, grey), Lettermark $13.47 $67.35 Paper dba
8%x11 — ream wrap only (combined Ovol USA
total), Paper grade: Premium #4
6 20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors Sylvamo $21.05 5000 $1405.25 | Lindenmeyr
(peaeh, orchid, eherny-ivory—grey), Hammermill $20.50 $102.50 | Munroe
8%:x14 — ream wrap only (combined
total), Paper grade: Premium #4 Ivory/grey 24# Ivory/grey
(Ivory/grey available in 24#)>>>>>>>> $24.55 $122.75
7 20 Ib. Bond Paper, colors (buff, Domtar $12.82 5000 $64-10 Western BRW
salmon, goldenrod, pink, blue, canary, Lettermark $13.47 $67.35 Paper dba
green), 8%x11 Ovol USA
8 20 Ib. Bond Paper, long grain, colors Domtar $17.54 5000 $87.70 Western BRW
(ivory, goldenrod, pink, blue, canary, Lettermark $18.45 $92.25 Paper dba
green), 8%x14 Ovol USA
9 20 Ib. Bond Paper, 25% rag, long Neenah Royal $50.85 4000 $203.40 | Lindenmeyr
grain, cockle finish, white, 8%2x11. Cotton $51.35 $256.75 | Munroe
Paper grade: #1
Atlas Bond imaging 25%
10 | 20 Ib. Bond Paper, 25% rag, long No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

grain, cockle finish, white, 8/2x14.
Paper grade: #1




Il. Card Stock

Unit Unit
Item Description Mantgerl::érer & Price Per z‘:i(:t:e Price Per Vendor
M P Case
11 67 Ib. Vellum cover stock (white) 8%x11, | Domtar Lettermark $25.04 2000 $50.09 | Western BRW
shrink wrap acceptable (combined total). $26.295 $52.59 | Paper dba
Paper grade: #4 Ovol USA
12 67 Ib. Vellum cover stock (aqua, green, Domtar Lettermark $25.08 2000 $54.98 Western BRW
gold, blue, pink, ivory, yellow, grey) $27.305 $54.61 Paper dba
8%:x11, shrink wrap acceptable (com- Ovol USA
bined total). Paper grade: #4
13 20 Ib. #1 White Sulfite, long grain white, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8%2x11 Hammermill.
Paper grade: Grade 1 watermark
14 Brite Hue — 60 Ib. text & cover 8%2x11 Neenah $22.70 5000 $113.50 | Western BRW
(red, violet, green, orange, ultra fuchsia) Astrobrights $23.96 $119.80 | Paper dba
Ovol USA
15 #80 8%:x11 Classic Crest Avon Brilliant Neenah Classic $422.00 2000 $245.80 | Lindenmeyr
White Crest $128.60 $257.20 | Munroe
16 #80 8%x11 Classic Crest Avon Ivory Neenah Classic $424.20 2000 $248-40 | Lindenmeyr
Crest $128.60 $257.20 | Munroe
17 Olmsted-Kirk International-Paper $63.96 250 $15.99 Staples
80 Ib, Starwhite Smooth Text Archiva, Hammermill Gen#aet—&
814x11 Commercial

LHC




Il. Envelopes

s Manufacturer & Unit Price Sheets Unit Price
Item Description Brand Per M per case Per Case Vendor
18 24 Ib. catalog envelopes 10"x13” Lindenmeyr $123.55 500 $61.77 Lindenmeyr
white woven Envelope $123.25 $61.62 Munroe
19 28 Ib. white catalog envelopes Cenevo $96.00 500 $48.00 Western BRW
9"x12” Paper dba
Ovol USA
20 15"x10” brown kraft gummed flap Staples $474-50 4100 $1715 Staples &G
document envelopes 32#
21 #9 window envelopes — Staples $33.36 500 $16.68 Staples C&C
24 Ib. white wove 2500 $105.88* Western BRW
Call for Paper dba
current pricing | Ovol USA
22 #9 regular envelopes — Cenevo $13.34 2500 $66.70 Western BRW
24 Ib. white wove Paper dba
Ovol USA
23 #10 window envelopes — Cenevo $15.32 2500 $76.60 Western BRW
24 Ib. white wove (hard boxes) Paper dba
Ovol USA
24 #10 regular envelopes — Cenevo $13.34 2500 $66.70 Western BRW
24 Ib. white wove (hard boxes) Paper dba
Ovol USA
25 #11 window envelopes — Cenevo $79.95 2500 $199.87 Lindenmeyr
28 Ib. white wove Printmaster $83.05 $207.63 Munroe
26 #11 regular envelopes — Staples $49.98 500 $24.99 Staples C&C
28 Ib. white wove Printmaster $76.50 2500 $191.25 Lindenmeyr
Munroe
27 #12 window envelopes — No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 Ib. white wove
28 #12 regular envelopes — Cenevo $88:45 2500 $224143 Lindenmeyr
24 |b. white wove Printmaster $92.90 $232.25 Munroe
29 #10 brown kraft envelopes — Esselte-America $89.98 500 $44.99 Staples
28 Ib. Quality-Park Contract-&
Commercial
LG
30 #12 brown kraft envelopes — $59.08 500 $29.99 Staples-C&C
28 Ib. Printmaster $137.95 2500 $344.87 Lindenmeyr
Munroe
31 #14 brown kraft envelopes — Esselte-America $89.98 500 $44.99 Staples
28 Ib. Quality Park Centract-&
Commereial
LLC
32 Opaque envelopes - 4%:x9 (blue, Sylvamo $48.70 2500 $124.75 Lindenmeyr
green, natural, cream, gold, pink, Hammermill $51.25 $128.13 Munroe
gray, ivory, yellow)
33 Hammermill Offset 60T #10 Sylvamo $48.70 2500 $124.75 Lindenmeyr
Canary Hammermill $51.25 $128.13 Munroe




IV. No Carbon Required Paper

Unit . .
ltem Description Manufacturer & Price Sheets Unit Price Vendor
Brand Per M per case | Per Case
34 8'2x11 2-part black image Nekoosa $24.44 5000 $1422.05 | Western BRW Paper
carbonless reverse collated $25.64 $128.20 dba Ovol USA
35 8'2x11 Mead 3-part black image Nekoosa $27.49 5000 $1437.45 | Western BRW Paper
carbonless reverse collated $28.87 $144.35 dba Ovol USA
36 8'2x11 Mead 4-part black image Nekoosa $29.38 5000 $146.92 | Western BRW Paper
carbonless reverse collated $30.85 $154.25 dba Ovol USA
37 82x11 Mead 5-part black image Nekoosa $54.00 5000 $270.00 | Western BRW Paper
carbonless reverse collated $56.70 $283.50 dba Ovol USA
38 8'2x14 Mead 2-part black image Nekoosa $30-80 5000 $154.00 | Western BRW Paper
carbonless reverse collated $32.34 $161.70 dba Ovol USA
39 8%:x14 Mead 3-part black image Nekoosa $62.00 5000 $3140.00 | Western BRW Paper
carbonless reverse collated $65.10 $325.50 dba Ovol USA
40 8%:x14 Mead 4-part black image Nekoosa $66.40 5000 $332.00 | Western BRW Paper
carbonless reverse collated $69.72 $348.60 dba Ovol USA
41 8'2x14 Mead 5-part black image Nekoosa $7735 5000 $386.75 | Western BRW Paper
carbonless reverse collated $81.216 $406.08 dba Ovol USA
V. Specialty Paper
Manufacturer & Unit Sheets Unit Price
Item Description Price Vendor
Brand Per M per case Per Case
42 | 651b 8 % x11 Lynx Digital Domtar Lynx $27.00 2500 $67.50 Western BRW Paper
Smooth cover white $28.32 $70.80 dba Ovol USA
43 | 801b 8 % x 11 Cougar Digital Domtar Cougar $54.23 2000 $102.46 Western BRW Paper
Cover Smooth Natural $53.79 $107.58 dba Ovol USA
44 | 801b 8% x 11 Lynx Digital Domtar Lynx $33-62 2000 $67-04 Western BRW Paper
Smooth Cover White $35.20 $70.40 dba Ovol USA
45 | 67 1b 8 %5 x 14 Exact Vellum Neenah Exact $44.95 2000 $89.90 Western BRW Paper
Bristol White $47.24 $94.48 dba Ovol USA
46 70 1b 8 %2 x 11 Lynx Digital Domtar Lynx $15.72 4000 $62.88 Western BRW Paper
Smooth Text White $16.505 $66.02 dba Ovol USA
47 Blazer Digital Gloss Text White Sappi Flo Gloss $34.17 2000 $68.34 Western BRW Paper
11 x 17 -80-31M-L Text dba Ovol USA
48 8%:x11 Astro Bright Text, 60T Neenah $19.90 500 $9.95 Staples G-&C
Astrobrights $22.70 5000 $113.50 Western BRW Paper
dba Ovol USA
49 8%:x11 Astro Bright Cover, 65C Neenah $4510 2000 $90.20 Western BRW Paper
Astrobrights $47.46 $94.92 dba Ovol USA




VI. Miscellaneous

vy Manufacturer & Sheets o
Item Description Brand per case Unit Price Vendor
50 30” Brown Craft Paper roll Total Products roll $40.60 Lindenmeyr
Munroe
51 36” Brown Craft Paper roll Total Products roll $46.45 Lindenmeyr
$49.25 Munroe
52 NCR Paper Brand Fanapart high Nekoosa each $1475.00 Western BRW
strength padding adhesive gallon $183.75 Paper dba
Ovol USA
53 NCR Paper Brand Fanapart high Nekoosa each $56.95 Western BRW
strength padding adhesive quart $59.79 Paper dba
Ovol USA
54 Liquid Padding Compound- HAR each $25.00 Western BRW
gallon $26.25 Paper dba
Ovol USA
55 18” stretch film roll Amtopp 4/ctn $80.90 Lindenmeyr
$68.00 Munroe
56 GBC Heatseal Ultima 65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25” standard roll lamination film
3 mil
57 GBC Heatseal Ultima 65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25” standard roll lamination film
1.5 mil
58 8.9” x 11.4” laminating pouches Staples 50 $3.45 Staples
GContract-&
Commercial
LG
59 91/8” x 14 2" laminating Eellowes 50 $4547 Staples
pouches Contract-&
Commereial
LLC
60 11.4” x 17.4” laminating pouches Staples 25 $4.84 Staples
GContract-&
Commereial
LLC
Lindenmeyr Munroe Western-BRW Paper Co. dba Ovol USA Staples-Contractand-Commercial- EEC
9565 West Wingfoot 10425 Okanella #600 500-StaplesDr-
Houston TX 77041 Houston TX 77041 Framingham; MA—01702
attn: Eva Pillow attn: Joseph T. Jordan attn—Feresa-Votaw
epillow @lindenmeyr.com jtjordan@ovol.us Feresa-Votaw@Staples-com
ph: 713-868-1531 ph: 713-460-5060 fx: 713-460-2037 ph—720-744-1272




